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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.;

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PAREF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Oct 2019

Singapore NRIC
544H

SLC323K

No

30 0Oct 2019

NISSAN

QASHQAI+2 2.0 SMT ABS D/AB SR 7EAT
Grey

2010

MR20995931A
SINJBNJ10U7024380
102.0 kW (136 bhp)
$26,607.00

30Sep 2010

30Sep 2010

2

$26,607.00

Yes
29 Sep 2020
$13,303.00

29 Sep 2020

E - Open Category
10

$43,565.00
$3,931.00
$17,234.00

OK



Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Monday, 4 November, 2019 9:12 AM

service@kkimhin.com.sg; 'sur@lkkauto.com'; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
'Sandra (Gmail)'; Zuhaidah Samsuri

RE: Accident involving SLC 323 K and SHA 2191 T on 27/10/19
GlAreport 323.pdf

P Stwlr

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLC323K and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Ms Aida.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

[NDIA
INTERNATIONAL

[NsuraNCE
SINGATP ORE
Serving the region xince 1967

64 Cecil Street; #05 - |10B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

e

T. 24w
Ve, Iy
C .y

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:service@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: 01 November, 2019 2:44 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: 'Sandra (Gmail)' <sandrakhong@gmail.com>; service@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: RE: Accident involving SLC 323 K and SHA 2191 T on 27/10/19

Thank you.
Please kindly appoint LKK.

Thanks & Regards
Sandra

6452 7018

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From: Motor Claim - III [mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, November 1, 2019 11:41 AM

To: service@kkimhin.com.sg
Cc: Sandra (Gmail)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLC 323 K and SHA 2191 T on 27/10/19



Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
e Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

[ND1A
| INTERNATIONAL

7 Insurance
Fiiog S1NGADPM ORE
3 Sreving the reglon since 1987

64 Cecil Street; #05 - |0B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: service [mailto:service@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: 31 October, 2019 6:42 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; Sandra (Gmail) <sandrakhong@gmail.com>
Subject: Accident involving SLC 323 K and SHA 2191 Ton 27/10/19

Your Ref: SHA 2191 T (llI)
Our Ref: SLC 323 K

Dear Officer

Good day to you.

Enclosed the GIA report SLC 323 K who was hit by SHA 2191 T on 27 Oct 2019.

Vehicle is in the workshop.

Please arrange for survey as tomorrow is Friday (1 Nov). Kindly let us know the liability as well.

Many thanks,

Sandra

6452 7018

9622 2116

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

2



If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



3/25/2020 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLC323K (MCT19100646)
[SHA2191T]
TP
LIM CHIN LUM
Oct 27 2019 2:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
K Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 22/01/2020 09:54 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Revoked - SLC323K - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

Revoked:Please close file as we have received TP BOLA claim from AXA.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=69133999& CFTOKEN=df37162d1d5592ad-97... 1/1
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