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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 18 November, 2019 11:58 AM

To: David Ang

Cc: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto); assignments; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 01/11/19, INVOLVING CLIENT'S : SJW 3611 C & SLW 304 K 

(AIG INSURED) ALONG NEW LOYANG LINK TO OLD TAMPINES RD ***LKK 

REF:CC6/AIG19019428/Uhb3 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear David, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to 

the BOLA guideline settlement. 

 

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 

your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the 

consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the 

number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 4 November, 2019 3:36 PM 

To: David Ang 

Cc: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto); assignments; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A 

Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 01/11/19, INVOLVING CLIENT'S : SJW 3611 C & SLW 304 K (AIG INSURED) ALONG 

NEW LOYANG LINK TO OLD TAMPINES RD ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG19019428/Uhb3  

 

Dear David, 

 

We refer to the below email. 

 

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report. 
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

Thank you 

 

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 2:37 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 01/11/19, INVOLVING CLIENT'S : SJW 3611 C & SLW 304 K (AIG INSURED) ALONG NEW 

LOYANG LINK TO OLD TAMPINES RD 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search fee, Client's GIA report, insurance certificate & 

log card for your reference & attention, 

  

Kindly revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, as we are looking for direct 

settlement, 

 

For your info, We had assign your in-house surveyor (Mr Marcus Chua) to survey client's damage 

vehicle, Please let us hear form yours soonest, 

 
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 

Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  
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