Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 July 2020 11:10 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Jason

Cc: Lina Pang; Admin A

Subject: RE: MY REF : GBD 1851J (LONPAC) DOA :04.11.2019 YOUR REF : YP 5043M (EQ) ***

LKK REF: CC6/EQI19019425/Ugb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Cecilia,

We are pleased to accept your offer of $7,400.00 (all-in) for my client’ s vehicle property claim.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Shiying

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50
Autobay Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any)
of the owner/ claimant.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@]lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 8:28 AM

To: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>; Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cec: Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MY REF : GBD 1851J (LONPAC) DOA : 04.11.2019 YOUR REF : YP 5043M (EQ) *** LKK
REF: CC6/EQI19019425/Ugb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shi Ying,

We are pleased to re-offer G/S $7400.00 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of
the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this
offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.
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