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~ Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd s
A R C €O. Reg. No. : 201312913C Estimate
GST Reg. No. : 201312913C
38 Woodiands Industrial Park E1 ESTIMATE NO. :  EST1910-127
#05-18, Singapore 757700 DATE:  29-Oct-2019
Tel: 64688834 Fax: 64622278 POLICY NO. :  PNPV2019-00009866
E-mait: info@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg VEHICLE REG. NO. :  SMA3202E
VEHICLE MAKE :  SUBARU FORESTER-2.0 1-L CVT AWD SR ¢,
TO  Motor Claim Department FOR SURVEYOR )
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd V T !
3 Anson Road, #15-00 Springleat Tower '
Singapore 079909 :
Tel: 6389 6116, Fax: 6222 1033 i :
ESTIMATE REPAIR COST
NO. DESCRIPTION ' QUARTITY UNIT COST TOTAL COST
SPARE PARTS .
1 Rear Bumpey X R 1 S 780.00 | S 780.00
2 Rear Bumper Ciip W Sve 10 $ 500(% $0.00
3 | Rear Bumper Retainer RH D Sv¢ 1 S 2000 $ 20.00
4 Rear Bumper Retainer LH X Sve t S 2000|$ 20.00
H Rear Bumper Bracket Corner RH - % {\/¢ 1 S 30.00 | § 30.00
[ Rear Bumper Bracket Corner LH X Ve 1 S 3000 S 30.00
7 Rear Bumper Reflector RH % fvc 1 S 400019 40.00
8 Rear Bumper Reflector LH X §¥C 1 S 4000 S 40.00
Total Spare Parts| § 1,010.00
SPECIAL NETT N
9 | Reverse Sensor ™ Sve 1 5 200.00 | § 200.00
Total Special Nett| § 200.00
LABOUR
10 Spray painting Rear Bumper and Rear MC/W@ U‘"dev‘ bumper. 1 $ 500.00 | § 500.00 3(‘) o
11 | Remove, Replace and Repair Accident Affected Area 1 S 500.00 | § 500.00 | 26U
12 Apply Rust Proofing on Replaced/Repaired Panel 1 S 100001 $ 100.00
13 Remove and Refit Rear Reverse Sensor 1 s 8000} $ $0.00 §
14 | Check and Rectify Electrical Wiring 1 $ 30005 30.00 X
Estimate prepared by: Raymond Tan Total Labour | § 1,210.00
The above is an estimate based on our inspection and does not cover any additional Amount Befare Excess| § 2,420.00
parts or labour which may be required after work has been started. Occasionally, Add GST & 7% 169.40
worn or damaged parts are discovered which may not be evident on the first
inspection. Because of this, the above price are not guaranteed. Quatation on parts Total Amount Payable| § 2,589.40

and labour are current and subject to change.

Please arrange this vehicle to be surveyed soonest possible. Thank you.
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LKK Auto Consuyltants hence nolify

the Repairer of the following:

« To resurvey belorefalter spray painting

« To display damaged part(s) during resurvey

» Parts prices are subject to confirmation

o Third party survey is on @ “Without Prejudice” basis
* No ifiegal moditication(s) is alicwed

* Supplementary item!s) mus! be resurveyed and
15 subject to linal appioval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Swnature:
Date:




Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: ARC Ken <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 15 November, 2019 9:.04 AM

To: Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); ARC Raymond; ARC ShuJuan

Subject: RE: SMA3202E - TP Claim SJN2922J *** | KK REF: CC6/CTI19019423/ha3
Dear Sun Pin

We confirm the finalize amount at $500, (P/P repair, before gst). Repair day 1 days.
Thank you!

With best regards,
Ken Ng

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 November 2019 5:59 PM

To: kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: SMA3202E - TP Claim SIN2922) *** LKK REF: CC6/CT119019423/ha3

Dear Ken,

We confirm the finalize amount at $500, (P/P repair, before gst). Repair day 1 days.
If agree please reply ASAP.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pinj Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: ARC Ken [mailto:kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November, 2019 12:58 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: ARC Raymond; ARC Shuluan

Subject: SMA3202E - TP Claim SIN2922] *** | KK REF: CC6/CT119019423/ha3

Dear SunPin

Attached completion photos for finalisation (SMA3202E).
Can we close at $5007?

Thank you for your attention.

With best regards,
Ken Ng

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd



