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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 February 2020 2:55 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: Re: SLP9188G, Accident dated 26 October 2019

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 
I accept part by part amount of $10,285.99 and agreed 5 days repair work. 
 
Thank you. 
 

 

On Mon, 10 Feb 2020 at 10:31 AM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear William 

  

Confirmed amount $10,285.99 before excess $800 @ 5 working days. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 8 February 2020 6:19 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; 

William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: SLP9188G, Accident dated 26 October 2019 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 
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Please refer to attach documents. 

  

This is how I work up the amount for this vehicle. 

  

Please advised ? 

 

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link 

attachments: 

 

IMG_20200208_0001 

 

 

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent 

sending or receiving certain types of file attachments.  Check your e-mail 

security settings to determine how attachments are handled. 


