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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

—# e ]
From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, January 12, 2018 10:07 AM

To: 'chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value for SJJ8877M - Date of Accident: 08.01.2018

Dear Chin Kiat,

The market value for SJJ 8877M is $80k- $81k (EST) as at January 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 January, 2018 1:48 PM

To: Admin @ VAuUG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market Value for S1J8877M - Date of Accident: 08.01.2018

Hi all,
Can assist to check market value for $1J8787m?
Date of Accident: 08.01.2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com

-
<
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2016 Insurer Claims Team of the Year

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | Tel +65 62209644 | Fax
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Jatiice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, January 11, 2018 2:13 PM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Market Value for $JJ8877M - Date of Accident: 08.01.2018
Attachments: SJ)8877M.PDF; COE PARF - SJJ8877M.PDF

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 January, 2018 1:48 PM

To: Admin @ VAuG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market Value for SJJ8877M - Date of Accident: 08.01.2018

Hi all,
Can assist to check market value for SJJ8787m?

Date of Accident: 08.01.2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com

*
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1/9/2018

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

. https:llvﬂ.Ila.gov.sgmafvnfacﬁonfenquireRebateByPumicaeforeDereglnput?FUNcnoN_m:

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Singapore NRIC

4074C

SJJ8877M
No
09 Jan 2018

VOLVO

W S\G
DoR - & [1]17

S60T5 2.0 AUTO ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR TURBO

White

2011
B4204T71031384
YV1FS475BC2084291
177.0 kW (237 bhp)
$39,021.00

16 Aug 2012

16 Aug 2012

2

$39,021.00

Yes
15 Aug 2022

$27,314.00

15 Aug 2022

E - Open Category

I q Qo Lg 1K
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

1/9/2018
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $95,034.00
COE Rebate Amount: $43,465.00
Total Rebate Amount: $70,779.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 09 Jan 2018

OK

" https:l!vn.Ita.gov.sgmalvrllactionlenquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereg1nput?FuNCTlON_|D=F0304009T1' 2/2



SJJ8877M - Submitted by: Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd (HQ)

1/12: Accident Photo

2/12: Accident Photo

3/12: Accident Photo



$JJ8877M - Submitted by: Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd (HQ)

4/12: Accident Photo

5/12: Accident Photo

6/12: Accident Photo



$JJ8877M - Submitted by: Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd (HQ)

7/12: Accident Photo

8/12: Accident Photo

9/12: Accident Photo



$JJ8877M - Submitted by: Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd (HQ)

10/12; Accident Photo

11/12: Accident Photo

12/12: Chassis Number




