Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

& Benoi Place Singapore 529927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 13.11.2019

Our ref: SHD26161
Your Ref: GBG2282D

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ld

3 Anson Road # | 6-00 Withowut prejudice
Springleal Tower Fax: 6224 7175
Singapore 079909

Aun: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Madam.

ACCIDENT ON 3L102009 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD26161U & GRBG2282D

We are on behalf of M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pre 1td the owner ol vehicle
SHD2616L! in their third party claim against vour insured / driver of GBG2282D

Appended below our client’s claim:-

I. Cost of repair $ 2.086.50
2. Loss of rental @S158.80 x 2 days $ 31760
3. GIA search Fee b 2.00

l'onal S 2.406.10

We enclosed herewith our invoice 4563, GIA search receipt. letter of authority & | etter of
Certification for your retention. Please acknowledge receipt.

For amicable settlement, please let us have your offer
Regards

Yours faithfully.,

L

Alice Lepng
I=-mail: aliceleong d primeautoclaims.com

Enel,



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 1:37 PM

To: 'ENQUIRY @ HAISIA COMSG'

Cc Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG2282D AND SHD2618U ON 31/10/2019

Our Ref: CCH/CTI19019383/T1kald

HAI SIA SEAFOOD PTE. LTD.
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG2282D AND SHD2616U ON 31/10/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore] Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this |etter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD.

Re: ACCIDENT ON 31.10.2019 INVOLVING SHD26161 & GBG2282D
ALONG ECP

I/ We, M/S PRIME CAR RENTAL & TAXI SERVICES PTE L.TD hereby authorized vou to
carry out repairs of the damage caused to my / our vehicle no. SHD2616U in the above

accident.

I/ We turther also confirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by you on my/ our
behalf shall be paid to you. I/ We hereby also authorise the third party insurer to release to vou

such sums of money recovered on my / our behalf.

Signature (Company s stamp if applicable)
Name: PRME CAR RenTAL Y TA| TEPVCEr PTe LTo
NRIC: (99 boe247 ¥
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TAX INVNOICE NO.: 4563
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benol Place Singapore 628827
Tel: 6861 0808 Fax 6515 2048
GST Reg. No: 201808580M
PRMEGROUP  Rag No. 201B06560M
MESSRS CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD DATE 12/11/2010
3 4 Road WORKS ORDER NO . 4622
#16-00 Springleal Tower VEHICLE NO: SHD2616U
SINGAPORE 079909
[TEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Make' Modsl . TOYOTA ALPHARD
Repair Date © 041112019
Terms of Payment .  COD
THIRD PARTY CLAIM
1 BEING LUMP SUM REPAIR TO THE ABOVE § 195000
VEHICLE

* Compound mterests at the rate of 1% per month
will be charged on late payment. ™

"

PREPARED BY

SUB TOTAL 5 1,950.00
GST ™ 5 136.50
ROUNDINGADJ § 0.00
TOTAL 5 2,086.50

PRIME AUTO's $ SERVICE



PRIME CAR RENTAL
& TAXI SERVICES PTELTD

Co. Cert. No: 19960629327
Gst Reg. No: 19-9606293-2

Your Rel : Please advise Our Ref: SHD2616U
Date 1 06.11.2019

lo : Whom It May Concern

From : Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Lid

RE: LETTER OF CERTIFICATION FOR MR. ONG PANG JOO ROY

This letter serves w confirm that Mr. Ong Pang Joo Roy Nric Number S7441576H is
a Taxi Master for Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pre Ltd hiring the Vehicle
Registration Number SHD2616LU at a daily rate of Singapore Dollar One Hundred
Fiftyv Eight and Cents Eighty (S158.80) Only.

Should clarification require | can be contacted at 94524182,

Thank vou with Best Regards

Y ours Sincerely FI/H_H“‘\
- — . \I
~ 1e

S l\__-__ : ]
/ ~ s

Mr Lim Huan Hiang

Workshop Manager



10312018

GENERAL
INSURANCE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday S8am to Spm
ECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Na: M400017735
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Qur Rel Mo GR-18-175648
Date of Request: 3nozo18e Your Raf No Online Purchasea
Prime Auto Claims Service Pta Lid
6 Banol Place
Singapare 629927
Dear SirlMadam,
Enquiry Date 31102019
Enquiry By Liu Pei Yee
mﬂ& No GBG22682D
t Date 3Mor2og
Enquiry Result
TP Vehicle No. Insurar Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GBG22820 China Taiping Insurance (Singapare) Pte. Lid. 29/06/2019-28/06/2020 6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original repons forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of Singapore
and we take no responeihility for thair accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoaver for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection
with the reports or their images.

’Iaqs a computer generaled document and requires no signature.

hitps:'singapore. mernman.com/claims/index.cimMusebor=MTRsasi lussaclion=dsp_geninviphrefid=23305318CFID=5167E4004CF TOKEN=3086a% 12



1012018

IRDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invlcs

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #1B-00, Singapore 048580
I“SURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 D030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam 1o Spm
GST Ragistration Na: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref Mo GR-19-179648

Date of Request 3102019 Your Ref Na Online Purchasa

Prime Aulo Claims Service Pte Lid

& Banoi Place

Singapore 629827

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Dale 31/10/2019

Enquiry By Liu Pei Yea

m:c!ﬂ No GBG2282D

t Date 3102018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)

TF Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GET Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You,

This is a computer generated documen| and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;

Date:

[X] GIRQ [ ] Cash [ ]| Chequs
hitps isingapore.menmen.comiclaims/index. cfm Husebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_gennviphrelid=2330531ACFID=616TE4R08CFTOKEN=J086af0. . 272



