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Yourref:  SNMI9D205169 Date: 12/11719

Owr ref: CCOH/CTIY0193RI/T ka3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHD 26160
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the mspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 04/11/2019
at the premises of M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Ple Lid and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : S5 2,607.80
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2.437.80
"Check” Items Amount : 5% -
Total (Including Check Items) 1 5% 2,437.80
Market Value 1 5% - (est)
LTA Reimbursement Value 8% - (est)
Nen Value - S55 - lest.)
e e b
Description of Damage: . == .
The vehicle sustained damages at the L A J'
Rear Portion —

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours fmthfully.

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Req. No : 201606560M

6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 05.11.2019

China Taiping Insurance (5) Pte Ltd
2 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SHD2616U TOYOTA ALPHARD HYBRID 2.5 (2018)

To Supply
1) 1pc Tail gate $ 195620 b —
2) 1pc Tail gate "Toyota" emblem S 90.00m&r
3) 1pc Tail gate "Alphard" emblem S 80,00 ~&
4) 1pc Tail gate "Hybrid Synergy Drive" emblem S 85.10 #&<
5) 1pc Tail gate "E-Four” emblem S 59.10 né
Sub total parts S 2,270.40

Less: 25% discount $ (567.60)

S 1,702.80
To Supply S.Nett Parts
1) 1set Rear glass inner seal S 65.00 "L~
2 ) ltube  Rear glass sealant S 40.00 «r -
Sub total S.Nett Parts $ 105.00
L/charge
1) Toremove & refit rear glass. S 120.00 ~
2 ) Totransfer tail gate trim board, handle & mechanism part. 5 80.00 (¢

3 ) Toremove & replace tail gate. Align & adjust tail gate. 5 300.00 /=



LY
4 ) To putty, respray painting tail gate inlet & outer. To polish. S 3nu.nd

Sub total L/charges 5 800.00
Estimated Grand S 2,607.80
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUtD)
Sent: Tuesday, 12 November, 2012 11:46 AM
To: Tan Kah Leong
Ce Khanchna (LEK Auto), Admin A
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205169-GBG2282D-TKL- Accident Invalving GBG2282D (01
CTl - TBA) and SHD2616U (TP - LKK REF - CC6/CTI19019383/ka3) on 31/10/2019
Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED pdt
Categories: HMEK
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVEASTO COSTS

CTI ref: SNM19D205169
LKK REF: CC6/CTI19019383/T1ka3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.,
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SHD 26160
We have not authorized repairs,

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair
*  Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regords,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiEwand®lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0:2-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong. Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November, 2019 9:28 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ lkkauto.com>: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.coms>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205169-GBG2282D-TKL- Accident Invalving GBG2282D (O] : CT1 -
TBA) and SHD2616U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119019383/ka3) on 31/10/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Mey Kwan,

We refer to your email below.

Attached is our insured’s GIA report for your necessary action.

Please keep us posted on the status of the claim,



Thank you.
Regards

Tan Kah Leong

Assistan! Execulive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 072509
DID: (65) 63B9 6183 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.lacebook com/chinataipingsa/

Disedaimer Thee @-man and any iiles transmitled with if & infended anly for the named recipients and may contain confideniial information. Ary
urRuthorised disclosire, use or dissemination of this message, aither in whole or partial. iz crohibited. If you are nol the intended recimeni, pleass
notily the sender mmediafaly. Please delete the e-mafl and any copigs of ¥ thereafter

From: Claims Dept of CT1

Sent: Monday, November 4, 2019 3:31 PM

To: Tan Kah Leong <Kahl cong Tan @ sg cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow

<sochow chee @sg entaiping com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ lkkauto com>; Khanchna (LKK
Auto) <khanchna @ lkkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D205169-GBG2282D-TKL- Accident Involving GBG2282D (O1: CTI1 - TBA)
and SHD2616U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTII9019383/ka3) on 31/10/2019

Dear Kah Leong,
Please revert LKK.

Note : officer in charge — Kah Leong

Regards,

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple, Lid.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Sprihgleat Tower Singapore 073309
T: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

| WeChat: & Wi Taiping SG

W: www.sg.cnlaiping,com |

Disclavmar This e-mall and any Hes ransmitied with it & nfended only lor the named recipients and may contam confidential information. Any
uriauthonzed disclosure, use or dissevmination of his message, aither in whole or partia, i probibied. If you are net the Intended reciovent, plaase
metify the sender immadiately. Please delaie the e-mail and any copimes of If thereafer

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan @ lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 4 November, 2019 9:43 AM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@ sg cnunping com=>

Ce: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna®@ lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a @ [kkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG2282D (Ol : CT1- TBA) and SHD2616L! (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTTI9019383/ka3) on 31/1(/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS



; Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have received a new assignment from M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd. and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Khanchna and she can be contacted at DID: 6841
2360,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Med Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6966 0055 | emall: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Hlk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubs Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www symanteccloud.com




Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reqg. No : 201606560M

6 Benol Place Singapore 629927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 19.12.2019

Our rel: SHD26 161

LKK Auto Consultams Pre Lid
Blk 51 Paya Uhi Industrial Park
#02-25 Libi Ave |

Singapore 408933

Attn: Ms. Khanchna
Maotor Claims Dept

Dear Madam,

ACCIDENT ON 3102009 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD26161 & (,BG22821D

I'he above referred.

We enclosed herewith our client signed discharge voucher for your payment processing. Please
let us have your payment of $2.406.10 make pavable 10 Prime Auto Claims Service Pre 1
soonest possible.

Hard copy of our LOD semt 10 vour ofTice on 13.11.2019

Please mail your cheque 1o our new office at No.6 Benoi Place Singapore 620927

Thank vou.

Yours faithfully,

Nel?
Ms. Alice Leong
E-mail: aliceleong@ primeautoclaims.com

lncl,



u]';lﬂl:h;'ll !LKI{ Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 &:16 PM

To: Alice Leong

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 31.10.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2616U & GBG2282D
Attachments: CTI DV pdf

Without Prejudice

(save as fo costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter

We confirm settlement as per your LOD.

We attoch herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

Kindly send us [LKK) all the documenls below for our necessary action: -

. hardcopy of the DV

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna a kkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §{408933)

From: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com™>

Sent: Tuesday. 17 December 2019 5:36 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/!lkkauto.com>

Ce: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSngia lkkauto.com=>; Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 31.10.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD261611 & GBG2282D
Importance: High



Hi Khanchna, 1 Reminder

Our LOD e-mail to vouon 13.11.2019 referred.

For swift & amicable settlement, please let us have your offer
Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid

6 Benod Place Ningapore 620027
T(65): 6861 0908 | F(65)6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Grou

}i i .

This e-mail (including all sttnchment | comains confdential information which may be privileged. It s intended solely ar the idemified recipient{s)
to whom it is addressed. 1T vou are not an intend reciplent. please reply to us immediantely and delete this message from vour system. You may not
copy or usc it for any purpose, or stherwise disclose its contents 1o any person

From: Alice Leong [mailio:aliceleong « primenunoclaims.com)

Sent: 13 November, 2019 1:04 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khmnchnaa lkkauto.com=>

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 31.10.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD26160 & GBG2282D
Importance: High

Hi Khanchna,

Enclosed our LOD with supporting documents {or vour retention. QOur hirer’s video footage enclosed for your
perusal, Onginal documents mailing out to your office,

BOLA Scenario: 27 applied.
For swift & amicable settlement, please let us have your offer / establish liabilities & quantum.
Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

o Revred Place Singapare 629927
T(65): 6861 0908 | F(63) 6315 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304



A member of the Prime Group

This e=mail (including all atmchment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. I s imended solely for the idemified recipiemis)
0 whom it is addressed. Il you are not an intend recipient. please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not
<copy or use jt for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents 1o amy person
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Awve 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408633
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 193507198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobilie

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) PTELTD Ref : CCBICTI18019383/T1kadg2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079908 s SR I|”|||I||I|"H|“l m
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG 22820 Veh. Inspected SHD 2616U
Policy No. DMCVSN1B818261801 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM190205169 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 04/11/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HYERID c.c 2483
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2019
Chassis No. AYH3ID00E6700 Colour WHITE
Odometer 76267 Stearing IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/B85R16 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/E5R16 GOODYEAR 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |2156/65R16 GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [215/65R16 GOODYEAR & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/10/2019 Inspection Date 04/11/2019
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTELTD
8 BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 620927
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
B)IN ACGCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h, Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
s Indn = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/_. TEL 6256 3561 EAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No 18950718BR GST Reg No. 19-9507198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 2616U
Qty 'Description of Parts -Cundl.'tl_:m' Wﬁﬂhﬂﬁ%} i ‘ld.;;
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1[TAIL GATE BENT 1,856.20 1,956.20
1|TAIL GATE 'TOYOTA' EMBLEM NECESSARY 90.00 90.00
1|TAIL GATE "ALPHARD' EMBLEM NECESSARY 80.00 80.00
1|{TAIL GATE 'HYBRID SYNERGY DRIVE EMBLEM NECESSARY 85.10 8510
1| TAIL GATE 'E-FOUR' EMBLEM MECESSARY 58.10 58.10
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -567 60 -567.60
1,702.80 1,702.80
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR GLASS INNER SEAL (SN) NECESSARY 65.00 65.00
1{TUBE REAR GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
105.00 105.00
LABOUR
TO RMEOVE & REFIT REAR GLASS 120.00 120.00
TO TRANSFER TAIL GATE TRIM BOARD .HANDLE & 80.00 60.00
MECHANISM PART
TO REMOVE & REPLACE TAIL GATE ALIGN & ADJUST 300.00 200.00
TAIL GATE.
TO PUTTY ,RESPRAY PAINTING TAIL GATE IMLET & 300.00 250.00
OUTER TO POLISH
800.00 630.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,607.80 2.437.80
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS. 3 ~1,950.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) 0 < IRl ]
Report Ref No. CCE/CTI19019383/T1ka3q2
. )
f e
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automolive Assessor

DISTLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart Is made solely for the uss s benelll of iha Client named on the frani page of ihis Report.




