Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November, 2019 3:07 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : GBH6468D claiming TP vehicle no : YM8964B

D.O.A. 20/10/2019 ***LKK REF: CC4/LPC19019378/da3

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan,
Pls be informed that our Insured do not wish to pursue the said claim and considered closed at our end.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Wong [mailto:wong@sh-motor.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 2:58 PM

To: 'Enquiry’

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : GBH6468D claiming TP vehicle no : YM8964B D.O.A. 20/10/2019
***| KK REF: CC4/LPC19019378/da3

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 12:58 PM

To: wong@sh-motor.com

Cec: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : GBH6468D claiming TP vehicle no : YM8964B D.O.A.
20/10/2019 ***LKK REF: CC4/LPC19019378/da3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported.
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Brief Details.
On 20/10/2018 at 9.45am, | was driving my company's lorry YW8864B when | was involved in a minor
accident. Al that time, | was travelling at Upper Changi Road North and enter the road to New Changi
Prison Complex construction site. | then decided to park al the road side to change my pass before
entering. | then alighted from my lorry to change my pass. While | was waiting to change my pass about 4
minules later, suddenly another lorry driver came to me and sald that my lorry had hit onto his lorry
GBHE4B8D . | then went out and saw that the said driver's lorry had hit onto my lory's rear side. | then
told him that | had park the lormy prior to his arrival. The lomy driver was unhappy and claimed that my
lorry had reversed and hit onto his lorry. There was no damages on my lomy and there was visible
damages on the front side of the other lorry | wish to state that | did not witness the accident happened
mdllhadpalmudmyhmrpmmﬂrbﬁmmvm my lorry. Both the driver and | exchanged particulars.
;I:‘ft\gmmmmmponadnhnyimwim. | am lodging this report for my company’s insurance
m.

Please provide us the following and arrange for TP survey.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo.
e PIR result (if any)
e GIAreport

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Jia Le at 6749 5792.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wong [mailto:wong @sh-motor.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 29 October 2019 2:17 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : GBH6468D claiming TP vehicle no : YM8964B D.O.A.
20/10/2019
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Dear Sir/Madam,

Attached herewith GIA report and kindly let us know who is the Officer-in-charge?
Our Insured would like to know the status of liability first, pls revert.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931



