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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 5:39 PM

To: STK STK

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKL1819E TP CLAIM SLA5205X DOA : 27/10/2019 ***LKK 

REF:CC6/AIG19019329/Uhb3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Mr Tan, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

 

Please be informed that we are pending for mandate approval from our principal. 

 

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: STK STK [mailto:stkautosg@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 5:19 PM 
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To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: SKL1819E TP CLAIM SLA5205X DOA : 27/10/2019 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG19019329/hb3 

 

Dear Vic  

 

Please follow up the offer as soon as possible. 

 

Thank  you  

 

 

Yours sincerely 

  

Tan Guohua 

Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 

 

 

 

 

STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com> 于2019年12月30日周一 上午11:25写道： 

Dear Vic  

 

Please follow up the payment as soon as possible. 

 

Happy New Year 2020 
 

Thank you 

 

 

Yours sincerely 
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Tan Guohua 

Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 

 

 

 

 

Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 于2019年11月8日周五 上午9:27写道： 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sir, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, we are prepared to 

settle your claim on a 50/50 basis. 

  

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of 

repair to your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is 

subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ 

LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our 

principal. 

  

Kindly arrange inspection of the vehicle. 
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Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by 
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please 
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and 
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

  

  

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 1 November, 2019 2:47 PM 

To: stkautosg@gmail.com 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SKL1819E TP CLAIM SLA5205X DOA : 27/10/2019 ***LKK 

REF:CC6/AIG19019329/hb3  

  

Dear Guo Hua, 

  

We refer to the below email. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report. 

  

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Thank you 
  

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
  

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 1 November 2019 9:55 AM 

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SKL1819E TP CLAIM SLA5205X DOA : 27/10/2019 

  

Dear Shu Pei  

  

We claim against AIG, please refer to attached document. 

  

Please advise the liability as soon as possible. 

  

Thank you  

 

  

Yours sincerely 

  

Tan Guohua 

Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 

  

 

  

  

Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 于2019年11月1日周五 上午9:39写道： 

Dear Guo Hua, 

Kindly advise which insurer is your client seeking to claim against. 

Thank you 
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Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 1 November 2019 9:36 AM 

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: SKL1819E TP CLAIM SLA5205X DOA : 27/10/2019 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 31 October, 2019 3:01 PM 

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com 

Subject: Re: SKL1819E TP CLAIM SLA5205X DOA : 27/10/2019 

  

Dear  

  

Please arrange survey before repair. advise the libility . 
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Thank you   

 

  

Yours sincerely 

  

Tan Guohua 

Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 

  

 


