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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 October, 2019 2:19 PM

To: '‘Admin-D (LKKAuto)'; 'Admin A’; 'SUR'

Cc 'Claims’

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SKG 7200 B ON 26/10/2019
Attachments: SKG 7200 B - 26102019.PDF

Dear All,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.
Kindly arrange survey on 1/11/19, 10:30am. Owner waiting.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

| ey |
WELCOME TO THE-
.8TH DIMENSION.

ail, including any attachment, is canfidential and may alsc be privileged.
tin errar, please netify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you




Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

S T
From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 3:12 PM
To: Claims Dept; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKG 7200 B ON 26/10/2019
Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKG 7200B (Excess $1,600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 3:04 PM

To: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKG 7200 B ON 26/10/2019

Dear all,
Any update on repair approval?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911
e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg W. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SKG7200B (42957457405G)
oD
Oct 26 2019 1:10PM
[PANG LAI HONG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

i Replyj Reply AIIJ Mark as Unread Print Message E Delete Messag ! Forward E

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 04/11/2019 12:02 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$3518.00) - SKG72008B - Claim Handler: Gan, Hunchung

Approved:3518,00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY —

There are no documents,




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Nov 2019

OK

Singapore NRIC
2751

SKG7200B

No

01 Nov 2019

AUDI ;
A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI S TRONIC (NAV)
Black

2019

CVKO078666
WAUZZZF41KA052033
140.0 kW (187 bhp)
$33,718.00

26 Jul 2019

26 Jul 2019

0

$39,206.00

Yes
25 Jul 2029
$29,404.00

25 Jul 2029

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$34,000.00

$33,086.00

$62,490.00
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

WIP:17276

Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference - PA/OD/1300/2019/NS
Date : 31-Oct-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Ms Pang Lai Hong
Blk 13 Toh Yi Drive
#08-01

Singapore 590013
HP +65 97562318
Own Damage Claims
1900115550

SKG 72008

Audi A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI 8W
26/7/2019

CVK 078666
WAUZZZF41KA052033

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
26-0ct-19
Bukit Timah Plaza Basement Carpark



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699 N
Tel:6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SKG 7200 B

Estimated Surveyor's
S/n Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendations
To remove, chevk and reinstall dront wire harness /
1 for headlights, horns, cutside temperature sensor, S/N $ 480.00

headlight and washer assy. Front parkig aid.

To dismantle and renew front bumper and rhs front
2 fender. Re-organise crash management
components. Reinstall all parts removed.

\8\

~
3
0

vy
M
o
o
3
™~
C
0

3 To respray front bumper and rhs front fender.

4 To carry out diagnostic check. S/N § 192.00 -

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : $ 4,772.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SKG 7200 B

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONTBUMPER  {&..- s 1,999.00-<
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS s 531.00 i
3 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH , $ 56.00 4
4 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH | A%~ $ 123.00*
5  FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH s 34.00%
6 FRONTFENDER-RH  Donipd S 700.00 -
7  FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS ~ Av¢ Mec- S 183.00 '
8  FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT-RH  7¥¢ /¢~ $ 45.00 |
9  FRONTFENDER BRACKET-RH At réts S 32.00 7
10  FRONT FENDER BRACE - RH FRONT 3/ péc S 107.00 ’
11  FRONT FENDER DEFORMATION ELEMENT BRACKET - RH (:ff s 45.00 °
12 FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER - RH Kt — | s 220.00 &
13 WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS 47 -~ $ 211.00 -
14  WHEEL SPOILER - RH 'l[ $ 66.00 +
15  WHEEL SPOILER TRIM - RH e s 33.00 #
16  STONE CHIP GUARD -RH Al $ 46.00
17  FENDER LEDGE COVER - RH AL s s 28.00 7
18  FENDER LEDGE TOP COVER-RH A A $ 21.00
19  SUNDRIES ™o - $ 300.00 ,
TOTAL SPARE PARTS S 4,780.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES S 4,772.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 9,552.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699 LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 the Re  follewing:
» To resunvey hetoralal nting
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Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Alst fs}w%wﬂie,c‘ , o%ys’

Please Note This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.
Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant

Johnny Boo
Body Repair Manager




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 68411183
Reference : PA/OD/1300/2019/NS
Date i 31-Oct-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  Ms Pang Lai Hong
Address :  Blk 13 Toh Yi Drive
#08-01
Singapore 590013
Telephone 1 HP +65 97562318
Type of Claim :  Own Damage Claims
Policy No. : 1900115550
Vehicle No : SKG72008B
Model Code :  Audi A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI| 8W
Model / Year 1 26/7/2019
Engine No :  CVK 078666
Chassis No : WAUZZZF41KA052033
Mileage S
Date In B
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date :  26-Oct-19

Place of Accident 1 Bukit Timah Plaza Basement Carpark

WIP : 17276




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SKG 7200 B

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendations
To remove, chevk and reinstall dront wire harness for
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, SIN % 480.00
headlight and washer assy. Front parkig aid. $ 480.00
To dismantle and renew front bumper and rhs front
2 fender. Re-organise crash management components. $ 2,100.00
Reinstall all parts removed. $ 1,000.00
3 To respray front bumper and rhs front fender. $ 2,000.00 $ 1,100.00
4 To carry out diagnostic check. SIN § 192.00 $ 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,772.00 5 2,772.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SKG 7200 B

Damaged Parts & Prices

SIN___ Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONT BUMPER $ 1,999.00
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 531.00
3  FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH $ 56.00
4 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH 3 123.00
5 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH $ 34.00
6 FRONT FENDER - RH 3 700.00 s 559.60
7 FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS 3 183.00
8 FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH $ 45.00
9 FRONT FENDER BRACKET - RH $ 32.00
10 FRONT FENDER BRACE - RH FRONT $ 107.00
11  FRONT FENDER DEFORMATION ELEMENT BRACKET -RH  § 45.00
12  FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER - RH $ 220.00
13 WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS $ 211.00
14  WHEEL SPOILER - RH $ 66.00
15  WHEEL SPOILER TRIM - RH $ 33.00
16  STONE CHIP GUARD - RH 3 46.00 $ 36.64
17 FENDER LEDGE COVER - RH $ 28.00
18  FENDER LEDGE TOP COVER -RH $ 21.00
19  SUNDRIES $ 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 4,780.00 $ 596.24
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,772.00 $ 2,772.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 9,552.00 § 3,368.24
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



