Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Hua Chin Motors <huachinmotors2@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 April 2020 11:23 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

hi

Pls proceed. thank you

On Mon, Apr 27, 2020 at 10:45 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Refer to attachment
Offer at $ 1482.50 / 3 days of part by part repair

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LSES
b S Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

From: Hua Chin Motors [mailto:huachinmotors2@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2020 4:20 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19




Hi Rasul

$987.5 totally cannot cover our repair fees.

On Fri, Apr 24, 2020 at 3:28 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Kindly update

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LSES

P

= Save the Larth- Print only whernr necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2020 9:17 AM

To: Hua Chin Motors

Subject: RE: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

Hi,




Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LRSS L.

" Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 April, 2020 9:49 AM
To: Hua Chin Motors

Subject: RE: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

Hi,

Finalised amount is $987.50 / 3 days of part by part repair

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

I 7 7ol

P

" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

From: Hua Chin Motors [mailto:huachinmotors2@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 23 April, 2020 9:28 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

hi

sorry we don't have the rear tyre rim photo.

On Thu, Apr 23, 2020 at 8:41 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Kindly assist if not I'm unable to finalise.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 April, 2020 2:40 PM
To: Hua Chin Motors

Subject: RE: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

Hi,

As spoken, kindly assist to forward to me the new and old rear tyre rim damage photo for this bike

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

74 74

¥ K

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 April, 2020 9:30 AM
To: Hua Chin Motors

Subject: RE: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

Hi,

Kindly forward to me the new and old rear tyre rim damage photo for this bike.



Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

I 74 74

P

= Save the Larth- Print only whern necessary-

From: Hua Chin Motors [mailto:huachinmotors2@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 2 April, 2020 11:17 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

On Thu, Apr 2, 2020 at 9:32 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Kindly assist

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd




Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 April, 2020 5:04 PM
To: Hua Chin Motors

Subject: RE: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19

Hi,

Kindly forward to me the adjusted estimate | will finalise. Mine | misplaced it

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥y L LS

= Save the Larth- Print only whernr necessary-

From: Hua Chin Motors [mailto:huachinmotors2@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 1 April, 2020 12:17 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBL 5055Y DOA : 19/10/19




Hi

We haven't received final COR and DOR from you.

On Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 10:27 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Just wanna check is this case finalised?

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LRSS L.

" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-



