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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: 28 October 2020 4:58 PM
To: Amitabh Prasad
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW2943Z & GBB6825M ON 31/10/2019 ALONG KAKI 

BUKIT AVENUE 3

Dear Mr. Amitabh, 
  
We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
 
Please forward us the e-mail correspondence from your workshop informing you that your claim was successful 
to enable us  
send to your insurance company. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Amitabh Prasad <prasadamitabh@ymail.com>  
Sent: 21 July 2020 10:16 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW2943Z & GBB6825M ON 31/10/2019 ALONG KAKI BUKIT 
AVENUE 3 
 
Hi Khanchna, 
The workshop is Jeep Chrysler, Singapore and as far as I know the settlement was 100%.  

Thanks and best regards, 
Amitabh Prasad  
 
 

On 21 Jul 2020, at 09:03, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  
Dear Mr. Amitabh, 
  
We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
  
We will review the matter accordingly. 
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Please let us know the name of the workshop that is assisting you to make the  counter claim against 
GBB 6825M. 
  
Kindly also let us know the percentage of your claim settlement (for example: 50% or 100%)  and status 
so that we can update your insurance company (AIG Insurance) and do the needful. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Amitabh Prasad <prasadamitabh@ymail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 July 2020 8:58 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Sgp, Ccu Aig <aigsgpccureferral@aig.com> 
Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW2943Z & GBB6825M ON 31/10/2019 ALONG 
KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 3 
  
  
  

From: Amitabh Prasad <prasadamitabh@ymail.com> 
Date: 20 July 2020 at 12:49:17 SGT 
To: Amitabh <sarami1909@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re:  ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW2943Z & GBB6825M ON 
31/10/2019 ALONG KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 3 

 
Dear Khanchna, 
With reference to your email regarding third party settlement, I do not agree with 
your statement ‘ you and/or your authorized driver may not be absolved from 
blame for this accident‘. 
 The other party was evidently responsible for causing the accident due to 
negligence and lack of respect for speed and absence of timely braking action.  
Moreover, I was justified in making a right turn via the yellow box. The other 
party was coming at a very high speed despite the fact that traffic had stopped at 
red light which allowed me to make my aforementioned turn. Being at high speed 
, he did not brake and impacted my vehicle in the front left with my daughter 
sitting in the rear left seat. Fortunately, no one was injured. I am enclosing 
pictures of the accident as I have done earlier and want to claim a third party 
settlement.  
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Thanks and best regards, 
Amitabh Prasad  
  
 
 

On 17 Jul 2020, at 10:22, Amitabh <sarami1909@gmail.com> 
wrote: 

 

Amitabh  ෛොෝෞෟ෠ ෛොෝෞෟ෠ 
  
  
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Khanchna (LKK Auto)" 
<khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Date: July 16, 2020 at 16:04:49 GMT+8 
To: "sarami1909@gmail.com" 
<sarami1909@gmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE:  ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SFW2943Z & GBB6825M ON 31/10/2019 
ALONG KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 3 

AMITABH PRASAD 
[POLICY HOLDER] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW2943Z & 
GBB6825M ON 31/10/2019 ALONG KAKI 
BUKIT AVENUE 3 
  
We are acting on behalf of your motor insurer, AIG 
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the 
third party claim against your motor insurance 
policy. 
  
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and 
would like to advise that you and/or your authorized 
driver may not be absolved from blame for this 
accident. 
  
If you have evidence/information (for e.g. accident 
video/scene photos) to prove that we should not 
settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them 
in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 25/07/2020,  
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after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third 
Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and 
any settlement should not bind any claims 
whatsoever by you/your driver 
against the other party’s insurer arising from this 
particular accident. 
  
We noted that you have made a counter claim 
against Third party m/vehicle GBB6825M. 
  
Kindly let us have the  name of the workshop that 
was assisting you to make the claim and 
outcome/status of the said claim. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: 
Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 
#02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 January 2020 3:00 PM 
To: sarami1909@gmail.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW2943Z & 
GBB6825M ON 31/10/2019 ALONG KAKI 
BUKIT AVENUE 3 
  
AMITABH PRASAD 
[POLICY HOLDER] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW2943Z & 
GBB6825M ON 31/10/2019 ALONG KAKI 
BUKIT AVENUE 3 
  
We are acting on behalf of your motor insurer, AIG 
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third 
party claim against your motor insurance policy. 
  
We noted that you have made a counter claim 
against Third party m/vehicle GBB6825M. 
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Kindly let us have the  name of the workshop that 
was assisting you to make the claim and 
outcome/status of the said claim. 
  
Also, please let us have the accident video/scene 
photos (if any). 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
  
“Wishing you a happy and a prosperous New 
Year!” 
  
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: 
Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 
#02-25 | S(408933) 
  


