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- o W Consuffants
M. BB & Pl Lt

51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UB1 INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX : {D&5) 62564315

Your Ref: D19006907MFESH Date: 05 March 2020

Our Ref: CS/FCI1901927/Av{3

The Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance [.td

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SLR4137B .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 06/11/2019 at the premises of M/s N51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD. and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 2.446.08
Revised Estimate Amount  (LumpSum) :S$ 1.400.00
*Check” Items Amount : 8% -
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 85§ -
Nett Value : S8 -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages . e .
at the rear o/s portion E | § j Pem
S
affude

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATAI
Licensed Appraiser



Ms@FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited (o Reg o 1950001050 5T Reg b ME-OO016TES
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (R5) 6222 2311 Fax (65} 6222 3547

Claims & Hetor Undasnwriting Dege: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore QeearTr
Tel, (65} 6507 3848 Fax: (E5) G507 3849
wiww.mafirsicapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

31-10-2019 Our Ref No. D19006907MFSH
30-10-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHA7886P Third Party Vehicle. SLR4137B

2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #01-18 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
ZI TING

68420051/ 0 Fax No. 67410510

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTELTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

M-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE
LTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

Attention. MIL

KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature req uired,




Yvonne Wung (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, March 05, 2020 7:25 PFM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMEMT - D19006907MFSH/M
Attachments: SLR4137B DOA 30102019 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle S5LR4137B
Date of survey : 06/11/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, November 08, 201% 4:45 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15006907M FSH/1

Dear Sir,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLR41378B on 06/11/2018.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

1



Yvonne Wona (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, November 08, 2019 4:45 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006907MFSH/1
Dear Sir,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLR41378 on 06/11/2019.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yyonnewong(@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS5 Motar Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 31 October, 2019 3:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmatorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006907MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

1



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 10 Type:

Crwmner 10:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNo.:

Chassis Mo.!

P aximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Jan 2020

Company
200G

SLR41378B

No

10 Jan 2020
HOMDA

VEZEL HYBRID 1.5X AUTO
Gold

2017

LEB59533461
RL31253343

112.0 kW (150 bhp)
$24,661.00

15 Aug 2017

15 Aug 2017

0

25 000,00

Yes
14 Aug 2027
$3,750.00

14 Aug 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or 7kW (130bhp)
10

247 501.00

$36,072.00

$£39,822.00

OK



@K-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AuteHub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

H01-17 / #01-18 / Heavy Veehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No. | +65 6842 0051 Fax No.: +65 6741 0510
E-Mail : salesimns].com.sg

Company Reg. No. : 200616035C

GST Registration No, : 20061 6038C

GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY

SINGAPORE 373960 <@
yannd

Contact : 66550003-GRAR 91997404

(LKl — ¥V Adra \l

ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLMI15735
Date in: 30/10/2019
Vehicle Num, : SLR4137B

Model : HONDA VEZEL HYBRID 1.53X AUTO

Chassis/Eng# ; RU31253343/LEB5953361

Parts and Labour Assesment

Description of part

LA

REAR BUMPER

REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LR -
REAR RH AIR VENT  pfp s

REAR RH BUMPER REFLECTOR AP
REAR RH BUMPER SIDE gg*fow-drtl

REAR RH FENDER ARCH GARNISH (&

Percentage discount  20%

REAR BUMPER CLIPS - SET

e

REAR RH FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS - SET A+

Percemage discount (Mo

LABOUR

Oy Unit Price

| 762.70

| ﬂg){f 23,00

[ 3030

9}(?3{3 ; 141.10

1 |95 EH)

I 195,00
Subtotal hefore discount
Sub-toral 1

:';J i 50,00

| 300000

Subtotal before discount

Sub-total 2

Paris-total

To remove, reinstall clectrical wiring harness, check lighting, and rewire for parking sensor,

To remiove, reinstall roof top teim upholstery, cushion seat, mim gamish, wim liner carpet. {10 FR)

Ta re-spray painting on the change hodyparts, repair portion, and where consistent to the aceident.

page 1

Amaount
Ta2.T70) _,/
SRl -"/
W30 A

141,10 %
195 r1r|/

195 (H) *"/

1.370.10

274,02

| iR S

&0.00

(XA H]

#0000

1,176.08

1 L,/
100,00 X%



~@K:51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17/ #01-18 { Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No. ; +65 6842 0031 Fax No. : +65 6741 0310
E-Mail : salesiin®l.com.sg

Company Reg. Na, ; 200616038C

GST Registration No. : 2006160350

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY ESTIMATE
SINGAPORE 573960 Repair Code : CLM15735

Date in : 30/10/2019
Vehicle Num. : SLR4137B

Model : HONDA VEZEL HYBRID 1.5X AUTO
Chassis’/Eng# : RU31253343/LEB5053361

Contact : 66550005-GRAR 91997404

To provide labour, workinanship to change the above damaged bodyparts, repair, re-construct and re-
align hody structure, body alignments and damaged consistent to the aceident. ? 50 -Hlpﬂﬂ _?ﬁ
T apply anti-rust chemical on repaired and reploced panel, EIRIL 't’ .
Labour Total 1,270.00
Parts & Labour Total 2.446.08

*** This 1s & computer-generated document which requires no signature.***
page 2

Total : 17K 34

f‘/ S c.
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify 03 o
the Repairer of the following: o?/ﬁ

« To resunvey belore/aher Spray panting

» To display damaged part(s) denng resuney

« Pafts prices are subjectto confirmation

5 on & “Wiinout Prejudice” bass

& Trurd parly Surdey

« No iliegal modilicalion|s) & alinwed
s Supplementary (bt LSt b T sryaved and
.ﬁ symect 10 final approva fram \nsurance ampany

Acknowlrdged by Repairer

Sanaturas

Ciata:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo 100607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18019271/AyfIn2
o Ty HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Dals: 90032050 “h”"“lmmmm
Code: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA TB86P Veh. Inspected SLR 41378
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D19006907MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 31102019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL HYERID c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU31253343 Colour BROMNZE
Odometer 230305 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHIGLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/10/2018 ]Inspection Date 0B/11/2019
Survey held at  N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PL
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-17 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLR 4137B
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition &
i/ Pt Workshop (S))  ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER cuT 762.70 762.70
2| REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LIR @523.00 NECESSARY 45,00 46.00
1|REAR RH AIR VENT NOT NECESSARY 30.30 "
1|REAR RH BUMPER REFLECTOR NOT NECESSARY 141.10
1|REAR RH BUMPER SIDE DEFORMED 195.00 185,00
1|REAR RH FENDER ARCH GARNISH cuT 195.00 195.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -274.02 -238.74
1,006.08 058,96
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|SET REAR RH FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 20.00
BO.00 50.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE, REINSTALL ELECTRICAL WIRING 50.00 50.00
HARMESS,CHECK LIGHTING AND REWIRE FOR PARKING
SENSOR.
TO REMOVE,REINSTALL ROOF TOP TRIM NOT MECESSARY 100.00 .
UPHOLSTERY.CUSHION SEAT, TRIM GARNISH, TRIM
LINER CARPET (TO FR).
TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE CHANGE BO0.00 350.00
BODYPARTS,REPAIR PORTION AND WHERE
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.
TO PROVIDE LABOUR,WORKMANSHIP TO CHANGE THE 480.00 350.00
ABOVE DAMAGED BODYPARTS,REPAIR,RE-CONSTRUCT
AND RE-ALIGN BODY STRUCTURE BODY ALIGNMENTS
AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.
TO APPLY ANTI-RUST CHEMICAL ON REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 40.00
REPLACED PAMEL.
1,270.00 750.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,446.08 4,758.96
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,400.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) y

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19019271/Ay13n2




Page Mo.2 of 2
Report Ref No. CS/FCI1901 8271/Ayf3n2

ADRIAM LING WAI PING
B.E ngAHSDE,AHIRTE.AHSAEqu.HATM
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely far the uss and benslit of the Client named cn the front page of this Repart.

of rospansibility whatsoayver, in conkact or torl, §8 sccepied bo any Lhard Darty wio may TREL




