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S1UREAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 VEL (065) 623635681 FAN @ (065 62564015

Y our ref: 18/19/19/VCOS5/022583 Date: 12/11/2019
Owur ref: CCHLPC19019267/Fha3

The Motor Claims Depuartment

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SBS 34620
We refer 1o the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 05/11/2019
at the premises of M/s LexBuild International Pre Lid - Woodlands and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estmate Amount : S% 12.188.49
Revised Estimate Amount (5% 880.00
"Check” Items Amount : §% -

Total (Including Check ltems) : 8% 880.00
Market Value : 8% - fest)
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8% - lest.)
Nett Value : S§ - (est)

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the e / 3}
Rear N/S Portion :

Comments/Present Status.
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2.0 days

Yours faithfully,

RAM
Licensed Appraiser



04" Nov 2019

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road

#]7-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199535

By email : mt_claimia/lonpac.com

Attn: Claims Department

ol

AL

.,
exBuild

Quotation No.: Q19-0PS-158]1

Dear Sir'Mdm
Estimated Cost _of Repair job for SBS3462G Accident on 23102019 @ YCK RD X

SERANGOON GDN WAY involving Y P5154B

Supply labour & material 1o replace 44T
I " Rear LHS comet b | day S880.00 S8R0.00 5
Supply skilled electrician to replace rear LHS LED :
2 indicator light, stop light, reverse light, Uday $880.00 $880.00 X
Supply skilled painter with paint material to spraypaint rear
3' | LHS commer Bumbiée 1 day S8R0.00 SE80.00 LA L
4 | N/S REAR CORNER BUMPER =" { 17 IPC | $1,42192 | $1421.92
5 | LED INDICATOR LIGHT w0 1 PC S208.16 S208.16
6 | LED STOPTAIL LIGHT wn I PC $208.16 S$208.16
7 | RED REFLECTOR LAMP xp+ | PC $8.13 $8.13
8 | LED REVERSE LIGHT « 1 PC $281.04 S281.04
9 | REAR A/C ACCESS DOOR (UPPER)%, 1+ | PC $2,344.65 $2,344.65
10 | REAR A/C ACCESS DOOR (LOWER) ¥~ I PC $5,076.43 $5,076.43
LKK Auto Consultants hence nolify Tedal: B330.0CTotal | §12,188.49
[“;“W“mfﬂﬁj;:j;w 7% GS.T.| § 853,19
:m"'““" SRS i (C Grand Total | S 13,041.68
» Thur party survey (8 00 @ Wonau Prejuncs” pass ’ MJ}
= Mo diegal ﬁmrc;mn = alicwed ¢ CosA [. L‘g_’_'f_-) .."_:,] A 'l.\'! & VAot
* Sappitmntany Snma) must e resurveped gnd . - - G
i nubeect 10 finad approsal o imswranse Company i~ . = é R m.)rf e
VevrSurow™ (7
Acknowiedged ty Ragarm v
:Ii'!‘u F - '..'#ﬁ‘a
',-(E;LILV :’(ﬁj A*} : {f‘:"“ i
LexBuild International Pte. Ltd. : | e
gwwmmw.mwmmmsﬂw 1), Singapore 5‘% (_:J_ *-:.’;}

Tel (65) 6458 3530, Fax (85) 6456 3353
Websile: www LexBuild.com. Emall: sales@LexBuild. com

ROC/CR/GST Reg No: 2000043701




Parasuram (LKK Auto)

From: Tien Yong Shun <yongshun@lexbuild.com>

Sent: Saturday, 30 November, 2019 1:38 PM

To: Parasuram (LKK Auto)

Cc LBI Claims

Subject: RE: GAS 3462G AP

Attachments: PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-58-44 jpg; PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-58-44 jpg;

PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-58-44 jpg; PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-58-44 jpg;
PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-58-44 jpg; PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-58-44 jpg;
PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-59-33 jpg; Surveyor offer.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Hiram,

Please close the case @ $880.00 with 2 working days

Best Regards,

Tien Yong Shun ( H Ml )

Assistant Operation Manager (Capabillity)
Mohile :+63 9020 6574

Emall :von ilexbuild.co

A
s LexBuild
LexBuild International Pte Led
2 Woodlands Seclor 1

#05-12 (Woodlands Spectrum 1)

']
Singapore 738068
Tel : +65 6456 3533 { k.
: +65 6456 3353 S -

Fax
, MRS EE =
Website : www.LexBuild.com oo, ST ‘Ff— R
a new train of thoughts
h'_*l Save & tree— please don®t print this e-mall uonles you really need in

From: Tien Yongshun [mailto:tienyongshun@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 Novernber, 2019 3:00 PM

To: LBl Operations <operations@lexbulld.com>; PARASURAM @Ikkauto.com
Subject: GAS 3462G AP



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

—_— S— —
From: KEMNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com=
Sent: Tuesday, 12 November, 2019 2:04 PM
To: Mel Kwan [LEKAuto)
Co MT Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto), Admin A
Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving YP51548 (O1) & 58534626 on 23/10/201%
- Oref: 18/19/19/VC05/022583 [External Confidential]
Attachments: MRMAD246451 PDF
Categories: MK

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Mei Kwan

Please see attachment for copy of our Insured’s GIA report and to proceed with direct
settlement if all is in order.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all @3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuo) <Meikwan @ lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 11:39 am

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@ lonpac.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@]lonpac.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a @ lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving YP5154B (O1) & SBS3462G on 23/10/2019 - Oref:
18/19/19/VC05/022583 [External Confidential )

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVEAS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 18/19/19/VC05/022583
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19019267 /Fha3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SBS 34626



At this juncture, we are unable to confirm liability since our Insured has yet to report
the accident.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all 0% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2019 5:16 pm

To: "Shirley Lim' <shirleylim @ Jexbuild. com>

Ce: LBI Claims <claims @ lexbuild.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim @ lonpac. com>

Subject: RE: Accident for SBS3462G (AC19/082) & YP5154B on 23/10/2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Shirley

We shall appoint LKK Auto Consultants for this PRS. They will contact Yong Shun
shortly.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all &% lonpac.com.sg

{onpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only

From: Shirley Lim <shirleylim @ lesbuild coms>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2019 3:42 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mit_clum @ lonpac.com>

Ce: LBI Claims <clonms @ lexbuild com>

Subject: RE: Accident for SBS3462G (AC19/082) & YP5154B on 23/10/2019

Amended emaml title,



Operation Admin Execulive
Mahile  +65 Us]S 28U
Emall  : shigleylim @ lesbuilid com

E “ -
* LexBuild
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2 Woodiands Sector 1
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Singapora 738068 '(

Tel . +B5 6456 3533
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300 BEACH ROAD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 198555

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408633
TEL. B256 2581 FAX: B258 4315
Reg. Mo: 180607198R GST Reg No 18-8607188-R

CC4/LPC1B018267/Fhadn2

LT

Ref :
Date : 20-02-2020

S5BS 3462G

¥P 51548

Insured Veh .

Policy No. Z18VC05001203 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18M19/18/VCO05/022583 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KENNY 29M10/2018

Make & Model

VOLVO BETL

Engine No. HIDDEN 2015

Chassis No. YVIS4POZXFAIT2924 Colour GREEMN

Odometer 274280 Stearing IN ORDER

Brakes N ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR

Size Make Balance
RJ/H Front Tyre |275/70 R22.5 CONTINENTAL 4 mm
L/H Front Tyre |275/70R225 CONTINENTAL 4 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |275/70 R22.5 (D) CONTINENTAL 44 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [27570R225 (D) 4/4 mm

[THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT
DAMAGES SEE DETALLS.

Accident Date

CONTINENTAL

THE REAR PORTION.

23norzoe

Survey held at

TA)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
[B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR

LEXBUILD INTERNATICONAL PTE LTD

2 WODDLANDS SECTOR 1 #05-12
(WOODLANDS SPECTRUM 1)
SINGAPORE 738088

REPAIR:




’ ” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL B258 3581 FAX: B256 43115

Reg. Mo 109607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607108-R Page Mo 1ol 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SBS 3462G

1|N/S REAR CORNER BLUMPER (SN} TO REPAIR SEE 1421892 -
LABOUR
1|LED INDICATOR LIGHT (SN} NOT NECESSARY 208.16 -
1|LED STOPITAIL LIGHT {SN) MNOT NECESSARY 208.16 -
1|RED REFLECTOR LAMP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 813 -
1|LED REVERSE LIGHT (SN) MNOT NECESSARY 281.04 £
1|REAR A/C ACCESS DOOR (UPPER)(SN) MNOT NECESSARY 2,344 65 -
1|REAR AJC ACCESS DOOR (LOWER)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 5,076.43 =
9,548 49 -
LABOUR
SUPPLY LABOUR & MATERIAL TO REPLACE-REAR LHS B80.00 440.00
CORNER BUMPER.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF N/S
REAR CORNER BUMPER.
SUPPLY SKILLED ELECTRICIAN TO REPLACE REAR LHS |NOT NECESSARY 880.00 .
LED INDICATOR LIGHT STOP LIGHT REVERSE LIGHT.
SUPPLY SKILLED PAINTER WITH PAINT MATERIAL TO 880.00 440.00
SPRAYPAINT REAR LHS CORNER BUMPER,
2,640.00 880.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,188.40 880.00

Je e

PARASURAM S5/0 SHANMUGAM HO LEONG CHUAMN
Asat. Automotive Assessor Automotive ASsessor

DISCLAIMER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solely fof the uss and benafll of the Clisnt named on the fromt pags ol this Report.

Basart. in witels ar n sen, dess se i his o ber own .



