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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 11:02 AM

To: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore); Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore); Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore); 

Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore); Goh Edmund (VGS - SG/Singapore)

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z (finalisation)

Dear Germaine, 

 

Confirm final figure at S$51,109.70 before excess $1500 and GST. 

 

32 working days 

 

Please submit all discharge voucher and tax invoice directly to MSIG. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: mailto:%20sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 7:57 PM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Kong Charmaine 

(VGS - SG/Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>; Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; 

Goh Edmund (VGS - SG/Singapore) <edmund.goh@vw.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z (finalisation) 

 

Dear Denis  

 

Pls see attached finalisation  

 

32 WORKING DAYS  

 

PLs revert  

 

*photo will split into several email  

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Germaine Ong 

Body and Paint Department  

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd 

17 Tuas ave 9 

Singapore 639197 

 

Hp: +6592361588 

mailto:germane.ong@vw.com.sg 
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http://www.vw.com.sg/ 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore)  

Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 2:32 PM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <mailto:sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z 

 

Dear Denise  

 

The rear fender just arrive not long ago,  

 

We have cut and weld, currently doing the spray painting work  

 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Germaine Ong 

Body and Paint Department  

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd 

17 Tuas ave 9 

Singapore 639197 

 

Hp: +6592361588 

mailto:germane.ong@vw.com.sg 

http://www.vw.com.sg/ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Internal 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 2:06 PM 

To: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <mailto:Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) 

<mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <mailto:sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z 

 

Dear Germaine, 

 

Can update me the vehicle current repair status? 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: mailto:%20sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 3:01 PM 

To: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <mailto:Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) 

<mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <mailto:sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z 

 

Dear Germaine, 

 

Please see marking. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: mailto:%20sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <mailto:Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 2:47 PM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <mailto:sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z 

 

Dear Denise  

 

Pls see attached revise  

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Germaine Ong 

Body and Paint Department  

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd 

17 Tuas ave 9 

Singapore 639197 

 

Hp: +6592361588 

mailto:germane.ong@vw.com.sg 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.vw.com.sg%2F&data=02%7C01%7C%7C

79c047671575425e2c1008d7b11404c8%7C0f6f68be4ef2465a986beb9a250d9789%7C0%7C0%7C637172571851006

977&sdata=p%2BaPLwcKDCma9pgiNCltO9%2FFjSt2AQLjf0UOxhz%2BHkA%3D&reserved=0 

 

 

 

 

 

Internal 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 2:43 PM 

To: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <mailto:Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) 

<mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: SUR <mailto:sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [EXT] RE: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z 

 

Dear Germaine,  

 

Please look at the sub-total of the supplementary list, there is something wrong?  

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: mailto:%20sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <mailto:Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 3:42 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <mailto:sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SUPPLEMENTARY SCZ3260Z 

 

Dear Rasul  

 

Please see attached supplementary  

 

Please revert 

 

We will repair repair limit at $52,500 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Germaine Ong 

Body and Paint Department  

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd 

17 Tuas ave 9 

Singapore 639197 

 

Hp: +6592361588 

mailto:germane.ong@vw.com.sg 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.vw.com.sg%2F&data=02%7C01%7C%7C

79c047671575425e2c1008d7b11404c8%7C0f6f68be4ef2465a986beb9a250d9789%7C0%7C0%7C637172571851011

962&sdata=9fIqdueeI7y4Y2qtfpqJXqDHsQ1nSWKMufxRqbH6LgY%3D&reserved=0 

 

 

 

 

 

Internal 


