Hsiao TonE (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 21 February 2020 10:05 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: New message for service request 144325, vehicle number SJL8378B
21/2/20 9:56 AM *** MessageHi Hsiao Tong Thank you for your explanation. However, is still an the

high side in view of the age of the veh. Anyway to reduce further?-VO - OH Vale

From: vale.oh@axa.com.sg <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 February, 2020 9:58 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 144325, vehicle number SIL83788

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number 59M024Z1,

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whale or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



202472020

«

hitps./ivp.smartclaims.axa.com. sglclaim-portalhimlfindex-vendor-service-requests_himig/service-requestsiview-message/?service RequestNumbe . ..

Claim Portal

RE: Re:RE: Re:<TP - Mandate IA %I{l%léACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLU 1203Y(OI) SILS 7
25/10/2019]

Type
@ Question

Message
Hi Vale, we would like to seek your mandate at $8,402.00(all-in). The breakdown is as follows: - 1)Cost of
Repair: $7,300.00 + 2.)Loss of Use ({11days x $100.00): $1,100.00 + 3). LTA/GIA Search Fee: $2.00 = TOTAL:
$8,402.00. For your approval/ instruction please. Hsiao Tong - 24 Feb 2020

eply

m



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February 2020 10:28 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 144325, vehicle number SJL83788

26/2/20 8:42 AM *** MessageHi Hsiao Tiong On your marked estimate, item 33-pls get your Surveyor to
recommend repaired instead of replaced, tks-VO - OH Vale J,
'T'__-_-._” Spest T '-1' v |
-----0riginal Message-——-- o
From: vale.oh@axa.com.sg <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 February, 2020 8:43 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 144325, vehicle number SJLE37EB

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number 59M02471.

Please click here https:ﬁvp.smartclaims.axa,cnm.sgfclaim-partalf to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



352020

«

https/ivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portalfhtmif ndex-vendor-service-requests. himi#service-requestsiview-messaga/TserviceRequesthumbe. ..

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} - Menu

RE: Re:RE: Re:RE: Re:<TP - Mandate IA> - S9M0247|
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 1203Y(OI) & SJL 8378B(TP)
N 25/10/2019]

Type
@ Question

Message
Hi Vale, we would like to seek your mandate at $8,152.00(all-in). The breakdown is as follows: - 1)Cost of
Repair: $7,050.00 + 2.)Loss of Use (11days x $100.00): $1,100.00 + 3). LTA/GIA Search Fee: $2.00 = TOTAL:

$8,152.00. For your approval/ instruction please. Hsiao Tong - 05 March 2020
Reply

1M



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 10:45 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 144325, vehicle number S)L83788
5/3/20 4:20 PM *** MessageHi Hsiao Tong Pls proceed, tks-VO - OH Vale

-----Original Message-—-

From: vale.oh@axa.com.sg <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 5 March, 2020 4:22 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 144325, vehicle number 5JLE378B

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9M024Z1.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 March 2020 10:50 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: Re: SIL83788 CLAIMING SLU1203Y DOA 25.10.15 SM *** LKK REF:
CC4/A5M19019207 /Apa3

Without Prejudice
Hi Hsiao Tong
We accept your offer as 8,150, please send us the discharge voucher for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 6741 7276

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 12, 2020 8:19 AM

To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJL8378B CLAIMING S5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *** LKK REF: CC4/A5M19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $8,150.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between pa rties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by gither party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Repards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkautp.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

sent: Monday, 2 March 2020 12:41 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: Re: SILB378B CLAIMING SLU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice
Hi Hsiao Tong

Please kindly update us the status,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 6741 7276

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 11:49 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht |kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SILE37E8B CLAIMING 5LU12Z03Y DOA 25.10.19 5M *** LKK REF: CC4I&SM1QG192{J?IA|:133

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder
Hi Hsiao Tong

Please kindly advise your offer and revert for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
Blk C #01-43



Singapore 417883
Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: sm automotive <sm automotive @hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 12:48 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com=>

Subject: Re: 5JL8378B CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *** LKK REF: CEIASMIBUIQID?IA[:E:E.

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder

Hi Hsiao Tong

Please kindly advise your offer and revert for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel- 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: sm automotive <sm automotive@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 9:53 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SILE378B CLAIMING SLU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *** LKK REF: CC4/A5M19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice
Hi Hsiao Tong

Please kindly advise your offer and revert for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: sm automotive <sm automotive@hotmail.com=>
Sent: Friday, January 10, 2020 10:51 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SILB378B CLAIMING SLU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM =*= | KK REF: CC4/A5M19019207/Apa3



Without Prejudice

Hi Hsiao Tong

Please kindly advise your offer and revert for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

Erom: sm automotive <sm automotive @hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, December 27, 2019 10:12 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SILB378B CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM +%% | kK REF: CC4/ASM19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice
Hi Hsiao Tong
Please kindly advise your offer and revert for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 6741 7276

From: sm automotive <sm automotive@hotmail.com>

sent: Friday, December 13, 2019 10:58 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SILB378B CLAIMING SLU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM #*% | KK REF: CC4/ASM19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Hi Hsiao Tong

Contents noted with thanks.
Hope to hear from you soon.

Regards,



Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, December 13, 2019 10:56 AM
To: sm automotive <sm automotive @hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SILE3T8B CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *** LKK REF: cca/AasM 19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We are seeking mandate from AXA. However claim officer had some enquiry on the repair costs and parts price.
We will review and update accordingly.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties reserting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 20207

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: sm automotive <sm automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2019 9:29 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SJLR3I78B CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *** LKK REF: CC4;'A5M‘19D192[}?IA|333

Without Prejudice
Hi Hsiao Tong

Please kindly advise your offer and revert for close case,thanks.



Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave b

Blk C#01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 6741 7276

Erom: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, December 6, 2019 12:15 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 5IL8378B CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 5M ##* | k¥ REF: CC4/A5SM19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Hi Hsiao Tong

Contents noted with thanks.

Enclosed after repair photo as per your reguest.

Hope to hear from you soon for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave b

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, December 6, 2019 12:07 PM

To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 5IL8378B CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 5M *** LKK REF: Cﬁd{A5M1BD‘1920HAp33

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We are seeking mandate from AXA.

Kindly provide after repair photos for SIL8378B for our further action.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatscever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

]



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 9:26 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 5JL8378B CLAIMING SLU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *+#% | KK REF: CC4/ASM19019207/Apa3

Without Prejudice
Hi Hsiao Tong
Please kindly advise your offer and revert for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 6741 7276

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com=>
Sent: Friday, November 29, 2019 10:09 AM
To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 5JL8378B CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 SM *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19019207/Apa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly assist.



To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sm automotive <sm automotive@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 29 November, 2019 9:54 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: SILE37EB CLAIMING 5LU1203Y DOA 25.10.19 5M

*Without Prejudice®
Dear Motor Claims Department,

Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference.
Originals have been posted out.

Please kindly advise officer in charge and hope to receive offer soon.
Thank you.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276



| SM AUTOMOTIVE

QOur Ref : SJLB3TEB Block 1Kaki Bukit Avenue 8
#0143
g Singapore 417883
Your Ref :5LU1203Y Tel (65) 6747 9241

Fax (65) GT417276
Date - 28™ November 2018

Axa Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way

#24-01AXATower

Singapore 068811

Dear Sirs,

RE : Accident Involving SJL8378B & SLU1203Y ON 25.10.2019 Along PIE(JURONG) BEFORE
CTE/SLE At 22:10HRS

Ve are instructed .bg.r LI PENG to claim damages and losses against you in connection with the above-
captioned road traffic accident which our client's vehicle SJLB378B was damaged by vehicle SLU1203Y

driven by your insured at the material time.

We are instructed that the said accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and/or
management of the vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client has
been put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows :-

1) Repair Costs 3 7.500.00
2) Loss of Use for 11 days 3 1,320.00
3) LTAFee 5 2.00
3 8.822.00

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed -

1) Accident report of our client

2) Invoice

3 LTA Search

Please let us have your cheque for the sum of _§ 8,822.00 made payable to us, SM AUTOMOTIVE in the
next 14 days

Yours faithfully,

SM AUTOMOTIVE



HOCK L, 1 Rakl SUKIT AveEnuUe

Email: SM_AUTOMO

Tel: (65) 6747 92

TAX INVOICE

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd Invoice No 5MP1911-0096
8 Shenton Way, Date 28-Nov-19
#B1-01,
Singapore 068811 Date of Accident 25-Oct-19
Vehicle No. 5JL8378B
Client: LI PENG Model Type Toyota Camry
Descriptions Amount
Lump Sum Repair Cost 7,500.00
] Total | 7,500.00

(SGD) Dollars: SEVEN THOUSAND AND FIVE HUNDRED ONLY




¥y 7L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

A~ — 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CC4/ASM19019207/Apa3s2
R TONERSINGAFORE 0001 owe: ooz | A
ATTN: VALE OH Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLU 1203Y Veh. Inspected SJL B3T8R
Policy No. GA409822 Cowverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SoMO24Z| Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  VALE OH Assign Date 29/10/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA CAMRY c.c 1998
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. MRO53BK4107036526 Colour GREY
Odometer 5 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/80 R16 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 25/10/2019 Inspection Date 29/10/2019
Survey held at SM AUTOMOTIVE
BLK C, 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-43 SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|E$TIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 11 Working Days




N4 ’4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Adl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 5256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-9607188-R Page No.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJL 8378B
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
124 = Workshop ()| ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED G80.20 980.20
2|REAR BOOT LID HINGE @ $131.75 (CONSISTENT) MNECESSARY 263.50 -
1|REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY TEA10 76.10
1|REAR BOOT LID CAMRY LOGO (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 74.00 74.00
1|REAR BOOT LID 2.0 LOGO (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 53.20 53.20
1|REAR BOOT LID CENTRE CHROME MOULDING MOT NECESSARY 297.20 -
(COMNSISTENT)
4|REAR BOOT LID CENTRE CHROME MOULDING CLIP @ NOT NECESSARY 26.00 -
$6.50 (CONSISTENT)
1|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
2|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE LAMP @ $83.10 NOT NECESSARY 166.20 -
(CONSISTENT)
2|REAR BOOT LID SIDE REFLECTOR @ $387.00 0fs CRACKED 774,00 387.00
{CONSISTENT)
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK ASSY (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 42930 42930
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER RUBBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 182.90 -
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 561.20 -
§|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @ $6.50 NOT NECESSARY 52.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
2|REAR TAIL LAMP @ $474.85 (CONSISTENT) 0/S CRACKED 24970 474 B5
4|REAR TAIL LAMP CLIP @ £8.00 (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 32.00 16.00
2|REAR TAIL LAMP LOWER BRACKET @ $43.75 NOT NECESSARY 87.50 -
(COMNSISTENT)
1|REAR R/H TAIL LAMP PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 193.20 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER (COMNSISTENT) DEFORMED 546.20 546,20
8|REAR BUMPER CLIP @3$5.50 (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 52.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $131.35 NECESSARY 26270 262,70
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR R/H BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR (CONSISTENT) cuT 83.10 83.10
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT 531.50 361.00
1|REAR R/H BUMFPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET WNOT NECESSARY 121,10 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR R/H BUMPER MUD SHIELD (COMNSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 8310 -

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM15018207/Apads2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ Chop [;}] ‘E‘;ﬂ
1|REAR R/H FENDER (COMSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 981.45 -
LABOUR
1|REAR R/H FENDER AIR DUCT (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 112.00 -
1|REAR R/H FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD (CONSISTENT) |[NOT NECESSARY 444.30 :
8|REAR R/H FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @ $6.50  |[NOT NECESSARY 52.00 .
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR END PANEL (CONSISTENT) DENTED 659.25 659 25
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 381.40 381.40
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 708.10 ;
LABOUR
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER (CONSISTENT) |TORN 281.90 281.90
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP FOAM (CONSISTENT)  |[NOT NECESSARY 268.20 .
1|REAR R/H SPARE TYRE SIDE PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 182.30 =
LABOUR
1|REAR EXHALST (CONSISTENT) BENT 981.85 891.00
1|REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 160.00 .
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING @ $65.90 (CONSISTENT)  |[NOT NECESSARY 131.80
1|REAR CENTER EXHAUST (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,081.20 989.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 181.25 :
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEAL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 95.00 »
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -3,409.98 -1,744.05
10,229.92 5232 15
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) (CONSISTENT) |DAMAGED 380.00 200.00
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL & END PANEL SEALANT (SN) |[NECESSARY 45000 250.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|GUM (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 .
880.00 450.00
LABOQUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT GUSHION. 280.00 200.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 60.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEMN NOT NECESSARY 120.00 ;
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR EXHAUST. 280.00 200.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 100.00 30.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19019207/Apa3s2
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Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {E}] {Sj}
TOWING FEE. 100.00 50.00
TUFF KOTE. 150.00 100.00
PAMNEL BEATING. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1.800.00 1.400.00

R/H TAIL LAMP PANEL, REAR R/H FENDER, REAR SPARE
TYRE PANEL AND REAR R/H SPARE TYRE SIDE PANEL.

SPRAY PAINTING. 1,800.00 1,100.00

4,730.00 3.150.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,839.92 8,832.15
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 7,050.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18019207/Apa3s2
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