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g@ HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
Al 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1, SINGAPORE 729332

Tel: (65) 6661 9688 Fox: (65) 6661 9699 Email: info@huahong.com.sg

Estimate Repair List
QUOT201911-000012

11 November 2019
HHTPCLAIMS19-202

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET, #04-00 / #05-00

IOB BUILDING

SINGAPORE 049711

Attn: Motor Claims Department
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA5461K & SHA7555U ON 28/10/2019 ALONG BUONA VISTA DRIVE
AT ABOUT 0830 HOURS

Insured :  HUAHONG PTE LTD

Vehicle Registration No. : SMAS5461K

Vehicle Make : HONDA

Vehicle Model :  FREED HYBRID 1.5G AUTO

Vehicle Chassis No. :  GBT1066576

Policy No. :  5087272209-03

Date of Accident : 28/10/2019 Type of Claim: Third Party

S/N  Quantity Description Unit Price S Amount S$

1 1 Rear Bumper 7 nn $ 1,050.60

2 10 Rear BumperClip .~ peC $ 390 § 39.00 3o

3 |2 Rear Bumper Retainer (LH/RH) .~ NtC $ 2490 %  49.80 2440

B 2  Rear Bumper Reflector (LH/RH) % syc $ 4280 9% 85.60X

5 1 RearTailgate .~ pP $ 1,100.80 ./

6 1 Rear Tailgate Lock .~ PR $ 15180~

7 1 Rear Tailgate Logo (FREED) -~ Nt¢ $ 5500

8 1 Rear Tailgate Logo (HYBRID) .~ N $ 75.00 /

9 1 Rear Tailgate Chrome Garnish x (v ¢ $ 320.30X

10 1 Rear Emblem /. N€c $ 27.40 7

1 1 Rear Tailgate Weather Strip .~ g /1. $ 168.00.~

12 1 Rear Windscreen Moulding - Ne¢. $ 151307

13 1 RearEndPanel -~ pn. $ 62370 7

14 1 Rear End Panel Top Gamish .~ R $ 115007

15 1 Rear Reverse Lamp (LH) % ¢ve. $ 360.7(
s 4300 4570c

Less20% $ 87480 - 2¢%

$§ 349920 2,85%,§

16 1 Reverse Sensor < (hort NETT $ 20000~ Y0

17 1 Sealant ~ Ntc NETT $ 40.00 ~

To dismantle, cut & weld rear end panel, change rear bumper, rear tailgate, rear $ 900.00 700

LH reverse lamp, knocking & pull straight rear tyre floor panel and all area
affected by accident

To perform wire checking $ 20.00 /M

CONTINUE NEXT PAGE
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f" HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1, SINGAPORE 729332
Tel: (65) 4561 9688 Fox: (65) 6641 9699 Email: info@huahong.com.sg

Estimate Repair List

11 November 2019 QUOT201911-000012
HHTPCLAIMS19-202

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA5461K & SHA7555U ON 28/10/2019 ALONG BUONA VISTA DRIVE
AT ABOUT 0830 HOURS
Estimate Repair List for vehicle SMA5461K - HONDA FREED HYBRID 1.5G AUTO

S/N Quantity Description Unit Price 8§  Amount S$

To dismantle & refit rear windscreen $  100.00” Nec
To dismantle & transfer rear tailgate mechanism and fitting to new tailgate $ 60.00 “Nee
To dismantle & refit rear bumper sensor $ 60.00Nec
To spray rear tailgate, rear bumper, rear panel and rear tyre floor panel 3 900.00 {00

§ 577920 |51
7%GST § 40454

Total $ 6,183.74

P@r/hr dtbg - 6d¢\ty

P=255¢.§
’rf' WH"H’ Pn].,dr.«. N = 24%0
L =1l,5¢0
Sun fin / Sunpin@ IKKauto,tom /5€6] 2627 ___——Lr
Ly ey Fapar 1P e, -
2 Spr te
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey before/afier spray painting
« To display damaged par(s) during resurvey
« Parts prices are subject 10 confirmation

« Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis
« No illegal modification(s) s allowed
« Supplementary ftem(s) must be resurveyed and

is subject o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:
1'.
\
Authorised by Claims Dept
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Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 March, 2020 10:01 AM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Ce claims@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SMA 5461 K - DOA: 28/10/2019
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Sun Pin,

COR @ $4,638.80 b4 GST - Confirm
Thanks.

Regards

James Tan

Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

| ~)
Ei @

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 6:29 pm

To: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SMA 5461 K - DOA: 28/10/2019

Hi James,

Kindly refer the finalize amount is $4,638.8. Repair day 6 days. (P/P, before gst).
If agree please update

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: James Tan |mailto:]'ames@huahong.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March, 2020 11:32 AM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SMA 5461 K - DOA: 28/10/2019

Dear Sun Pin,

Please assist to finalize the case asap.



