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Our Ref: CC6/AIG19019162/Ahb3               

 

 

01 NOVEMBER 2019        

 

 

QUEK BOON HIONG KENNETH    By Post & By Email 

28 THOMSON TERRACE 

SINGAPORE 574559 

 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJX 2848M AND SGD 9312L ON 28/10/2019  

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte 

Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 

Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner 

of SGD 9312L against your motor insurance policy. 

  

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down 

against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the 

Third Party. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh  

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  

            (Motor Claims Dept) 

 kq@kenquek.sg   

 (Email) 

  

 





4/29/2020 Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=70673744&CFTOKEN=590552e379d80af3-A3… 1/1

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SGD9312L (9003415352SG)
[SJX2848M]

TP
JONATHAN LONG JUNWEI

Oct 28 2019 12:00PM
[QUEK BOON HIONG KENNETH]

MG Solution Pte Ltd

From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 13/04/2020 10:18 AM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$6299.45) - SGD9312L - Claim Handler: MdNoor, Norsiah

Approved:6299.45.
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: May 4, 2020 10:54 AM
To: MG Solution
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGD 9312L - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJX 2848M AND SGD 9312L 

ON 28/10/2019 - LKK REF CC6/AIG19019162/Ahb3
Attachments: DV.PDF

Without Prejudice 

Dear Ms Wong, 

We would like to accept the counter offer as proposed.  

Kindly signed the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 

Thanks 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]  
Sent: April 30, 2020 2:55 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGD 9312L - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJX 2848M AND SGD 9312L ON 28/10/2019 - LKK REF 
CC6/AIG19019162/Ahb3 
 
Your Ref: CC6/AIG19019162/Ahb3 (SJX2848M) 
Our Ref: SGD9312L 
  
Dear Vic, 
 
We refer to below email, we would like to counter propose as per below: 
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Repair cost               $5992.00 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed 
LOU                            $  300.00 (3 days x $100) - Request 
LTA Search                $      7.45 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed 
Total                          $6299.45 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Ms Wong 
MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre 
#02-03B Singapore 415933 
Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376 
 
 
 
On Thu, Apr 30, 2020 at 2:44 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $6,200.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 13 April, 2020 4:38 PM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGD 9312L - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJX 2848M AND SGD 9312L ON 28/10/2019 - LKK 
REF CC6/AIG19019162/Ahb3 

  

Your Ref: CC6/AIG19019162/Ahb3 (SJX2848M) 
Our Ref: SGD9312L 

  

Dear Vic, 

  

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on 09/03/2020. 

We have not receive any offer from your side.  

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Ms Wong 

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 




