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‘ ' §7 Auto
- o o Consultants
s Fre Lid Company Registration No. 199607 108R

1 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 FAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL FAR B, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (0631 62503500 FAX @ 1163) Gl504315

Your Ref: D19006843MESH
Our ref: CS/FCI19019157/Uvi3 DATE:26/12/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO SFW 59P

We thank for your instruction on 30/10/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
vehicle on_30/10/2019 at the premises of M/s ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 §822,764.65

Revised Estimate Amount + 8££7.900.00 (LUMP 5UM)
"Check" Items Amount 1 858

Market Value : 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8%

Nett Value L

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
n/s rear portion. The undercarriage

affected due to collision

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



H H MS First Capital Insurance Limited oReg ke 1950001060 G5T Reg Ho H2-000L616-9
MS 0 F".Stca plta I 6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapode D4B5EQ

Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Faw (B5) 6222 3547

Clalms & Moter Usderwiiting Bept: 35 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0BBATY
Tel: (BS) 6507 3848 Fax (R5) 6507 3849
wiwwi msfirsteapital.comosg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 29-10-2019 Our Ref No. D19006843MFSH
Accident Date 25-10-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC8566X Third Party Vehicle. SFW539P
Survey Location 130 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD#0B-1339
Contact Person. ELIN CAl
Contact No. 0f 24507320 Fax No. O
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appeintaa LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Z0OM AUTOWERKS PTE

Cc : Worksho Attention. NIL
BT oreNIaR LTD

Cc : TP Solicitor A TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 8:46 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims'; SUR

Cc: ‘Karen Tan'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006843MFSH/1-5FW 58P
Attachments: SFW 59P PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SFW 59P
Date of survey: 30/10/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 7 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408333)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 10:31 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006843MFSH/1-5FW 59P

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SFW 59P on 30/10/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2019 1:08 PM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauta.com>; SUR
<suri@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006843MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933])

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October, 2019 12:57 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006843MF5SH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 10:31 AM

Te: 'CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc: 'Karen Tan'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006843MF5SH/1-5FW 59P
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SFW 59P on 30/10/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2019 1:08 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006843MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: fas6-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October, 2019 12:57 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006843M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



11/6/2019 Used Audi Q5 Car for Sale in Singapore, Sanctuary Mator - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM

WNew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory

Login  Sign up

Products Insurance Articles Forum

Bidded Car Plate Number for sale

Looking for auspicious numbers?
Browse our list of hottest bidded car plate numbers for sale.

audi g5 iPn'v.:e Range

Home » Used Cars » Sanctuary Motor » Ausd: Q5 2,04 TFS]

Audi Q5 2.0A TFSI

v [Depreciation ¥ | [2010 v |vehiceType Y| N

Overview Financial Insurance Accessories Similar
Price %$28,000
Depreciation M.A. Reg Date
Mileage 183,500 km {19.2k fyr) Manufactured
Road Tax 41,194 fyr Transmission
Dereg Value $19,980 as of today (change) oMY
COE £21,899 ARF
Engine Cap 1,984 cc Power
Curb Weight 1,740 kg Mo. of Owners

Type of Vehicle SUV

Features

2L 4. Cylinders Turbocharged Engine, 207Bhp With 350Nm Of Torque, 7 Speed Gearbox, AWD. View specs of the

Audi Q5 (2009-2017)

Accessories

audi Infotainment System, 19" Sports Rims, Sunroof, Reverse Camera.

Description
Ideal For 10 Years COE Renewal, Please Call In Advance.

Research Photos Map

21-Apr-2010
(5mths 14days COE left)

2010

Auto

£37,968

£37,568

155.0 kW (207 bhp)

4

Shortlst Compsara
Repart Error More Actior
Soller Information
Company Sanctuary M

» dealer's price
» 31 vehs sobd

Category
PARF Car Address 22 Jalan Pari B
Search cars ne
Status Office No (4568382 / &
Available
Contact Person(s) Roy
Rich
Resources
tion
Compare ? Request to have this car evaluated professionally. Find out maore

hitps:/iwww.sgcarmart. com/used_cars/info.php?ID=8425218DL=1 269

143



11/6/2014

> Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |1D Type:

Owner |D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
658E

SFWS59P

Mo

06 Nov 2019
AUDI
Q520TFSIA
Black

2009
CDNO74298

WAUZZZBR6AA038233

155.0 kW (207 bhp)
$£38,620.00

05 Apr 2010

05 Apr 2010

3

$38,620.00

Yes
04 Apr 2020
$19,310.00 -

04 Apr 2020

E - Open Category
10

$19,889.00
$789.00
$20,099.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Nov 2019

OK

https:a'-'-.rrl.Ila.guv.sgn’lm.fvrh'adiumenquireReDateEyF‘ublicEernraDeregmput?FUNCTIGN_ID= FO304008TT

"



—~ N ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD
s v, . (OB 130 Bedok Reservoir Road, Eunos Sprin,
= s E=E£ Eieeee *.08-1339 Singapore 47013
e B EEVE Tel: 9450 792
1 3Tt A T L p = roomautowerks@gmail.col
AUTOWERKS ot e
Vehicle Number : SFWSOP M’V
Model : AUDI Q5 2.0 TFSI 3 g/ 10 r.-"f. v, ,é{ Lol /{
b, / [em it /™
Damaged Area: (Front Left Portion Damaged) ?‘ :\Z.‘.-/( A "(JI 92 . :
}} :_E | —
Repairer Estimation Cost of Repair : ~ 'le'i ’j"" -,:2, j""rf"@-rfl,r\ ,
Supplementary may be included during the cost of repair ,:fuﬁ,.?:ff
Parts / Material : Quantity
1 Front Bumper f{{?il 5 @3 2,237.00,__—
2 Front Bumper Attachment Fixing Parts s o T 256.00
3 Front Bumper Lower Spoiler gry-ev 5 D 640.00—
4  Front Bumper Closing Elements 5 A 180,00
5 Front Bumper Securing Strip S64.00 X 2pcs s -1 -1  128.00
&  Front Bumper Air-Guide Grille L7020 $307.00%2Pcs  $ ~7S Pel 61400 ;5 ¢
7 Front Bumper Air-Guide Grille Section 542,00 X 2pes 5 41 Tga00 ¥
8  Front Bumper Angle Sensor /00 5259800 X dpcs 5”2(1 Froa 1,19200, 9,
9  Front Bumper Angle Sensor Ring Set $14.00 X 4pcs 5 “ 1 56.00
10  Front Bumper Sensar Harness 5 1 556.00 X
11  Front Bumper Hailogen Foglamp 25747272 $298.00 X 2pcs ) M"’g (L. 596.00 (A ¢,
12 Front Bumper Foam s v F 7197.00 X
13 Front Bumper Reinforcement g A 702.00 ¢
14 Front Fender LH s Baf/%c ogg00 -
15  Front Fender LH Attachment Fixing Parts § 1A 58.00
16  Front Fender Fender Bracket $47.00 X 2pcs ] 1 94,00 o
17  Front Fender Centre Bracket $43.00 X 2pcs 5 #1 1 g6.00 *
18  Front Fender Pop Riverts 12pes Each Sides $35.00 X 2sets AN 70.00 X
19 Front Wheel Housing Liner $2B1.00% 2pes & Fora 5600, —
20  Front Wheel Housing Attachment Fixing Parts 5 A -1 89.00
21 Mounting For Main Headlight Beam $115.00% 2pcs S A - ESD.DD){
22 Headlamp Assy for Gas Discharge Lamp 24600 ¥ 2- = £vi0 $2,614.00X2pes  $ Cnc 5.228.00 ——
23 Headlamp Lift Cylinder Washgier System $195.00%2pcs 5 390,00 X
24 Headlamp Washer Jet $298.00 X 2pcs SafSene  59600p5 ¢
25  Radiator Grille Assy [ 0.0 $ ®Aao 175000
26  Radiator Grille Upper Garnish 5 AN 19600 S
27 Lock Carrier 5 CNe  891.00 —
Parts: % 18,647.00
LessParts5%: § /107 932.35
Total Parts : § 17,714.65
Special Met Items :
Front Number Plate With Garnish ¢ (g 80.00 / 4/
Front LH Aluminium Rim S 1,185.00 oA
Radiator Coolant 5 AA 85.00
Total 5/N Parts: & 1,350.00
% G
(o c¢-¥)



Labour :

To Remove & Renew Front Affected Accident Areas
To Putty, Spray Paint on Front Affected Accident Areas
To Check & Re-Connect all electrical wiring

To Conduct AC Leakage Test & Top Up AC Gas

To Conduct All Wheel Alignment

To Re-Programme & Reset Diagnostic

To Rust Proof aAffected Areas

TOTAL PARTS : 5 17,714.65
TOTAL SPECIAL NET ITEM : 5 1,350.00
TOTAL LABOUR : 5 3,700.00
TOTAL REPAIR COST : 5 22,764.65

WE A WS W U W W

1,50000 &7
1,500.00 /&0
50.00 27
150.00 /£ O
150.00 ¢/
A7 250.00 A
441 100.00 *

Total Labour: %

3,700.00

126 ¢f £f



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Autemobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref : CS/FCI8019157/Uvf3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date : 06-01-2020 NMI“”“”MN
Code: FCI2
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 8566X Veh. Inspected SFW 59P
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D12006843MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 30/10/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDI QS5 (A) c.c 1984
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. WALUZZZ8REAADIB233 Colour BLACK
Odometer 148083 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
General elaleln]
N ' Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |255/50 R13 FALKEN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |255/50 R19 FALKEM & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |255/50 R19 FALKEM & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |255/50 R19 FALKEN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION. THE UNDERCARRIAGE AFFECTED
DUE TGO COLLISION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/10/2018 Inspection Date 30/10/2019
Survey held at  BLK 15 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #01/53 BARTLEY BIZ #01-53
Repairer ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTELTD
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: T Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFW 59P

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg, Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607 198-R

Page Mo.:1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ST 8 ﬁl}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 2,237.00 1,669.22
1|FRONT BUMPER ATTACHMENT FIXING PARTS NOT NECESSARY 256.00 .
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER SPOILER DISTORTED §40.00 629.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENTS NOT NECESSARY 180.00 L
2| ERONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP @$64.00 MOT NECESSARY 128.00 -
2|FRONT BUMPER AIR-GUIDE GRILLE @$307.00 N/S DISTORTED 614.00 215.00
2|FRONT BUMPER AIR-GUIDE GRILLE SECTION @$42.00 |NOT NECESSARY 84.00 :
4|FRONT BUMPER ANGLE SENSOR @$298.00 N/S TORN (1 PC 1,192.00 185.00
ONLY)
4|SET FRONT BUMPER ANGLE SENSOR RING @$14.00  |NOT NECESSARY 56.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SENSOR HARNESS NOT NECESSARY 556.00
2| FRONT BUMPER HAILOGEN FOG LAMP @$298.00 N/S CRACKED 596.00 255.00
1|FRONT BUMPER FOAM NOT FITTED 197.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 702.00 :
1|FRONT FENDER LH BENT / BUCKLED 969.00 969.00
1|FRONT FENDER LH ATTACHMENT FIXING PARTS NOT NECESSARY 58.00
2|FRONT FENDER FENDER BRACKET @$47.00 NOT NECESSARY 94.00 X
2| FRONT FENDER CENTRE BRACKET @$43.00 NOT NECESSARY 86.00 :
2|SETS FRONT FENDER POP RIVERTS 12 PCS EACH NOT NECESSARY 70.00 2
SIDES @$35.00
2| FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER @$281.00 TORN 562.00 562.00
1|FRONT WHEEL HOUSING ATTACHMENT FIXING PARTS |NOT NECESSARY 89.00 i
2|MOUNTING FOR MAIN HEADLIGHT BEAM @$115.00 NOT NECESSARY 230.00 5
2| HEADLAMP ASSY FOR GAS DISCHARGE LAMP CRACKED 5,228.00 5,210.00
@$2614.00
2| HEADLAMP LIFT CYLINDER WASHER SYSTEM @$195.00 [NOT NECESSARY 390.00 ]
2| HEADLAMP WASHER JET @$298.00 NIS CRACKED 536.00 298.00
1|RADIATOR GRILLE ASSY BROKEMN 1,750.00 1,400.00
1|RADIATOR GRILLE UPPER GARMISH NOT NECESSARY 196.00 -
1|LOCK CARRIER CRACKED 891.00 891.00
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -932.35 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19019157/Uvi3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT £ -1,228.32
17,714.65 11,054.90
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH GARNISH (SN} CRACKED 80.00 14.00
1|FRONT LH ALUMINILIM RIM (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 1,185.00 -
LABOUR
1|RADIATOR COOLANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY B5.00 -
1,350.00 14.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & RENEW FRONT AFFECTED ACCIDENT 1,500.00 680.00
AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT LH
ALUMINIUM RIM.
TO PUTTY, SPRAY PAINT ON FRONT AFFECTED 1,500.00 T00.00
ACCIDENT AREAS,
TO CHECK & RE-CONMECT ALL ELECTRICAL WIRING. 50.00 20,00
TO CONDUCT AC LEAKAGE TEST & TOP UP AC GAS, 150.00 100.00
TO CONDUCT ALL WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 150.00 80.00
TO RE-PROGRAMME & RESET DIAGNOSTIC, NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
TO RUST PROOF AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
3,700.00 1,580.00
GRAND TOTAL 22,764.65 12,648.90
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 7,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19018157/Uvfan2
MARKET VALUE: $28,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $20,099.00=NETT VALUE: $7,901.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

ny third parts

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solsly for the use and benefit of the Cliant named an the frant page of this Report.
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