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Consuitants
Fiw Lig Company Registration No. 199607 158R

!' f {r At

S LTI AVE L SRS PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAMRE 408938 TEL : (081 a23613561 FAN - (065) 2564315

Your ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022560 Date: 13.11.2019
Ouwr ref CC4/LPC19019083/Uha3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear SirrfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBE 74421
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 29.10.2019
al the premises of M/s LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP and have the following to rep

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 3.671.50
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2,280.55
"Check” Items Amount : 8% -
Market Value - 58 -
LTA Reimbursement Value . 8% -
Nett Value : S8 -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages ai the A | I
N/S Portion o

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3 days

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



13119 PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |ID Type: Company
Owner |D: 196N
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBE7442L
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 31 Oct 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model:

TOYOTA HIACE VAN TURBO 5 DR MANUAL

Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: 1KD2601005
Chassis No.: JTFHTO2P700192965
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $27,741.00
Original Registration Date: 21Mar 2016
First Registration Date: 21 Mar 2016
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $1,388.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 20 Mar 2026
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $46.502.00
COE Rebate Amount: $29,701.00
Total Rebate Amount: $29,701.00

The information contained hereinis correct as at 31 Oct 2019

hitps:fivrl ita.gov.sgiitafvriaction/anguireRebateByPublicBaforeDereginput PFUNCTION_IOD=F0304008TT

mn



RE/COEZRehate Enquin
. A Singapore Government Agency Website

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Gwmer Particulars
Owmer 1D Type

Cramwer |11x

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na:

Wehicie 1o be Exporied:
Intended Deregistration Data:
Wahicle Make

Viehitle Model

PFrimary Colour
Manubacturing Yoar

Engtine MNa.:

Chacgis Mo

Maxirmum Power Output
Cipen Markel Value:
Qriginal Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transter Count:

Actual ARF Pad

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Elgibility;

PARF Elgibilny Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Cateqory:

COE PerioaYears

P Pat:

COE Robato Amount

Tetal Rehate Amount:

Crampany
L9EN

GBETAAZL

Mo

a0 Ot 2009

TOYOTA

TOYOTA HIACE VAN TURBO &
DR MANUAL

White

2016

1KDZ601005
JTFHTOZPT001529465
$27.741.00

21 Mar 2016

21 Mar 2014

$1.388.00

Mo

000

20 Mar 20246

C - Goods Vehicke & Bus
10

$46, 50200
S29.756.00
§29.756.00

The infprmation contained herein b correct as 3t 24 Oct 2019
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Mor o Kaki Hukin Avenue o fopon Auro Hay g Kaka Dulat Singapore 41788
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'Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: ONG U U <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 October, 2019 4:10 PM

To: Susan Low; MT_Claim_SG; assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Ce MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE7442L Claims against GBB440D Our
Ref: 19/19/18/VC05/022560

Attachments: GBE74421191022 pdf; GBE7442L Search.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Susan

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability
Dear Nivitha

FYA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

T;;.-I__:_(ESJ 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

oy

The all £8%3 lonpac.com.sg

From: Susan Low [mallto:liusbro@ymail.com]

Sent: Saturday, 26 October 2019 5:33 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE7442L Claims against GBB440D

Accident on 22/10/2019 Along Bukit Timah Lane 3 Qutside HKL Lim Team Moto

Invalving GBE7442L and GBB440D

We refer to the above accident and 3rd party claims.

We hereby write to request of 3rd party claims pre-repair inspection for our client’s vehicle.

Please let us have your single joint expert motor surveyors list (SJE) to conduct a pre-repair survey of
the damage to our client's vehicle jointly with our client/our motor workshop at No. 1 Kaki Bukit
Avenue 6 #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883 as soon as possible.

Kindly arrange.




Thank you.
Best Regard|

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6741 1730

Fax: 6744 5746

Date of Survey:-

Name of Authorise Surveyor:-

Surveyor Emall;

Remark :-




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: ONG U U <lloang®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November, 2019 1221 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: MT_Claim_5G; Vic (LEKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE7442L Claims against GBB440D Dur
Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022560

Attachments: GBBA40D 221019.PDF

Categories: HMEK

Dear Mel kwan

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all %% lonpac.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan [LEKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan@Ikkauto.com)|
Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 11:00 AM
To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Vic (LKKAute); Admin A
Subject: RE: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE7442L Claims against GBB440D Our Ref:
19/19/19/VC05/022560

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

LPC REF: 19/19/19/VC05/022560
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19019083/Uha3

Dear Sir f Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vod.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin



Thank you,
Best Regard!

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Waorkshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kakl Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6741 1730

Fax: 6744 5746

Date of Survey:-

Name of Authorise Surveyor:-

Surveyor Email:

Remark :-




hoo Miul.- Your Rel' GBETH2L - ACCIDENT INVOLVING https. il s ahioo coméd/folders 46/messages ACn-b3VIDScu X

Your Ref: GBE7442L - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBB 440D AND GBE 7442L
ON 22/10/2019 - LKK REF CC4/LPC19019083/Uha3

——
From: Vic (LKKAuto) (vicalpshi@lkkauto com)

To: lhusbro@ymail com

Ce admin-afifllkkauto com, vicalpeh@lkkautocom

Date Friday, 6 December 2019, 8:01 pm 5G7

Without Prejudice

Dear Susan,
We refer Lo the subject matter and we confirmed in receipt of the LOD

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured's pa
mandate and we confirm acceptance your offer of $2,202.00 (all in) to settle your client's claim.

Kindly let the owner chop and sign the attached DV and forward back to us (LKK) the original chopped and sig
the Authorization to Act duly signed by the owner for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to LILI'S BEROTHER AUTO FNGINEERING WORKSHOP,

Thank you,

“Please note that our above offer and any setflement ansing from the above offer are made on a withoul vep
constnied as an atmission of liability on aur part or an the part of our inswed Dvver. Tenms of such settfement :
any other related matter|s) in respect of the acedent. Our offer made m respect of this present matfer 1s maac
only No reference shall be made fo this offer or any seftiement arising from His offer m any other related matter

Beast Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 8841-2096 | email vicaipen@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 81, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenus 1, #02-25 | 5{408833)

r 07-Dec-19, 12:02 PM



' 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e r= 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusingl Park, Smngapore 408933
- TEL: B258 3551 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 18880T188R GST Reg No. 19-9607 188-R

Affillated 1o Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Rel . CCA4/LPC18019083/Uhadn2

#17-04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 109565 0 23012020 ”H”"Il"llll"ﬂ
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBE 4400 Veh. Inspected GBE 74421
Policy No. Z19VC05002537 Coverage ($) 0,00
Claim No. 1819/19/VC05022580 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From ONG LI LI Assign Date 28M10/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE (M) c.c 2082
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JTFHTOZ2PT00162565 Colour BLACK
Odometer 108503 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195R15 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R15 DUNLOP Bmm
R/H Rear Tyre |195R15 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185R13 DUNLOP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. _General Information
Accident Date 221072018 |inspection Date 20/10/2019
Survey held at LIL'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. _Estimate Days of Repair

]EST!MATF_D NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




_I L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i 51 Utl Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX' B25B 4315
Reg Mo 180607188R GST Reg, Mo 18-0607188-R Page No..1 ol 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBE T447L
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ thop *%1 ’%'M
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT SLIDING DOOR BADLY DENTED 1.682.40 1.682.40
1|FRONT SLIDING DOOR INNER LOCK SERVICEABLE 344 10 -
1|FRONT SLIDING DOOR HINGES TWISTED 145.00 145,00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -456 85
2,171.50 1370.55
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT SLIDING DOOR 'CORPORATE' NECESSARY 500.00 450,00
ADVERTISEMENT & ARTWORKS (SN)
500.00 450,00
LABOUR
TO CHECK ALL WIRING & ELECTRICAL COMPONENT NOT NECESSARY 50.00
FOR PROFPER FUNCTION.
LABOR FOR PANEL BEATING ,CUT WELD STRAIGHTEM 400,00 180.00
& REPLACING PARTS ETCS.
TOPUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING & INCLUDING TOUCH UP 500,00 250,00
PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING RESEAL TUFF-COATING 50.00 30.00
TREATMENT ON ACCIDENT AREA.
1,000.00 456000
GRAND TOTAL 3,671.50 2,280.55
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDI ¥ :

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC19018083/Uha3n2

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report i mude sclsby bor the aae and beeslt of s Chart named o the front page of this Repan




