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Your ref: D19006T19MFSH
Our Ref: CS/FCI19019066/R1vf3 Date ; 6/11/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO: §JF 4818G

We thank you far your instruction on 29/10/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned

4/11/2019 al the premises of M/s PERFORMANCE MOTORS LIMITED
and have the following o report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : §810,701.05
Revised Estimate Amount + §%6,479.50
"Check” ltems Amount 1 553,273.75
Market Value ;58

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value : 5%
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the -
tear portion —
Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL

Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Copital Insurance Limited o fes tes 1950000000  OLY Nag e M2 DO0TGTH N
B Rafties Quay 821 -00 Singapone D4BSE]
Tet (65) 6222 2311 Fo (B5) 6222 1547

Claims & oty Ussimreriiig ep 36 Robimion Rosd 0 16-01 City Hoyse Singspore 0BEETT
Tel [65) K507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3045

wwiia A firyicapital comoag
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 22-10-2018 Our Ref No. D19006718MFSH
Accident Date 21-10-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
insured Vehicle SHADS44Y Third Party Vehicle. SIF4818G

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

303 ALEXANDRA ROAD SIME DARBY PERFORMANCE CENTRE
CAROLINE

63180174/ 0 Fax No. 64784601

DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTELTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PERFORMANCE

Al fon. NI
MOTORS LIMITED o
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computar ganarated lattar, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen [LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 12:06 PM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Cc: ‘Merina Chia’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006719MFSH/1-SJF 48186
Attachments: SJF 4818G PREL| ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJF 4818G
Date of survey: 4/11/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 October 2019 2:43 PM

To: 'CWS5 Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006719MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | emall; assignments@lkkauto,com | fax: 6250-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | S(408433)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclai msfirstcapital, SE>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 October, 2019 2:35 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAU T0.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006719MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel ; 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen SLKKAutn]

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2019 11:20 AM

To: Sharon Heng L K; Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR

Ce: Toh Jing Xuan; Bernard Wan Chong Huat

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SJF4818G
Dear Sharon,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed amount $6865.50 before GST (@ 3 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

-—0riginal Message-—

From: Sharon Heng L K <sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 5:32 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg>; Bernard Wan Chong Huat <bernard.wan@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SIF4818G

Dear Rasul

For your perusal :

Labor 53916.00
Parts 52949 50
Total $6865.50
Owner is claiming CAR RENTAL - 5385.20 ( 3 DAYS)

Note : 3 working days.

Please reply me directly.

Best Regards

Sharon Heng
Performance Motors Ltd
Body & Paint

DID: 63190123



Fax : 64743229

"This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

——0riginal Message-—

From: service.pml@simedarby.com.sg [mailto:service. pmi@simedarby.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 26 November, 2019 3:18 PM

To: Sharon Heng LK

Subject: Message from KM_C458



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owmer 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: F45G
T Y 0T e e = = |
Vehicle No.: SJF481BG
Vehicle to be Exported; No
Intanded Deregistration Date: 0& Mov 2019
Vehicle Make B.MW.
Vehicle Model: X3 SDRIVE 201 LED SR MAV
Primary Colour Brown
Manufacturing Year: 2014
Engine No.: B2960826N20B20A
Chassis No.: WBAWYP2070LEDDBAS
Maximum Power Qutput: 135.0 kw (181 bhp)
Open Market Value £41.448.00
Original Registration Date: 28 Nov 2014
First Registration Date 28 Nov 2014
Transfer Count: Q
Actual ARF Paid: $50,028.00
Elnteniied PR et el e ——
PARF Eligibility Yes
PARF Eligikility Expiry Date: 27 Nov 2024
PARF Rebate Amount: £37.521.00
T O R D e )
COE Expiry Date: 27 Mov 2024
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $73.900.00
COE Rebate Amount $36,B70.00
Total Rebate Amount $74.391.00
The information contained herein Is correct as at 04 Nov 2019
18 oo
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GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X 25 0CT 2019
ESTIMATE
[ Estimate No. . bl 53206 Page ¥o. : 1 of 5
Date Estimated : 25/10/2019
| Prepared By : Inthiran A/L Thurasamy )
[ - ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 303 ]

Gautam Anand
188 Depot Road
#1e-17

6 Raffles Quay
#21-00
Singapore 048580

| Singapore 109688

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

-~

Painting rear bumper

To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the
rear section for proper function

To replace rear exhaust silencer including alignment
system and conduct checks for leak.

To remove old PDC assembly, replace damaged parts and
reconnect to new bumper including conduct checks for
proper function,

Sundries.  peL

DESCRIPTION _, m QTY
Installation * 7 gwe 1
REAR MUFFLER - Do i 1
TAILPIPE TRIM ALU LOOK - d Rk 1
REAR BUMPER SET MOUNTING PARTS (VAL - 1
RR BUMPER CARRIERECE 2 M5 _ ot 1
RR LH BUMPER MIDDLE MOUNTING - 3 1
RR RH BUMPER MIDDLE MOUNTING 7. 3¢ 1
COVER MIDDLE BOTTOM & -~ Lo 1
REAR BUMPER CLADDING (PDC/SCHWARZ) 1
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (XLINE/PDC &+ 7 1
UNDERRIDE GUARD PRIMED REAR (X LINE 1

DECOUPLING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTE g~ /% 4
Uttrasonict J y -~ 5w [!(_‘2’

132.00
1.220.80
128.00
38.55
Tar.8e0
137.75
137.75
167.55
21145
1.510.10
249 40
5.05

368.80 I

Par

-8

Total Labour

1=
i3

REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MCDEL MILEAGE
! SJF4818G WBAWY92070LEOOB3S 28/11/2014 X3 sDrive20 0 ]
JESCRIPTION __VaLpE
To replace rear bumper and aticahments ESV 127500

'/’? 150,00

3,348.00

VALUE
132.00
1.220.80
128.00
38.55
797.80
137.75
137.75
167.55
211.45
1,510.10
24940
2020
737.60

5,488.05




mw omatds Performance Motors Limited

A &ims Darby Woters Company
O=. By Ne. LYMAILIW 7 Bey . Ex M2-00J0081-m

FEl, Alenardis Boad I8G, Eampm=gy Arasy Boad 115, Aewamirs hoad

Gime Carhy Ferforcssnce Cenrre Exst Coast Centre Sime Dazby Bupiness Centre
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GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMATE

[ Estimate Neo. ' bl 53206 page No. : 2 of 5
Date Estimated : 25/10/2019

| Prepared By : Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
EEGHN. NO. CHASSIS ND. REGN, DATE MODEL MILERGE
SJF4B18G WBAWY92070LE00835 28/11/2014 X3 sDrive20 (4]

'O W\
L
Mﬂm[}"

ool ¥

1©,S8S. S

I A\
Labour 1 3,348.00

Parts 5,489.05

| Labour 2 0.00
Excess 0.00

- Total GST @ 7% 618.59

Grand Total 9,455.64

** THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY**
** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **



** THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY™*
* PRIGE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **

o fasier Performance Motors Limited
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GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMATE
[ Estimate No. : bl 53322 Page Ne. : 1 of 4
Date Estimated 0s5/11/2019
| Prepared By Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
(- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 303
Gautam Anand MS First Capital Insurance Limited
188 Depot Road 6 Raffles Quay
#16-17 #21-00
Singapore 048580
| Singapore 1096848 )
REGH. HO. CHASSIS NO. REGH. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SJF4B18G WBAWYSZ070LEOOB3S 28/11/2014 X3 sDrive20 o
o L
CESCRIPTION VALUE
To knock and repair 1ajl panal B50.00 ‘/f
Painting tail panel. T-ﬁ.ﬂfl/.-
To remove and install boot compartment carpet and garnish 271.00 L-
to facilitate repairs.
Total Labour 1: 1,864.00
L.-F'.T.\'_lihl_;..-l _ AL 1 EncE Natry
{he Repairer of e wing
+ To resurvey baloes/afier S0y =g
» T disploy damag®d DaniE| Sw
« Party prices oo Bubpect &
& Thild piETy Burvi ona v xE
» Mo ilegal moddcator
« Suppeameniany f=mi| ke veyed and
18 sasbyect 1o finusl approval Fiom |nTar Ty
Acknimitniged by Repars
Signalum
\ »
& ™)
Labour 1 : 1,864.00
Parts : 0.00
Labour 2 H 0.00
Excess $ 0.00
Total GST @ 7% 130.48
l Grand Tatal 1,994.48
 —"




Veron Chen {LI(KAutu!

From: inthiran Thurasamy <inthiran.thurasamy@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 10:57 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Teng Wai Khan; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Ce Keith Lee Chi Yung; Cresendo Llurca Lagman; Sharon Heng L K Toh Jing Xuan
Subject: RE: SJF4818G before paint, check and supplementary labour

Dear Veron,

Thank you for the confirmation. Please add 1 day for repair days.
Warm regards

Inthiran

Mator Claim Advisor | Body and Paint
Performance Motors Limited

303 Alexandra Road

Sime Darby Performance Centre
Singapore 159941

Hp (+65) 81214600 | Fax (+65)64794601
Inthiran.thurasam edar M.

*This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ["the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all coples of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November, 2019 10:38 AM

To: Teng Wai Khan <teng.wai.khan@simedarby.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Keith Leo Chi Yung <keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>; Cresendo Llurca Lagman
<cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; Inthiran Thurasamy <inthiran.thurasamy@simedarby.com.sg>; Sharon
Heng L K <sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg>; Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing xuan@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SIF4818G before paint, check and supplementary labour

Dear Wai Khan,

Refer marking.



Best Regards,

Veran Chen | Case Handlat

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Teng Wal Khan <teng.wai.khan(@ simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 5:32 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com:>

Ce: Keith Leo Chi Yung <keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>; Cresendo Llurca Lagman
<cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; Inthiran Thurasamy 'ﬁ__l':!__[_htrﬂl'l.ll'll]ranlT'I‘f@EI[l‘IEdEIFl&.LUH1.551}; Sharon
Heng L K <sharon.heng.leekun@ simedarby.com.sg>; Toh Jing Xuan <toh.|Ing.xua ni@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: SIF4818G before paint, check and supplementary labour

Dear Rasul,

Please find attachment for your review and approval.

Thank you

Regards,
Wal Khan

Performance Motors Limited
Body & Paint Department
DD : 63190149

Fax : 64743229

*This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments (“the Message”) is intended only for the named addressee
{"the Recipient”) and may contain information that Is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the Sime Darby group ol
companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly
prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/ar printing the Message. Please notify the sender Immediately by return
e-mall and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all llability for any error, loss or damage arising
from the Message being Infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the

1e W

Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.
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GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMATE
[ zstimate No. ! bl 53322 Page No. : 2 of 4
Cate Estimated : 05/11/2019
| Prepared By ¢ Inthiran A/L Thurasamy i
REGN. NO. CHASS5IS NO. REGHN. DAIE MODDEL MILEAGE
5JF4818G WBAWYS2070LE0OOB3S 28/11/2014 X3 sDrive20 0

Terms & Conditions of Service

| Mmmm,mwn‘ﬂ.u|mnuhmm “Fiepairs”) are subject lo scceptance by Pargrmance Motors Lvitg ("PML7) and
PAAL ahall have he sheckde discretion 10 reiact o deny amy request for the Repalrs.

z ThlIIlalm-lmplnnwﬂmmhﬁplmpﬁmﬂmﬁmmmuﬁMFthmhmmmmwnuum
rmmwmu.mnmuamm.mﬂduanmmummhmumm-mm.mmmm
wwwmmmmwm}hmmuhmwm

- m-:nuuu-:mmmmm:m—unwm-iwumwu,hmwlmFmimmmmmHmwawmwmm
from ihe Customar's own estimation of repairy nesded, PAMLs estimate shall prevail,

4, mwwmmrnrn.n-pmmw.uﬂmuu-umumuumuﬂhwhlu-unmﬂunmumnmmm'-wm
hrwmﬂwﬂdnmﬂmﬂmumwﬁ-nﬂwhhmmmmdhmﬂnmﬂhmmmuhmml’m.muu
Mnm.mmmﬂ-mulmivm-mmIrnmmmwnmnmlnPﬂhmwmﬂmulﬂ.hmuﬂ.fwm
few. accident, koss of or damage to (ke Vinicks, &5 corlents of Eccassnies whasoever.

5. mmwquNmmrMﬂmuﬂmHIL.lnhmmu.mmuummhmwdmmmmmmmm
FIn-r:.sm.ldmw:muru:uhnw-mmlnmwnmﬂyﬂhmmmhmum.mwm

[ Puu-mnm-nym-drmr.mrupnufhmfwmmnm.mnmmnmmumndwluumhummwmml-ldl
mwumwwmuhmhﬂnmhMInﬂumﬂﬂhHﬂnTﬂGummm. nevenhaless. bo responsible for all comty for the
dlnu-mnlr.:Hmm-h.hmclnnwwmmm.-M\:mmmmmmmgnmmnmmrnwwulmmmumﬂhmnnl
found thad the taultis] is or are not caused by FML

T F_mpl-mmdmd-lmmmﬂulnﬂmﬂrmﬂmmehmmhm-muhﬂm.mmmmmn-dhyh.h
nﬁummmw:p-dl.mnmuldummmmmwMndhnmummu“dwmrumMMv“ﬂn-w

B, Unisss otherwing agreed by PAML in Hﬂﬂﬂ.hﬂmMmhmdﬁlmmuFIH.|HM.MMWIMII“WH.HWWW
muwuhmmmamuuwwmnummmncmmmmmﬂunmdmﬂ-mmmmw
uapm-mdmmm.mﬂuwmmmmmﬁwmﬂnm:dwwmhmwmww-mammmumm
pqmrunuﬂymmdwrm_mmum-mm,mmmummwnymdlmynmmmwm-mww
whatsoever.

' TrnmmwﬂmnmmummmmmmumamuiuuML that the Vehicke s ready for colection. In the
mmnﬂmmnmuwmuhmn.mcum.nu.innﬂmuumﬂmmmwmmhmdmwm-nnm
umludhymeimmummmdm.mWamhwWme any loss of or damage 1o the Vhicl, ts contsms or
ma!nrmmmhmﬂumwluumm-:h'-qimm:ud-lumgl.lnlh-mmmmmrrﬂnﬂmm-m-dthm1m
ud.rp,llll.ﬂnnuﬂﬂnmmwmm.hmuhmlmmmmdm. PML's costs n connectian with e diapossl as wall
a8 ull oiher monies owing 1o PML

18, uF\I-l.murunu-u-ngndmmnutﬂnlyMrn-d-hlrm:mmmuimmhﬂ-hMrmmwl:meHWM
e deermed (o have accepted the Repairs as salislactony.

11, 1 tha Vehicls 15 sant 1o PML for the Ropains by any parson othae than the Cusamaes, AL shall be enitied, without need o make any inguiry, 1o ieat such Wird party as acing
mwmhwmmLmﬂumMummmmmmuwmmumnmmmmmmﬁmﬂw
Customer ghall not hokd PML kable munnmwwmhnwu-mmmmunmuhmmmmupmmmmm
demmmwmwmqmnlmhmPM1uumuunnﬂmMﬂymmmmnmmm

12, PML may, in iis absclute decration mmhw:mprwmnmwuwn-munhmht:mthhm—nrmu-nprmdud-m
wmmmwhmmmwﬂmunmm.umuunmanmwmmmﬂtlmhwmmm
Fu.hnllhmruﬁunu.hudwwumwmwmmwmmhmhuWMmmumm_

'|:|.Thuq‘lmlcmﬂimqutnMMMdmnmuﬂmﬂmmmmmhnnu-wmmmn-mmmmmwh-hm
mhhaﬂwﬁdlliW“muumwmmmmemﬂmMMHhmmmNﬂ
mmrwnmT-n-r-lI.‘:ommdammihmmmmmuwwmwwm—mdmmme
Canstomes,

H,lny-m-nnrpm-mnnnlm-l‘Imrnlmﬂawmhwmuunulhﬂaum:mmwﬂlmmndmlﬁmm;
Candtians of Service not sttected by such Invalidity. llsgality or unsrigrceabillty shall remmn in force and efect.
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18, A parsgn nol pany 12 Bees Tarme I.c-undhmwm‘anmu-ﬂulnm.mulwun:uranpmeﬂmmmdmﬂrmthmw-mmqmmmw
mﬁmhmﬂhlhmﬂ-mmmhmuﬂld.ldu‘lﬂﬂ'iupphﬂwmmMIHHMWIMmemMTmledm.

rn,‘thmulmnq:.u:ﬂmﬂm-mhfﬂymmﬁmﬁmlwmdMMmﬁthmHummupmﬂ
the Courts of #w Republic of Singapare.

17, The Simae Darby Maters Group companies in Singapare ane commitod 1 sneuring that you personil data |y protected. The purposs of s document is 1o sxpan Row we
ﬂﬂmnﬁ.lnlu,hf.uu:uuMnhmmphnlulmdmnrlu-:r-r-dnmrnunnumuamummmlmﬂmmmhﬂlmm.
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luv-mmﬂwwu—hmtpﬁwhhmunmﬂmnmuumldwmnnlhlﬁw

(&) mnq“mgnn.hmmumﬂrﬁmmt-gmuﬂmmﬂmmmmmmhhdmmwmln:

k) mdnmmmmm-.mhm‘:w.nmwm:ﬂmmmlnwlmmmum
mmnn-uummmnmmmmwmmmnhw.

1] lhlmlurhwmmmmnnmﬂmum“mmm-mdummnnmnw.hmwmﬁmmmmm
hmmdmmwhmwﬂummhﬁﬂﬂmmm.uwmmmwmmmlmm
e Customers behall 30 gs o sl the Customal (n sftecting the Vehicle loan redemptions;

mmdwmumhmﬂf‘mmmhrm The relevent permonal dita shall be used by the Vendo!, f8 BppoiMBd afier-sales
sarvice dealers, agents and sub-contmoiors andicr tha Vendor's principal andlor (5 Mwmmmgcmmmpﬁmm
dt-*aulum-mtnﬁrmw:mwm“mwwmeMnhmdmmmwmuh
muwwwmm.|mwm_npmrmﬁwmmwmmmmmwwm

{m) mm.l'-l-lrﬂ'li'llMIﬂmﬂlwm*hﬂlﬂuﬂIMMHM“ﬁMIﬂmﬂl:lnﬂ

m mmmwnm.hlmhwuﬂmmuh-wmummmm&mﬁ. multi-medin sorvices ("WMMST, phone call, fax
mﬂm.mhw-}mnﬂmmﬁuﬂummmww?mm&w

Thie Vendor shall also duckoss the Castomar s personal data

) ta Ew senice providers, for axample, @ ichars ol wab hesting ar ma services. for the purpese of dupplying fsell with Tho misr cannecied SBVers andor
web siie knks with the relevant author=s,

n:lwummummm:mmwmmmmmm-wmhmahmwnww—h
sarvices il provides:

|urnmlhmmpmﬂnmhwm'lwdpd ummmmdeunwWSmmﬂunmpmﬂ
uqmngmhm-cm.mmmcumurﬂmmumen,mmm:mmwmws.mm.mmumw
hm:mrmurn-nmﬁ.mwpmdmwwﬂmuﬂnmhﬂuvmhmwhw“ﬂmﬂmmﬂnummm.

i) 10 he Vendor's busineas parmars fof the purposs of canying oul produst promaotions,
{#) 10 tha Vendors atsseholdors and the Vendor's prinzpal andl flathil related eorporations and contractorn 1or e purpoms of carying ol auStE,

m mnw-wﬂmnWlmlﬂ“mmmﬁmdwﬁmMﬂ within o outsde Singapore for The
purposss ol carying out audis; and
(1] mh-Wnpmnp-lmﬂurﬂmdmmmmmwmnwmmhhmdwmlwdmﬂumﬂlmm

mmeannuum'nmummmwpﬂuﬂdmnwmhm.mmmwwm-wnm
conbraciual mmangaments of under sny applicanie law, whichver m labar.

Hmwmwpmwﬁhmw.lwﬂhhw“mﬂnumqpﬁ-mmmm-w:mhnmwmqr'llnﬁlnh
Cusiomes shall requirs the Cusiomer's conseni o 48 change of uie of the Cuslomars personal dala Continied use o the Vemdo's sesvices shall sighily tha
Cussiomss's agreament 1o sy such changes.
mmmncmmﬂmhmmmmw-wmuﬂmnmmmwmmmwmm
the obipciive of enhencing fhs Customor's salisfachon,

mn-mmrmlm-wwmnmdmmmnwmmmwpwhhwmnmmmmmma
munimn-mnammmnu-dummm|m“mhhhcmvnmﬂmnwﬂmu|mhmm
Customess shall complirte the Vendor's prescribed form and'on

lt:ﬂh“hwmﬂﬁmm!ﬂmﬁhhm-molhnmﬂﬂmnrmmulnm jmiprmanon sboul M ways in which Fis
parmanal data is vsed or disclosed duting the past year o both;
(s mm#mmmNﬂﬂiqlmdhﬂﬂﬂﬂlmlmhmwlmmm card bill). and

(4] mmmmmm-ﬂnm.iwmmuuMMmmmmmn

The Vndor shall regly to e Gusiomen & soon &s reassnably possibie upan lte recelpt of the Customar's request.
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mwﬂmmnwmmmhummmmwmmhmm&mm.

The Customer shall have e right 10 commect mymm—hmmwmlmdm.lmcmmhnmw:m thve Cumomer shal:
m) st his rEQUENT i WITIng:

{b) provide 1he Vendor with encugh information 1o identify himses (e.g. the Customar's aezount numbed. ussmame. regisisEtion detalls); and

(1<) Mmmw:mmmnmu‘w”m.

mwmmmh&mnm-mﬂwnmuhw-w

Th-r.‘.mmr‘nm-:urnurmuﬂmr-:p-ﬂnulmthnumnnfrqin;mwndu';iﬂhlum»m&mﬂ‘-lmn-mm-mw
uwmmmmmmwmmummmm&W-Pmuuhmmwﬂmﬂmmmmmfwm

mwmdmummmmwﬂuwmmu.mummmwmmmmnmmmwuumm
170 and 1T.2. Hnwmm:mﬂmmmﬂmﬂmﬂnmmmm&

{a) puit hi reguest in wiing by wiry of an emall sent ko he Verdor

[ pmm\hmwmﬂmhm.mcw.mw.mmwwMMMM;umm

1] rmmnmhmnmanlnmmuammnruw-whmmmndmg.mﬂsmms.MMum.n
Cusizemar has to apecity the channsd he is withdrawing his consent 10,

1r|hnlmmﬂqhtnmmmeMhhMmummmmm“mwhmMmmmmrmm
wrﬂ:unﬂm,n:ummuﬂh-m_mmfnmswwwhmmwmp-ﬂmwdmum;mmhﬁqmulm undar the
wwranty undartakings, -um--rmmdmmla-.mwwumm.nammmmmwmlmmm.

Trumrqml:uw‘wmlwhm:smmudﬂwnutmumdmummuﬂml?imﬂuwhummmurmmh
sat out bn tha PDPA,

The Customer shull addess all communications partainmg to this Clauss 17
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Performance Motors Limited @

Final Report

Estimate No.  : b1 53206

Date Estimated : 25/10/2019

Prepared By inthiran A/L Thurasamy

- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 303

Gautam Anand MS First Capital Insurance Limited

188 Depot RoadThe Interlace 6 Raffles Quay

#16-17 #21-00

Singapore 048580

Singapore 109688

REGM. NC. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE

SJF4818G WBAWY92070LEOD! 28/11/2014 X3 sDrive20 1]

ACCOUNT;

DESCRIPTION ) — ___ORIGINALPRICE _ DISC. % NETT

To replace rear bumper and attcahments including to remove B50.00 0 B50.00

and install body parts in order to carry out painting Jjob.

To respray rear bumper, 938.00 0 938.00

To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the 150.00 o 150.00

rear section for proper function,

To remaove old PDC assambly, replace damagead parls and 150,00 o 150.00

reconnect 1o new bumper including conduct checks for

proper function.

Sundries. BO.CO 0 B0.00
# To make good tail end panel and knock out dented area 850.00 ] B50.00

causad by the accident.
# To respray tail end panel 668.00 0 668.00
¢ To ramove and install rear boot compartment carpet and 230.00 0 230,00

garnish 1o facilitate repairs.

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE QTY  DISC.% NETT
¥
# CLAMP 1.60 3 0 4.80

RR BUMPER CARRIER ECE 797.80 1 0 797.80

COVER MIDDLE BOTTOM 167.55 1 0 167.55

REAR BUMPER CLADDING (PDC/SCHWARZ) 211.45 1 0 211.45

REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (XLINEPDC 1,51010 1 0 151010

UNDERRIDE GUARD PRIMED REAR (X LINE 249.40 1 0 249,40
# EXPANDING RIVET BLACK 1.40 6 0 B840
# SUPPLENMENTARY ITEMS

53206 - SJF4B18G.xlsx, Page 1 Finalised by: Sharon Heng DID: 63190123 Fax: 64743229
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Supplementary
Estimate No.  : b1 53206
Date Estimated 25/10/2019
PrepaedBy Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - -~ ACCOUNT - 303
Gautam Anand MS First Capital Insurance Limited
188 Depot RoadThe Interlace 6 Raffles Quay
#16-17 #21-00
Singapore 048580
Singapore 109688
REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO., REGN.DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SJF4818G WBAWY92070LEOO! 28/11/2014 X3 sDrive20 0
ACCOUNT:
DESCRIPTION e ORIGINAL PRICE  DISC. % NETT
# To make good tail end panel and knock out dented ares B50.00 0 850.00 /
caused by tha accident.
# Torespray tall end panel 668.00 0 668.00 /
# To remove and install rear boot compartment carpet and 230,00 (4] 23000
gamish to facilitate repairs /_
DESCRIPTION B UNIT PRICE QTY DISC.% NETT
. g
s CLAMP M- o~ - 1.60 3 0 480
s EXPANDING RIVET BLACK M 1.40 3 0 8.40
# SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS
Total Labour : 1,748.00
Total Parts : 1320
Total Labour & Parts 1,761.20

53206 - SJF4B18Gxlsx, Page 1 Finalised by. Sharon Heng DID: 63190123 Fax: 64743229
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Performance Motors Limited #;

Final Report
Total Labour 3,916.00
Total Parts : 2,049.50
Total Labour & Parls 6,865.50
v Tk 7 GST @7%: 480.58
W PARTY | DATE Grand Total : 7.346.00
PV 0 Wui
{1 A e "“’l‘\\'\! 3

i | CARRENTAL-$38520 (3 dawyi)

e e
"
—— ey —
1

53206 - SJF4818G.xisx, Page 2 Finalised by: Sharon Heng DID: 63190123 Fax: 64743229



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 408333

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 5258 4115

Reg. Mo: 199807188R G5T Reg. No. 18-0607T188-R

Afiliated 1o Fedaration Internationals Des Exparts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Rel : CSIFCI1901B066/R 1vf3n2

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Dale 27-11-2018

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 088877

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHA 544Y Veh. Inspected SJF 4818G
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D19006719MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MERIMA CHIA SAN SAN Assign Date 29M10/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW X3 SDR 20 C.C 1097
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2074
Chassis No. WBAWYB20T0LEDDBIS Colour BROWHN
Odometer 50530 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
= Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/50 R18 FIRELL] B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/'H Rear Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR F"DFI'HDN-
OAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  21/70/2016 Inspection Date 04/11/2018
Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159841
sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg No: 190607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R Page Mo 1ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJF 4818G
ay DescipionofParts | Condon | Estimale B Jour Aduste
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|INSTALLATION (SN) NOT NECESSARY 132.00 -
1|REAR MUFFLER (SN) SERVICEABLE 1,220,980
1|TAILPIPE TRIM ALU LOCK (SN) SERVICEABLE 128.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER SET MOUNTING PARTS (VAL)(SN) SERVICEABLE 38,55 -
1|RR BUMPER CARRIER ECE (SN) BENT TO9r.B0 797.80
1|RR LH BUMPER MIDDLE MOUNTING (SN) SERVICEABLE 137.75
1|RR RH BUMPER MIDDLE MOUNTING (SN} SERVICEABLE 137.75
1|COVER MIDDLE BOTTOM (SM) DEFORMED 167.55 167.55
1|REAR BUMPER CLADDING (PDC/SCHWARZ)(SM) DEFORMED 211.45 21145
1|REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (XLINEPDC)(SN) DEFORMED 1,510.10 1,510.10
1|UNDERRIDE GUARD PRIMED REAR (X LINE){BM) DEFORMED 249.40 24940
4|DECOUPLING RING POC TORQUE CONVERTE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.20 -
2|ULTRASONIC T [(SN) SERVICEABLE Tar.eo g
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 80.00
J|CLAMP (ADDITIONALMSMN) NECESSARY 4,80 4.80
G|EXPANDING RIVET BLACK (ADDITIOMNAL)(SN) NECESSARY B.40 8.40
5652.25 3,029.50
LABOUR
TO MAKE GOOD TAIL END PANEL AND KNOCK OUT 850.00 850,00
DENTED AREA CAUSED BY THE ACCIDENT.
(ADDITIOMAL).
TO RESPRAY TAIL END PANEL. (ADDITIONAL), 668.00 BE8.00
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL REAR BOOT COMPARTMENT 230.00 230.00
CARPET AND GARNISH TO FACILITATE REPAIRS.
(ADDITIONALY,
TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER AND ATTACHMENTS 1.275.00 850,00
FPAINTING REAR BUMPER 1,038.00 938.00
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEMS AND 177.00 150.00
LIGHTINGS AT THE REAR SECTION FOR PROPER
FUNCTION,
TO REPLACE REAR EXHAUST SILENCER INCLUDING NOT NECESSARY 531.00 -
LﬁéﬂNH ENT SYSTEM AND CONDUCT CHECKS FOR

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19019066/R1vf3n2




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-V 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapors 408933
TEL: B256 1561 FAN 6256 4315
Reg Mo 129607108R GST Reg Mo 19-9607198-R Page No.2 ol 2
Qty Description of Parts ‘Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
pHOn(oY Rt 2 Workshop (s))| _ (8)
TO REMOVE OLD PDC ASSEMBLY REPLACE DAMAGED 177.00 150.00
PARTS AND RECONNECT TO NEW BUMPER INCLUDING
COMDUCT CHECKS FOR PROPER FUNCTION.
4 946,00 3 836.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,598.25 6. BE5.50
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | &,865.50]

Report Ref No. CS/FCI180180668/R1v13n2
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Automolive Assessor
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