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Jhnice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, February 27, 2018 10:34 AM

To: ‘Ler, Bernard-JQ'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SJT6094R/ 4042599216SG | Date of Accident: 17/2/2018

Dear Bernard,

The market value for SJT 6094R is $18K - $20K (EST) as at February 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ [mailto:Bernard-JQ.Ler @aig.com]

Sent: Monday, February 26, 2018 5:51 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@fta.com.sg>; Rogass mail <rogassociates@gmail.com>
Subject: SIT6094R/ 4042599216SG | Date of Accident: 17/2/2018

Hi All,
Appreciate if you all could assist to compute market value of the vehicle above please.
Thank you very much.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler
AlG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you

must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify

me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this

email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer

system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free
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PAl‘lF.’COE Rebate Enquiry

https://vtl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vil/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeD. .

Al Ej

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle Do

| Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

 Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehlclé Make:
- Vehicle Model;
. P.rimarf C;Iour:.
Manufacturing Year:
Englne No.:
éhasslﬁ No. .
i\-'llaxlmum Pawer Output 1
Open Market Value:
Orlginal Registration Date:
First éegi#ﬁ‘:ﬂér} Dat;!:
Transfer Count:
ActL]aIAI.{i.:. Pald:r N
‘ Intended PARF Rebate Details
| PARF Eligibiity:
7 ‘P.-AI-RF Eligibility Expiry Date:
 PARFRebateAmount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Catego‘rv:'

. COE Period(Years):
QPPaId:. i
COE Ret;alt:; Amount

| ‘Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Feb 2018
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Singapore NRIC

27568

SJT6094R

No

22 Feb 2018

HYUNDAI

AVANTE 1.6 AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR
Red

2009

G4FCIU748196
kMHDU-t‘lBl!\"IAU-&?S&tSB
89.7 kW .(.120 bhp} -
$11,539.00

22 Oct 2009

22 Oct 2009

0
$11.40300 ?’U /
Yes
210ct 2019

$6,271.00

21 Oct 2019
. .A-‘Cjal"(lél()()cc&‘helcwll
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$8,861.00
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