R TR (Y A R A [

J [0 R
CvajiaLao \3&86T/ Uc Uit e {1 b '
ER f 1ol

Tanet  Ton il . el | |
28 March 208 A |‘
26 M ; | | Bl o ‘I

i ] USTER B RN ! i“"""l*l”"f""["'} ’”|||‘ "Illl!l“f"! “,.‘ ‘

| { s .‘.“. I‘ il “._

i fA e ‘

S3E 8wyt (i @D

) ':\ ‘l‘ll'
' 0A Maw 2008 :lq‘w!
' 08 Moy 2018 :
("

i
T

)

PR LR ISR I g A O B T AR AR %2
Py Cb 1 gttt AN gl
L) MR

'H;-w!}ul“ i

i Wy
Al
g l!%liLM'l! 'i!,"'.

i
A

wnffiel y A
iy Ly ¥ i

s

0 T T 1 O A A

T v 1 PSR
i)

\1.\"\ B l\.‘_“

\| il D"|::;Ell{," L,_\'w;{..“.

{7 LA IR

t FU ]
| 3.5K-dg skeest) |

s |

Al e Ve

| T (.l‘} |

il b
.,“,-5',““" i

o
i
S ‘ Pdbd e

P i Vi
' ' 7
AN R 1

RN TN

[P e
!
|
|
1

I U

I ] #
/ i L | ALY
o ; R R TG e % 1) 1

L

{ b

| S3E &19RTH Ics)e




¢ -

Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

#

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 10:46 AM
To: 'Janet Tan'; Simon Ho (LKKAuto); SUR
Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: Prevailing market value - SJE8197T
Attachments: LOG.pdf

Dear Janet,

Thank you for your email.
By copy to Simon / SUR dept.
Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 26 March 2018 10:41 AM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; Elgene Teng <elgene@rta.com.sg>; aasschee @singnet.com.sg; Jimmy Lee
<jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg>; Ml <mi@aispl.com.sg>; Survey@jpknights.com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Prevailing market value - SJE8197T

Dear all,

Please advise the prevailing market value of SJE8197T as at 19/03/2018 asap.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eqnsumme»

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Ma oad #17-00 Tow
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, piease notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.
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‘Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehlcle Owner Partlculars
OwnerID Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details

VehicleNo:
Veh]cle to be Exportad
lntended De-reglstration Date:
Veha:le Make:
Veh|cle Mudel
Pn-narv Colour
Man ufacturing Year-
Englre Nou
Chassls No

) Max[mum PmerOutpu*
Open Market Value:
Original keglsﬁ:atlnn Date:
Flrsi Reéistraitbn b;ie;
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF EI glbllitv

PAR_E l_-ZIl_g bility VEupIry Date:
PARF Rekate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period (Years}

Qe P’aid

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The informatlon contained herein ls correct as at 19 Mar 2018

Singapore NRIC
51250

SIESLYTT

Yes

31 Mar 2018
TOYOTA
COROLLA AXIO 1.5XA
Sl]uer

2008
1NZD033781
NZE141608 1204
8‘1 0 kW {108 bhp)
$12 623 00

09 May 20 008

09 May 2008

0
$12,623.00

Yes
08 Mav201ﬂ
$6,311.00

[}S May 2018 )
A-Car (L 3 600:: & belowl
10

$15.600.00

$163 00 )

$6,474.00




