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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 12 March 2018 10:02 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Joel Goh; Simon Ho (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Janet Tan; Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR SFM3117M (DM18HO00510-JG) DOA:
19/02/2018

Dear Joel,

The market value for SFM 3117M is $20K-$22K (EST) as at Feb 2018

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler on behalf of Janice Lee A ANV
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 3:01 PM

To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR SFM3117M (DM18H000510-JG) DOA: 19/02/2018

Dear Joel,
Thank you for your email.

By copy to Simon / SUR dept.

Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 9 March, 2018 2:56 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; elgene@rta.com.sg; aasschee@singnet.com.sg; jimmy.lee @priorityservices.sg;
mi@aispl.com.sg; Survey@jpknights.com; admin <admin@Ibs-auto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR SFM3117M (DM18H000510-)G) DOA: 19/02/2018




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, March 09, 2018 3:01 PM

To: Joel Goh; Simon Ho (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Janet Tan; Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR SFM3117M (DM18HO00510-JG) DOA: 19/02/2018
Attachments: SFM3117M COE REBATE.PDF

Dear Joel,

Thank you for your email.
By copy to Simon / SUR dept.

Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei KWan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 9 March, 2018 2:56 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; elgene@rta.com.sg; aasschee @singnet.com.sg; jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg;
mi@aispl.com.sg; Survey@jpknights.com; admin <admin@Ibs-auto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR SFM3117M (DM18HO00510-JG) DOA: 19/02/2018

Dear all,
Please advise the prevailing market value of SFM3117M as at 19/02/2018 asap.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

eéinsuronce

L‘L,,.‘ﬂ, C}«f‘im
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 656223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
www.eginsurance.com.sg



Dear al!, S
Please advise the prevailing market value of SFM3117M as at 19/02/2018 asap.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

¢
k’]“,-’.-p W‘M
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWwWw.eqinsurance.com.sg -

.K A Member of Citystate @'——'—

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tt
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

Singapore NRIC

5246)

SFM3117M

No

09 Mar 2018

HONDA

JAZZ 1.3LAT

Red

2008 70 = 1 %
L13Z711022092
JHMGE685095222090
73.0 kW (97 bhp)
$18,762.00

22 Jul 2009

TR €t

3

$18,762.00 § ] f/

Yes

21 Jul 2019



PARF Rebate Amount: $10,319.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 21 Jul 2019

COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $14,310.00

COE Rebate Amount: $1,954.00

Total Rebate Amount: $12,273.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 09 Mar 2018

OK



