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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, March 02, 2018 9:23 AM

To: Irene Tan

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of car SJB 1537H; Our claim no.:
513715/T

Dear Irene,

The market value for SJB 1537H is $8K- $9K(EST) as at May 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, March 01, 2018 11:09 AM

To: Irene Tan <irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of car SIB 1537H; Our claim no.: 513715/IT

Dear Irene,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Janice,

Please kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Irene Tan [mailto:irene tan@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 11:06 AM




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, March 01, 2018 11:09 AM

To: Irene Tan; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of car SJB 1537H; Our claim no.:
513715/1T

Attachments: SJB1537H PARF.pdf

Dear Irene,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Janice,

Please kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Irene Tan [mailto:irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 11:06 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D
(LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of car SJB 1537H; Our claim no.: 513715/IT
Importance: High

FOR YOUR IMMEDIATE ACTION, PLEASE

Good morning Veron,

Please see attached and let us have the market of SJIB1537H prevailing at the time of the
accident on 5.5.17.

-
P T

We look forward to receive your advice asap or within the next 4 days by Monday, 5.3.18.

Best Regards

Irene Tan
Senior Executive, Claims Services (Motor)



Direct’u’ne +‘65 6594 2541 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com

Insurer Claims

ﬁ, — Team of the Year
ASIA-FACIHIL 2016

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

AMember of RURTANE INSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person
other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry:

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/Ita/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglIn...

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

V;ahicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration
Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
F!rst Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
9677D

SJB1537H

No

24 Jun 2017

KIA

CERATO 1.6(M)
Silver

2007

G4FC7U118276
KNAFE227275426724

89.7 kW (120 bhp)

$11,260.00 /
L.

02 Jan 2008 - ?

02 Jan 2008

0

$10,095.00

9l 9L,

Yes
01 Jan 2018
$5,047.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

01 Jan 2018 ﬁ L 7

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$3,300.00

$730.00

$5,777.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Jun 2017

Please do not use the Back or Forward buttons on your browser as this may alter the results of the transactions.

- OK

Land Transport Authority

Please read through the Privacy Statement, Terms of Use and Disclaimer.
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