KARZ WORKS PTE LTD 3.0
53 4B AVENUE 1 #01-23, PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK

. ! SIRGAPORE 408934
(TEL)68B445934 (FAX)68442474 - (E-MAIL) KARZWORKSSG®GMAIL.COM

REPAIR PERFORMA INVOICE

lr) 4

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE Vehicle number  FBP2457U
Make / Model ~ YAMAHA CZD300A
Chassis number ~ MH3SHOB47KK006184
Accident date  20/10/2019
Reference KK1910-30
Qty Particulars Unit Price - SGD $
R 5
1 |FRONT B/ EROWLING 7ot comijstant
1 |FRONT LH SIDE FAIRING L S ¢/t 35060 330 L
1 [FRONT LH SIDE INNER FAIRING L~ 5/t 35000 4 $~o| L—
1 |FRONT LH UNDER INNER FAIRING A S L/L/ ./ 5 e _ 28060 )20 [
1 |REAR LH FAIRING L~ &4 23000 /F0 | (_—
1 |QUEESREVER frafe fewe Ll S 12000 3.5~ [_—
|1 SET|WING MIRROR 4/H omhsL3 ¢ 25600 48 | L
1 [EXHAUST COVER Ny %000 5~0 |_—"
1 [REAR AIR INTAKE COVER " sen 108070 | "
1 |FRONT CROWLING P gk © witw— cng 400600/ 90 N
1 [FRONT RH SIDE FAIRING X Sv & 35060
1 [REAR RH SIDE FAIRING X sve _350-00
1 |REAR RH SIDE FAIRING EMBLEM ¥ $¢ « 50,00
1 [STAND @ 2yr o) L~ g1 _10060" #v [_—
1 |STAND BRACKET 3¢ SvC e
1 SET|BALANCER ¥ gy e s
1SET|FRONT FORK X sve  #af) )s:%
1 |TALLAMP ¥ sy c 35050
4585.00
Less 10% 458.50
Subtotal 4126.50
Balance C/F 4126.50
RE; - SPECIAL N
Balance B/F 4126.50
1 |REARBOX L/ S ¢l _s0060~ /9.5~
1 |GEAR SHIT srw} OIL SEAL )¢
1 [FORK OIL SEAL 4500
1 |FoRKOIL X )zoo/
1 |TYRE X 30086~
Subtotal 869.00
Balance C/F 869.00
S/No R AND
Balance B/F 4995.50
1 |REPLACE, REALIGN AND ADJUST ABOVE DAMAGE, PARTS oo 2@ PO \/
AND CHECK WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM 3
2 |TO REMOVE/REFIT, REPLACE FRONT FORK _\ _380:00
3 {SPRAY PAINTING - g Rl o™ 350:00 A9 S /
f'7 aadh Subtotal 1330.00 "
4 i~ Grand total 6325.50




KARZ WORKS PTE LTD

53 UBI AVENUE 1 #01-23, PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL.PARK

. SINGAPORE 408934

(TEL) 68445934 (FAX) 68442474 - (E-MAIL) KARZWORKSSG@GMAIL.COM

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE

Qty Particulars

REPAIR PERFORMA INVOICE

PARTS REPLA 7,
1 |[FRONT CROWLING INNER \~ <4
1 |[FRONT FENDER X sve (R)

1 [FRONT LH UNDER OUTER FAIRING |~ s (1

LKK Auto Consuitants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:

* To resurvey before/after spray painting

» To display damaged pari(s) during resurvey

« Parts prices are subject 10 confirmation

© Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis
* No illegal modification(s) e allowed

* Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
s subject 1o final approval from Insuranca Compeny

Acknowledged by Reparrer

Signature:
Date:

Vehicle number  FBP2457U
Make / Model YAMAHA CZD300A
Chassis number ~ MH3SHO847KK006184
Accident date 20/10/2019
Reference KK1910-30
Unit Price - SGD $§
e /fe|
800 / 70|~
850.00
Less 10% 85.00
Subtotal 765.00
Balance C/F 765.00

pPorts [fess /000

SPE nETT g

(ol 40




~

F/j}qp /(”2/ cG—

"Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 29 November, 2019 9:25 AM

To: Desmond; Darren

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBP 2457U FINALIZED CALCULATE ADJUSTMENT AMOUNT
UPDATED20.11.2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Dear desmond ,

Good day, 0.k will be process base on finalized total amount COR $ 1650 L /SUMP REPAIR and DOR 3 days close.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Desmond [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 November, 2019 3:19 PM

To: Hock Ann (LKK Auto); Darren

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Desmond

Subject: RE: RE : FBP 2457U FINALIZED CALCULATE ADJUSTMENT AMOUNT UPDATED20.11.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

We accept the finalised amount
COR @ $1650

DOR @ 3 DAYS

Regards,

Desmond

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1
#01-24



Paya Ubi Industrial Park
“ Singapore 408934

Tel : 68442475

Fax : 68442474

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 11:02 AM
To: Darren; claims@teamworkgarage.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: RE : FBP 2457U FINALIZED CALCULATE ADJUSTMENT AMOUNT UPDATED20.11.2019

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Darren / lititia,

Good day, Kindly attached refer FBP 2457U YAMAHA CZD300A MOTOR CYCLE finalized updated calculate
adjustment on 20.11.2019 .

COR-$ 1650

DOR -3 DAYS

Please refer adjustment updated total L/sump amount $ 1650 if agree total L/sump amount and repair days, will be
to close case.

Please to updated email back asap.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




