Kindly advise if there is any evidence(ie: PIR) from your client.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 4:56 FM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg=

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @ yahoo.com.sg=>

Subject: RE: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019 Your Ref:
CC4/11119018788/pb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per Il instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary
action.
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

, e 0dleq sepeA « Wb TlaovioNa 1 63

Brief Details.
Reference to A20191011/0139, i am here to lodge a trafiic accident report.

On 11/10/19 at about 2055hrs, while driving a vehicle bearing regisirsion plate number SH9134X,

travelling on lane 1 of Upper Pickering Street and wanting to turn right to arkroyal on pickering, lo

area, | checked my bli and making sure and no vehicle and turn right. However, while turning right
toward the hotel lobby. a foreign motorcycle beari registration plate number VCQ3937, drive ttrng
and the head of the moto collide into htnfmywhidi.Thamddmthappemﬁlm the
junction of yellow box. | wished to state that i have checked for blind spot and tum right.

| came down and make a checked on the motorycle rider. Ambulance and Traffic Police came shortly,

Ambulance checked on both me and the motocycie guy and no injuries. Both parties exchange particulars
and with the advice of police officer , to unmgaccumtrepugt.ﬂlhmmﬁ.nyhpohss
Syahid took my in car camera memory card (one samsung 84GB Micro SD card) and'issue me a

acknowledgment slip.
| did not suffer any injuries and lodging this report to inform Comfort Delgro with regard to the accident




“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely ona without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Hslao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@ yahoo.com.sg=>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 4:25 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @k .com

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2018 Your Ref:

CC4/1112018789/pb3

Dear Hsiao Tong

May | know the liability for this case.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd



Blk 4001 #01-21
Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Thursday, 31 October 2019, 05:22:10 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor <5gmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Shu Pei

Attached is the Police report & Log card for your reference.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Thursday, 31 October 2019, 08:41:34 am GMT+8, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei @ lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear 5ir / Madam,
Kindly lets us have a copy of GIA report & police report.



Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei @ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 29 October 2019 9:33 AM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @yahoo.com.sg=
Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Kindly lets us have a copy of GIA report & police report.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
CCa/11119018789/pb3 Hsiao Tong

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 25 October 2019 1:28 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@ |kkauto.com=
Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2013

Dear Shu Pei

May | know who is the case handler for this claim.

May | know the liability.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Lid
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898
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Merimen a-Claims

Claim Audit

.ﬂu_Jdit Remarks

Cim Dtl ; ) s

Modified Claimant's Name: -> -,

Cim Veh

Model (206086) ADIVA ADL 200 190cc 3W,
Changed

By

[A] Lau Shu Pei|

[A] Lau Shu Pei

Reg No: VOQ3937. Acct Date: 2019/10/11. Claim Type: TR, Insurer: India International Insurance Pte [A] Lau Shu Pei|

Clm Created |, /" 0y workshop: Sg 98 Motor Pre Lid (HQ)

::1!::” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG):

Adj Next

Rpt Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date;2019/11/04

Changed

‘;’:-: Mandate , . ed:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides,

Label Added {30653): Direct Settlement.

::li:m:;“r [Mone] -> BRYAN TANI

EI::;;Ed Claimant's Name: - -> MOHD AMIRUL BIN MOHAMAD FAJERI. Claimant's 1D: -> GEB18772P

Clm Veh

Model (206086) -> [202721) YAMAHA 135LC 135¢cc ES.

Changed

ﬂ;“di':’i'.'d Insured Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD.

:’:—Lu“:":dm Cur.Req:0.00:PODS Liability: TBA Remark: Pls provide insured video.

Adj Mext i

l'tp{ Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/11/04, Mandate Remarks: Insured SD card is with Traffic Police.
Changed

g:: Mandate Maintained:Insured SD card is with Traffic Police.

:gjq:;:datu Cur,Req:0.00:PODS Liability: TBA Remark: Pls provide insured video.

Adj Next Cur Rpt:Final Rpt, Cur Due Date:2019/11/04, Mandate Remarks: Have asked Cormfort, Insured 5D ca
:ﬁtanged rd is still with the Traffic Police,

‘;:': Hancabe Maintained: Have asked Comfort, Insured SD card is still with the Traffic Police.

Adj Mandate Cur.Req:0.00:PODS Liability: TBA Remark: Pls provide insured video, Currently pending for evidence
Request from 3rd party.

Adj Mandate
Requast
Cancelled

Adj Mandate Cur,Req:0.00:PODS Liability: 100% Remark: 3rd party submittad a copy of PIR to show that traffic p
Request olice taken action against our driver on Inconsiderate Driving.

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Adj Mandate
Set

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2019/11/04. Mandate Remarks: Agreed to do direct settlement. Rev
ert with your quantum advice

Approved:0.00:Agreed to do direct settlement, Revert with your quantum advice

Adj Rpt
Initiated

Cim Dt £
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3,
Clm Dtl s
Modified JP) Reg. Date: -> 2019/01/15.
Cim Details

Motified

[&] Lau Shu Pei
[A] Lau Shu Pei
[4] Law Shu Pei
[A] Lau Shu Pei
[A] Lau Shu Pei |
[A] Lau Shu Pei |
[A] Lau Shu Pei |

[A] Lau Shu Pei

[A] CHEW |
HSIAC TONG |

[1] Pooi Chin
Han Daniel

[1] Pooi Chin
Han Daniel

[A] CHEW
HSIADQ TONG

[1] Pooi Chin
Han Danial

[I] Pooi Chin
Han Daniel

[A] CHEW
HSIAOQ TONG

[A] CHEW
HSIAQ TONG |

[A] CHEW
HSIADQ TONG

[I] Sundari
MNagarajan

[1] Sundari
MNagarajan

[A] NUR
SHAQILAH BTE
ABDOL WAHAR

[A] NUR
SHAQILAH BTE
ABDOL WAHAB

[A] MUR
SHAQILAH BTE |
ABDOL WAHAB

[A] NUR
SHAQILAH BTE
ABDOL WAHAB



Merimen e-Claims

2/20/2020
= AUDIT TRAIL = — . ) - - 1
|Nn. On  Audit Remarks By
CurReq:2170.00:PODS Liability: 100% *Quantum: (a)COR: $2,050.00 + (b)LOU(4days x $20.00): (A] CHEW

20 Feb
27 5020 Adi Mandate con’ T i g Fee: $40,00 = Total: $2,170.00 *Vehicle Model:Yamaha 135 (134cc) *4 recomm  ycia0 TONG |

09:03 Regue endation repair days *For your approval please. |
Date From 4|75 »| pateTo 4/ TE(»] Audit Type None v| Go]
ACTIVITY = = - i ) |

|No record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History - |
Bl Ref No | aiil Date &ill Type Ace Type Acec MName CJ .".'_.'!IIIL Ref 1 Ref 2 Armaunt I
! - -
LKK Auto -
24 Oct 2019 TP Case International
2323371 09:23:18 Giisindd) Motor CD:tseulfta:ts Insuranics Pte VCQ3937 | S5H9134X 11.77
= 3 : Ltd (HQ) 2
| | LKK Auto LKK Auto
2444025 | 19702030 c:zgrsfjff | Moter Consultants | Consultants | VCQ3937 SHO134X 11.77
p 13139 | (Adj B Pteltd | PteLtd (HQ) |

hlips‘.ﬂslﬂgapore.mriman.coml’clabrr!s.ﬁndEx.::fm?fus.eI:|n:h:=I'u'l"I'Ral:l]u3ter&hssaaclhn-dsp_jimuhiﬁlwﬁcas&ilhﬂﬂmEG&HHI#SEM&CFID=GTA... 2/2



212112020 - Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*VCQ3937 (MCT19100280)
[SH9134X]
P
MOHD AMIRUL BIN MOHAMAD FAJERI
Qct 11 2019 8:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Sg 98 Motor Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (II_SG), sent on 20/02/2020 09:13 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5%$2170.00) - VCQ3937 - Claim Handler: Pooi Chin Han Daniel

Approved:2170.00.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claimsiindex.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=6747B896ACFTOKEN=0acc8482b061624c-F2... 11



Hsiao TunE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 February 2020 4:31 PM

To: Sg Motor

Cc: Sg Motor; Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on
11/10/2019 Your Ref: CC4/11119018789/pb3

Attachments: DV_VCQ3937.pdf: Il GIRO FORM.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair S 2,050.00
2. Loss of Use (4days x 520.00) 5 B0.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 40.00

Total | $2,170.00

If our offer is acceptable by your client, please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following
document to us (LKK) for our necessary action: -

Original LOD.

Original Repair Tax Invoice, addressed to M/s India International Insurance Pte Ltd.
* Original Towing Receipt.
e Original Authorisation to Act signed by your client.
s GIRO FORM (if not provided to Il before)

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matteris purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: 5g Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 4:04 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) =chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019 Your Ref:
CC4/1119018789/pb3

Dear Hsiao Tong

Attached is the Letter of Demand for your kind action.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524808 Fax: 64526858

On Tuesday, 3 December 2019, 01:23:39 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong

Attached is the police investigation result for your perusal.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Saturday, 30 November 2019, 09:51:12 am GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ |kkauto.com= wrote:



Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our below email.

Kindly advise if there is any evidence(ie: PIR) from your client.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6742-3187 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 4:56 PM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @yahoo.com.sg=>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving VCQ 3937 2 SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/1 0/2019 Your Ref:
CC4/11119018789/pb3



Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per |l instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary
action.
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Brief Details. _
Reference o A/20181011/0139, i am here to lodge a trafic accident report.

On 11/10/19 at about 2055hrs, while driving a vehicie bearing regisirsion number SH8134X,
trauailinigg‘lmu 1 of Upper Pickering Street and wanhn%tn turn right to Parkroyal on pickering, lol

area. |l ¢ ed my bllnc?s‘po( and making sure and no vehicle and turn right. However, while turning right
toward the hotel lobby, a foreign motorcycle bearing registration plate number VCQ3037, drive h
and the head of the motorcycle collide into my front right of my vehicle. The accident happened ins the
junction of yellow box. | wished to state that | have checked for blind spot and turn right.

| came down and make a checked on the motorycle rider. Ambulance and Traffic Police came shortly.

Ambulance checked on both me and the motocycle guy and no injuries. Both rmn.lea exchange particulars
and with the advice of police officer , to a traffic accident report. Before | left, traﬂir: police S5
Syahid took my in car camera memory ca (one samsung 84GB Micro SD card) and issue me a
acknowledgment slip.

| did not suffer any injuries and lodging this report to inform Comfort Delgro with regard to the accident

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg=

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 4:25 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ Ikkauto.com=

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019 Your Ref:
CC4/11119018789/pb3

5



Dear Hsiao Tong

May | know the liability for this case.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Thursday, 31 October 2019, 05:22:10 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @yahoo.com.sg= wrote:

Dear Shu Pei

Attached is the Police report & Log card for your reference.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21



Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526888

On Thursday, 31 October 2019, 08:41:34 am GMT+8, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei @ lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,
Kindly lets us have a copy of GIA report & police report.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 29 October 2019 9:33 AM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg=
Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor rprise hoo.co >: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ kkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 91 34X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.



Kindly lets us have a copy of GIA report & police report.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/11119018789/pb3 Hsiao Tong

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei @ lkkauto.com | fax: E741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Sg Motor <gsgmotor2000 .COMm.sg>
Sent: Friday, 25 October 2019 1:28 PM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@| to.com:=

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2018

Dear Shu Pei

May | know who is the case handler for this claim.

May | know the liability.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd



Blk 4001 #01-21
Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



AR2020 Merimen e-Claims

«+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER---[FEnding for Sur\m\r REpurt}

Direct Settlement

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - ]
: A | Motified [Est Submitted Ad) Assigned | Ad) Rpt Adj Submitted [ins authed Status |
|07 Nov 2019 22 0ct 2019 ge5 0sp 00 $$2,050.00 Pending for Survey
Hgin Edit Reg | a:00 Edit Estimates | | view Rpt | ' Raport
Edit Adj Rpt ” J_ Cancel Case | |

Main Reference Claim Details Show All

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - [Created by adjuster]
| Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. MNo.: 199303821R

Main ;
Cisimant: MOHD AMIRUL BIN MOHAMAD FAJERI, ID: GS81B772P

Vehicle Reg. | 11/10/2018 20:00 - :59

Mo.: Date of "”55:. [8 Months and 26 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

VCQ3937

(Claim Type: TP / MCT19100280 :ﬂﬂ“*’;:?,“” MCOMO015 (TP, Fire & Theft)

F‘;"-e_h'iu:}le Reg.
Mo, |SH9134X
(Insured):

Policy No.
[{Claimant):

| Excess:

\Repairer: | S9 Motor Trading Pte Ltd (HQ) 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1 #01-21, 569622 Ang Mo Kio - Tel:

lencli"d  |India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Peel Chin Han Daniel]

\Adjuster: _|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .., [Handled by BRYAN TANI] ... [Final Rpt due 04/11/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

|+ IIl_5G (20/02/2020): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$2170.00) - VCQ3937 - Claim Handler: Pooi Chin Ha...

[+ II_SG (06/12/201%): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (550.00) - VCQ3937 - Claim Handler: Pogi Chin Han D...
| [+ III_SG(19/11/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - VCQ3937 - Claim Handler: Pooi Chin Han Daniel

e III_SG (07/11/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - VCQ3937 - Claim Handler: Pooi Chin Han Danlel

view All |  Compose Case Mail | |
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Claim Documents

*VCQ3937 (MCT19100280)
[SH9134X]

TP

MOHD AMIRUL BIN MOHAMAD FAJERI
Oct 11 2019 8:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
59 Motor Trading Pte Ltd
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregno1gssor18r)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/lN9018789/DP5352

Date: 05/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  India International Insurance Pte Lid Palicy No: MCOMODO15
Clsmant Mene'®  voosasr Insured Vehicle No:  SH9134X
Date of Loss: 111072019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No:  MCT19100280
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: VCQ3937
Make & Model; YAMAHA 135LC, 135¢cc ES Engine No: G3G5ENTT410
Reg. Date: 16/01/2019 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: PMYUGOB10K0077390
Calour: Black Odometer: 26987 km
Engine Capacity: 134 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Good  Steering (Serviceable): Yes [Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 70/90 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 80/90 R17
Front Left Side: Maxxis 2 mm Rear Left Side: Maxxis 2 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre reads depth
|COST OF CLAIMS — = ~ Repairers  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 3,845.00 2,268.00 1,577.00 41.01
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 600.00 310.00 290.00 48.33
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 4,445.00 2,578.00 1,867.00 42.00
Approved Total (Overridden) (55) 2,050.00
Nett Amount (S§) 4,445.00 2,050.00 2,395.00 53.88
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x $$20.00/day) (S$) 80.00
+ Other Costs (S5§) 40.00
Nett Liability (S$) 2,170.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 22110/2019
58 Mator Trading Pte Ltd
Date Inspecled: 23/10/2019 Inspected At: BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1 #01-21
Singapore 569622
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster:  BRYAN TANI Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

hltpﬂnrsingapura.rnenman.mr‘n!::tairnsﬁndex.r:frn?iusab-nFMTRadjuster&lusfeav:ti0n=ganrprinu'pt&c:ﬂsaid=330130&91&:!=320932&EFED=EE1921 308C... 14



352020 Adjuster Report

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stafed heveln, Such inspection has been cared out fo the best of our knowledge and ahiiify but
any other Nability undsr any ofher circumsiances s hereby axpressly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Adjuster Report

| Reference
?Part Source:

Parts:
Labour:

|Print Code:

Validity:

Repairer's

{Last Synchronised: 05 Mar 2020}

YAMAHA 135LC 135¢cc ES (Model not available in database)
(Price-denominated Standard List)
{Unsubmitted, no print-code for VCQ3937)

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with the
END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

[Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Gty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *HEAD LAMP Not Necessary 320.00F =-FL
2 1 *HANDLE BAR Bent 115.00F *115.00 FL
3 1 *HANDLE BAR BRACKET Mot Necessary 95.00F *-FL
4 2 *HANDLE GRIP Mot Necessary 160.00F *-FL
5 1 *SET BALANCER MNis Cut f Ofs Not Necessary 160.00F *80.00 FL
] 1 *FORK UNDER BRACKET Damaged 180.00F *180.00FL
7 1 *SET FORK TUBE (2PCS) Bent / Distorted 480.00F *480.00 FL
8 1 *SET CONE BEARING Damaged 120.00F *120.00 FL
9 1 *FRONT RIM Repair 320.00F “-FL
110 1 *BRAKE LEVER Not Necessary 65.00F *-FL
1 1 *GEAR PEDAL Bent 65.00F *65.00 FL
12 1 *LEG SHIELD - LH Mot Necessary 125.00F *-FL
13 1 *FRONT MUDGUARD Broken 250.00F *250.00 FL
14 1 *FRONT PANEL Cut 185.00F *185.00 FL
15 1 *FRONT LH FAIRING Cut 195.00F *185.00 FL
16 1 *CENTRE LEG SHIELD Mtg Deformed 150.00F *150.00 FL
1 *REAR LH FAIRING Cut f Mtg Broken 165.00F *165.00 FL
18 1 *FRONT BOX Broken 135.00F *135.00FL
19 1 *FOOTREST Bent 65.00F *65.00 FL
20 1 *FOOTREST BRACKET Bent 135.00F *135.00 FL
21 1 *SET FOOTREST - RUBBER Not Necessary 80.00F *-FL
22 A *REAR-BOX Cut 280.00F3 “180.00F3

F=Franchise part. S=Spchett, L=ListltemDisc.

Sub Total (S$) 3,845.00 2,500.00

- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (S3%) 0,00 232.00

Total Parts (S§) 3,845.00 2,268.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected,

Recommended Labour

Mo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TOWING FEE. Wew 40,00 0.00

2 REMOVE & REPLACE NECESSARY PARTS ALIGN & ETC. MNew 250.00 180.00

3 REMOVE & REPLACE FORK, ASSY, TO TOP UP FORK OIL. Mew 120.00 80.00

4 RE-ALIGN BODY ALIGNMENT. MNew 190.00 50.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 600.00 310.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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