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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October, 2019 1:30 PM

To: Sg Motor; ‘sur@Ikkauto.com’, Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Pooi Chin Han Daniel

Subject: RE: Plse arrange PRI on bike VCQ 3937 as per attached.
Attachments: VCQ 3937 PRLPDF

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle VCQ3937 and let us have your report urgently.

N : ! A
This claim will be handled by Danigl, P Leen
*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen. T 4 HT "?
Thank You. vl v

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

;.\I [H['}Jh

INTERN&TJDN&L
InsuraNCE

E I NG AFORE

&
( 2
b g Kerving the region wnee 1867

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Sg Motor [mailto:sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg)

Sent: 22 October, 2015 11:31 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: Plse arrange PRI on bike VCQ 3537 as per attached.

Plse arrange LKK to survey bike VCQ 3937

Thank You

Regards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

----- Forwarded message -----
Erom: Mator Claim - Il <motorclaim @ii.com.sg=
To: Sg motor enterprise Giam <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>; Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg=
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Cc: Pooi Chin Han Daniel <danielpooi@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2019, 09:12:30 am GMT+8
Subject: RE: Plse arrange PRI on bike VCQ 3937 as per attached.

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle VCQ3937 and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Daniel.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

[NDiIA
INTE RMATIONAL

|NSURANCE
S 1 NG AFORE
Serving the rFeginn wnce 1957

64 Cecil Street; #05 - IOB Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Sg motor enterprise Giam [mailto:sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sq]

Sent: 18 October, 2019 3:32 PM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg=>; Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com.sg=
Subject: Re: Plse arrange PRI on bike VCQ 3937 as per attached.



- Hiall,

pls arrange LKK 10 survey.

thank you

rose

59 Motor Trading Pte Lid

On Friday, 18 October 2019, 02:36:37 pm GMT+8, Motor Claim - Il <rmotorclaim @iii.com.sg= wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

« LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
« Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Lid

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections
to the above list.

Best Aegards,

Gabriel Wee

_ INDIA
iz

| INTerRnaTIONAL

[nsurance
S I NGAPORE
Serwing the rogion vnce J907



84 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Sg Motor [mailto:sgmotor2000 @yahoo.com.sq]

Sent: 18 October, 2019 11:26 AM

To: Motor Claim - |ll <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: Plse arrange PRI on bike VCQ 3837 as per attached.

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Plse arrange PRI on bike VCQ 33937 as per attached.

Thank You

Regards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and outside
Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance Association
of Singapore. This enables us 10 ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes
investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know
immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely far the persan to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
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you by misiake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

(of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and outside
Singapore) and/or with ather insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance Association
of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes
investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know
immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged infarmation.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
natified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Assaciation of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawtful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 1:24 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Sg Maotor; Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on
11/10/2019 Your Ref: CC4/11119018789/pb3

Attachments: VCQ 3937-PIR pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Attached is the police investigation result for your perusal.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Bik 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Saturday, 30 November 2019, 09:51:12 am GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@ lkkauto.com= wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our below email.

Kindly advise if there is any evidence(ie: PIR) from your client.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew [Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 4:56 PM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @yahoo.com.sg>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @ yahoo.com.sg=

Subject: RE: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019 Your Ref:
CC4/11119018789/pb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per 1l instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos { PIR) for our necessary
action.
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

[l oM seped - W', V120\V0\ 2 | T 63

Brief Details.
Reference 10 A/20191011/0139, i am here to lodge a trafiic accident report.

On 11/10/19 at about 2055hrs, while driving a vehicle bearing regisirsion plate number SH9134X,

travelling on lane 1 of Upper Pickering Street and wanting to tum right to Parkroyal on pickering, lob
area, I?:%ecked my blir'u:f:e ot and ma%ng sure and novaaicle and turn right. However, while turning right

toward the hotel lobby. a foreign motorcycle bearing registration plate number VCQ3937, drive straigh
and the head of the hn?mtnrc clg collide into my front right of my vehicle. The accident happened Inside the
junction of yellow box. | wisruad to state that | have checked for biind spot and tumn right.

| came down and make a checked on the motorycle rider, Ambulance and Traffic Police came shortly.

Ambulance checked on both me and the motocycle guy and no injuries. Both parties exchange particulars
and with the advice of police officer , to lodge a traffic accident report. Before | left, traffic police SS

Syahid took my in car camera memory card (one samsung 84GB Micro SD card) and issue me a
acknowledgment slip.
| did not suffer any injuries and lodging this report to inform Comfort Delgro with regard to the accident

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4085933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 4:25 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com=

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @ yahoo.com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019 Your Ref:
CC4/11118018789/pb3

Dear Hsiao Tong

May | know the liability for this case.

Thank You

Hegards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526858

On Thursday, 31 October 2019, 05:22:10 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 & yahoo.com.sg> wrote:



Dear Shu Pei

Attached is the Police report & Log card for your reference.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Thursday, 31 October 2019, 08:41:34 am GMT+8, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei @ lkkauto.com=> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,
Kindly lets us have a copy of GIA report & police report.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned



Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Adrmin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei @ Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuta)
Sent: Tuesday, 29 October 2019 9:33 AM
To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg=

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @yahoo.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht & lkk

COMm=>

Subject: RE: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019

Dear 5ir / Madam,
Thank you for your email,

Kindly lets us have a copy of GIA report & police report.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/11119018789/pb3 Hsiao Tong

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 25 October 2019 1:28 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUto) <shupei@| .coms

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise @ yahoo.com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on 11/10/2019

6



Dear Shu Pei

May | know who is the case handler for this claim.

May | know the liability.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



Traffic Police

S‘NEAPDRE . 10 Ubi Avonue 3_
POLICE FORCE Singapore 408055
Fax +BE 8547 6250
W Dolice. 00w, S
Our Ref : TRAP/DO3E/2019
Dale : 30 October, 2019

MOHD AMIRUL BIN MOHAMAD FAJERT °
C/0 23 GENTING ROAD

#07-01

SINGAPORE 349481

Dear SirMadam - T,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING .VCQ3937 & SH9134X ALONG UPPER PICKERING
STREET ON 11 OCTOBER 2019 AT 2106 HRS

I refer to the above accident.

2. Please be informed that we have completed our investigations which
revealed that the driver of SH9134X had committed an offence of Inconsiderate Driving
under Section 65(b) of the Road Traffic Act, Chapter 276. Action has been initiated
against the said driver for the said offence.

3 If you have any queries, please contact the Investigation Officer, T.
Jeyathesh at 65476232 or via email Thabagesh JEYATHESH@spf gov.sg

Yours f[:ﬂ]fuﬂy

Perlin Chong
Jar Head Traffic Investigation
Traffic Police

A FORCE FOR THE NATION




121002019 Meriman e-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL
23 0ct 2019 ’ ; c E [A] Lau
1 15:05 Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> -, Shu Pei
23 Oct 2019 [A] Lau
A :
2 1508 Clm Yeh Model Changed (206086} ADIVA AD1 200 190cc 3W, Shu Pei
3 230ct 20198 o ereoted Reg Mo: VEQ3937, Acct Date: 2019/10/11, Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India Internation  [A] Lau
15:05 al Insurance Pte Ltd (HG). Workshop: Sg 98 Motor Pte Ltd (HQ) Shu Pel
23 Oct 2019 " : [A] Lau
4 1505 Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lbd (HQ): Shy Pel
23 Oct 2019 - i . [A] Lau
5 iz.0c Adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2018/11/04 Shu Pei
23 Oct 2019 : y . [A] Lau
& 15:05 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0,00,Reinsp:Adj decides. Shu Pel
23 Oct 2019 iy [A] Lau
7 15:05 Label Added {30653):Direct Settlement, Shu Pei
23 0ct 2019 i Z f [A] Lau
B 15:05 Adj Adjuster Assigned  [None] -> BRYAN TANI Shu Pei
01 Mov 2019 Claimant’s Name: - -> MOHD AMIRUL BIN MOHAMAD FAJERL, Claimant’s ID: -> G681 [A] Lau
? 1p:as Cim o) Madified BT72P. Shu Pai
01 Now 2019 ' [A] Lau
10 10018 Clm Veh Model Changed [2060868) -= (202721) YAMAHA 135LC 135cc ES. Shu Pei
11 ‘i’é_*‘l‘g“ 2% eym Dl Modified Insured Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. [Silu'-;*;
D6 Nov 2019 i ; ; —— [2] ZHEW
12 1502 Adj Mandate Reguest Cur.Req:0.00:PODS Liability: TBA Remark: Pls provide insured video. H&LAD
! TOMNG
1] Pooi
1 ] i : R ; [ ;
b I.‘J?_Nw 2019 Adj Next Rpt Changed Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/11/04, Mandate Remarks: Insured 5D card is with Chin Han
09:42 Traffic Police.
Daniel
[1] Paai
14 g;r:g-.- 2018 Adj Mandate Set Maintained: Insured S0 card is with Traffic Police. Chin Han
: Daniel
18 Nov 2019 [A] CHEW
15 0814 Adj Mandate Request Cur,Req:0.00: PODS Liability: TBA Remark: Pls provide insured video, H5IAD
] TONG
> . 1] Pooi
19 Nov 2019 Cur Rpt:Final Rpt, Cur Due Date:2019/11/04, Mandate Remarks: Have asked Comfor L
18 9g.44 Adj Next Rpt Changed 'y, req SO card is still with the Traffic Police. e
19 Nav 2019 . . 1] Pooi
17 ng:.44 Adj Mandate Set Maintained:Have asked Comfort, Insured SD card is still with the Traffic Police. Chin Han
} Daniel
15 30 Nov 2019 Adj Mandate Request Cur,Req:0.00:PODS Liability: TBA Remark: Pls provide insured video, Currently pendin [‘ﬂsﬁzgw
09:51 ayered g for evidence from 3rd party, TONG
i 04 Dec 2019 Adj Mandate Request [AI']ISC;:E}W
09:06 Cancelled TONG
2p DADEC2019 o ouest CUrReq:0.00:PODS Liability: 100% Remark: 3rd party submitted a copy of PIR to sho [‘gg‘i:gw
09:07 ) q w that traffic police taken action against our driver on Inconsiderate Driving. TONG
. . 1]
06 Doc 2019 Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2019/11/04. Mandate Remarks: Agreed to do direct [
21 14:36 Adj Next Rpt Changed settlement, Revert with your quantum advice Sundari
Nagarajan
06 Dec 2019 (1
e Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00:Agreed to do direct settlement. Revert with your quantum advice Sundari
; Magarajan
Date From 4|77 »| pateTo 4|75 »| Audit Type None v o
ACTIVITY
Mo record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
India
LEK futo .
24 Oct 2019 TP Case International
7 :
2323371 0%:73:18 (Insurer) Motor Consultants Insurance Pta VCQ393 SHI134% 11.77
Pte Ltd Ltd [HO)
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Hsiao Tonﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 4.04 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Ce: Sg Motor; Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving VCQ 3937 & SH 9134X along Upper Pickering Street on
11/10/2019 Your Ref: CC4/11119018789/pb3

Attachments: VCQ 3937-LOD.pdf; VCQ 3937-PIR.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Attached is the Letter of Demand for your kind action.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524888 Fax: 64526898

On Tuesday, 3 December 2019, 01:23:39 pm GMT+8, Sg Motor <sgmotor2000 @ yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong

Attached is the police investigation result for your perusal.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Saturday, 30 November 2019, 09:51:12 am GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our below email.



