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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

ks SEses e S
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2019 12:09 pm
To: Pang Xiu Shi
Subject: RE: Enquire on Market value -GBD4565R (URGENT)

Dear Xiu Shi,

The market value for GBD 4565R is § 32K (est) as at October 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Pang Xiu Shi <xiushi_pang@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 6:28 pm

Subject: Enquire on Market value -GBD4565R (URGENT)
Importance: High

Hi,

Any update on the below email?

Have a great week ahead!

Pang Xiu Shi
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2586 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | xiushi_pang@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong B

uilding, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 2004122126 | msig.com.sg. & & & ©)

AMember of BNETALNNE INSURANCE GROUP



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Pang Xiu Shi <xiushi_pang@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 October 2019 2:43 pm

Subject: Enquire on Market value -GBD4565R (URGENT)

Attachments: Report_ SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) - GBD4565R.pdf; PARF_COE

Rebate Enquiry.pdf

Importance: High

Hi,

Please assist to check the market value of GBD4565R. DOA: 12/10/2019

Thank you. .
Pl
74 Wi
Uer b AN
Have a great week ahead! rod
Pang Xiu Shi

Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2586 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | xiushi pang@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
 JoNinlo

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg -

AMemberof B kYra08 INSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person
other than the intended reciplent is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If vou are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Oct 2019

Company
557H

GBD4565R
No
210ct 2019

TOYOTA

TOYOTA DYNA 150 MANUAL

Silver

2014

1KD2454980
JTFAT35Y60K203773
$27,856.00

31 0ct 2014

310ct 2014

0

$1,393.00

)

104
$0.00

30 Oct 2024

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$57,389.00

$28,833.00
$28,833.00



?aA Singapore Government Agency Website
> Back to OneMotoring

* Enquire Vehicle Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.
GBD4565R

Make / Model
TOYOTA / TOYOTA DYNA 150 MANUAL

Vehicle Type :
A50 - Goods (Closed) Van/Van Panel (Delivery)

Vehicle Scheme :
Normal

Propellant :
Diesel

Mator No.:

Power Rating:

Maximum Laden Weight :
3500 kg

Year Of Manufacture :
2014

Lifespan Expiry Date :
30 Oct 2034

Quota Premium :

$57,389.00

Road Tax Expiry Date :
310ct 2019

Inspection Due Date:
310ct 2019

CO2 Emission:
257.00 (g/km)

CO Emission:

NOx Emission:

Fees To Be Paid For Transfer

Transfer Fees

Road Tax Renewal - 6 months {01 Nov 2019 to 30 Apr 2020)
Road Tax Renewal - 12 months (01 Nov 2019 to 31 Oct 2020)

Message

Vehicle Attachment 1:
No Attachment

Chassis No, :
JTFAT35Y60K203773

Engine No.:
1KD2454980

Engine Capacity :
2982 cc

Maximum Power Output :

Unladen Weight :
1740 kg

Original Registration Date :
310ct 2014

COE Category :
C - Goods Vehicle & Bus

COE Expiry Date:
300ct 2024

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

Intended Transfer Date:
230ct 2019

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised Amount :

HC Emission:

PM Emission :

$25.00
$0.00
$0.00

The fees above do not include any late road tax fees, which apply if road tax or lay-up has expired. You can use the digital service Enquire Road Tax Payable to check if there are any late road tax fees,

Any road tax that has been paid for the vehicle will be transferred to the next owner.

This vehicle has a road tax Over Payment of $80.00. This Over Payment may be used to offset Road Tax payable and Transfer Fees respectively, where applicable.
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10/23/2019

Used Toyota Dyna Car for Sale in Singapore, Hon Brothers Motor - sgCarMart

Homie » Used Cars » Hon Br

Toyota Dyna 150 3.0M

Financial &
Price $33,800
Depreciation $6,740 fyr

sGCARMART.COM
MNew Cars Sell My Car Directory
r.nn,ha DEALS TO OVER sty
50 DESTINATIONS 56
| : ScootPlus from s17T*
foyotadyna K

View models with similar depea

Mileage NA,
Road Tax NA.
Dereg Value

COE $23,605
Engine Cap 2,982 cc
Curb Weight 1,800 kg
Type of Vehicle Fruck
Features

Manufactured

Transmission

$11,835 as of today (change) oMY

ARF

No, of Owners

View specs of the Toyats Dyna 150 (2014)

Description

Timing Belt Jux Changed, New Paintworks, In House Finance Available,

Login
Products Insurance Articles
i X
No more payment processing fes! scoot
“TaCs apply %]

Depreciation ¥ | | 2014 v] [vehideType v =

#SS01 18 Similar Research Photos. Map
Fuel Type Diesel
Reg Date 27-0ct-2014

(Syrs 3days COE left)

2014

Manual

$27,856

$1,393

Category
Status
Available
Resources
m Car Valuation - Free
: Find out the market value of your existing car for free, Get startd

Vehicle Evaluation
e Afraid of lemans? Request to have this car evaluated professionally. Find out more

Posted o 18-00-2019 | Last Updated on: 21-0ct-2019

Transfer Fee
Down Payment
1st Instalment

Insurance

Total Upfront Payment

Products and Services

for Brivats &
ci
a

5507 Day,
=/

Reverse Camird

$25

$3,380 (change)

4593

You'll alsa need a valid car insurance to drive
this vehicle. 18% off with code CAR18

Get a q

$3,998
LWithou

£ ins

uote now!

Instant Upgrade To Your Car's
Performance

3A Car Mat

Powered by

Fi aviva

h saier for £t ficure

Wide angle FHD Car Cam With
Wifi for Truck

FOR SALE

Bidded Carplate for Sale

Check out the specialist workshop for Commercial Vehicles: Hua Kian Motar Workshop

Tags: Tuyotn Uyvna, toyota dyna, 2014 Tovera Dyna, 2014 tuyuta dyna, Toyum, Dyna,

Recommended for you

, dyna, Used Toyota

50K

AR

Prce(SGO)

5K

30K
May-14

Sign up

Forum Resources

Jan1s May-15

Click on the point to view the vehide

Shaortlist

Report Error

Location
Office No

Contact Person(s)

Compare Add note

Maore Actions

Hon Brothers Motor

» gealar's pricebst

# 15 vehis sold | 26 vehe available
31 West Coast Highway #01-27

Search cars nearby IF

West Coast Car Marr

67788862

Hong 90460337

Ivan Ho 97200193

Sam Tan 97421147

Zhong 88003223
15 0f 18

https:.f/www.sgcarrnart.comlused_carslinfo.php?ID=862297&DL=1 328
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