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51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA Ul INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19006694MFSH Date: 05 Nov 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19018785/Dvi3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Lid

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SHC8564B .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 23/10/2019 at the premises of M/s CHUNNI MOTOR. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8% 56,075.96
Revised Estimate Amount -5%  24.881.92
“Check” Items Amount 1 8% =
Market Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value (8% -
Mett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the FRONT PORTIOMN.

Yours faithfully

Bryan Ang
Licensed Appraiser



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 Firs1 Capital Insurance Limited toRee he 1o00o0ose  C8T Reg Mo M2 OODIETE-9
B Ratfies Quay #21-00 Sangapore 048580
Tek (B5) G222 2311 Fauc (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Foaps Undersritieg Degt: 36 Robinsen Road #1E-01 City House Singapore 0B8ET7
Tel [65) 6507 IB4E Fax: [B5) 6507 3849
wiwhw msfirstrapital com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 21-10-2019 Our Ref No. D19006694MFSH
Accident Date 20-10-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHCBaa7u Third Party Vehicle. SHCB5648
Survey Location AMK AUTOPQINT, SOON HOCK MOTOR, #01-05/08,
Contact Person. LYMNMN OR IRENE - 65421726
Contact No. 65427162/ 0 Fax No. 65426039
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appciotao LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

CHUNNI MOTOR WORK

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor NA
Officer Incharge JOANMEY

FTELTD

Attention. NIL

TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repor via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, November 05, 2019 5:17 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: 'Joanne Yong'; SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006694MFSH/1
Attachments: SHC85648 DOA 20102019 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHCB5648B
Date of survey : 23/10/2019
Number of days : 12 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong(@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2019 10:34 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006694MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards



G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phome: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto,com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{4080933)

From: CWS Maotor Claims {mailtu::wsmoturclaims@msfirstcapital.com 5g]
sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 5:43 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; loanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006694MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

MNote: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com




hunri Motor Works Pte Lt

VR
1

CHUNNI MOTOR WORK FTE LTD

21-10-1G: 14108
~{0=1G:14: 08

REFPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLENO : SHC 8564B DATE :21.10.2019

MAKE 2 TEL : 6542 5119

MODEL : HYUNDAI i40 FAX : 6542 6039 FCI

}L Qt:v=_ Parts Desl:rigtium’ Labour ;. Type Unit Price Amount_J
Bonnet 1o $ 226590 |-
Bonnet Hinge (LH/RH) - s 4100 | 8 82.00
Bonnet Lock ¢ 5 36.90
Bonnet Absorber 3 58.10 | S 116.20
Bonnet Insulator =+ c/onol) $ 19650
Bonnet Insulator Clips S 8.40 |
Radiator Grille ' g 1,110.10
Radiator Grille H Emblem L\, . s 39,50
Front Bumper Cover 14 § 1,052.20
Front Bumper Sponge $ 99.20 |
Front Bumper Reinforcement 725 5 402.10
Front Bumper Grille (LH) g S 93.60
Front Bumper Grille Airduct (LH) i '— 3 26.20
Front Bumper Lip ! 3 54,90
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH/RH) g 2240 | 8 44 80
Front Bumper Bracket (LH/RH) © | $ 2460 |8 49.20
Headlamp Support Top Cover </« § 22260
Headlamp Support Panel Assy lewvy S 907.40|-
Headlamp (LH/RH) | Ty S 1,388.00 | 8 2,776.00
Headlamp Halug-:n Bulb {R.H} ] 5 14.40
Radiator /2 Pwudhwa-| ¥ $ 69830 |
Radiator Fan Blade,Cowling,Motor Assy~7 v 5 79295
Radiator Bracket (RH/LH) s 6.50 | $ 13.00
Radiator Hose Upper .. 5 36.50
Radiator Hosc Lower L 36.50
Radiator Expansion Tank i 3 2830
Radiator Guard 5 2000 1S 40.00 | -
Hom Unit (LH/RH) 012 Lo S 73.80 | 14760 |
Hom Wire * 15 156.50
Front Fender (RH) § 56630
Front Fender Apron Panel (RH) o) o. 4. g 637.00
Front Fender Shield (LEVRH) 2| & otalel] b 17490 |8 349.80
Adr Duct $ 134.60
Aircon Condenser 7wt sl | 5 927.50 | L
Aireon Suction & Liquid Hose 4 24 S 624.00
Aircon Discharge Hose & |/} $  162.60 < |
Aircon Compressor = =gt $ 2,578.00 |-<
Frt Safety Belt (Assy) (LH/RH) < s 47540 | S 950.80
Wiper Container vy s 5 61.90
Wiper Container Motor .- ] 75.00
Front Wheel Rim (RH) 1450 QU5 |s 32530
Front Wheel Hub Cap (RH) § 107.10}.
Front Wheel Bearing $ 540,50 |
Front Shock Absorber (Assy) (RH) r/ S 34220
Front Shock Absorber Mounting (RH) . 3 108.80
Front Drive Shaft (RH) « $ 1,030.80

{ A7



2 & 1Chu otor Works Pte Lid Spon Hock i 2 1/ 8
SHC 8564B
_=er -!. _ Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price —%‘ Amount '
Rack & Pinion Assy i S  969.60
STG Tie End S 62.60
Stabilizer Bar § 25230
Stabilizer Bar Bush (RH) . £ 16.40
Stabilizer Bar Link . b 61.10
Stabilizer Bracket s 24.00
Front Suspension Lower Arm (RH) ~/+/ § 52930
Front Chasis Member -~ 5[9 $ 1,060.70
Knuckle Arm (RH) .| §  552.00 S
Fan Belt .. 567 SM s &30 S840
Fan Belt Tensioner < i~ S 26340 |7 X
Engine Mounting === 7 § 45630 |~
Engine Under Cover 0w | clisled 1,4 b 334,60 |/
Engine Crossmember * . 5 2,094.40
Inter Cooler s $ 1003250 /
Inter Cooler Mounting (2 PCS) .. 5 25.90
Hosz B To Inter Cooler 5 229.70
Hose C To Inter Cooler Inlet + §  294.50
Pipe To Inter Cooler «. 3 167.05
Pipe To Inter Cooler Qutlet L. § 24455
ABS Sensor 5 234,00
Wiring-ECM § 3,243.00
Wiring- FEM,RH 5 168.00
Actuator - Swirl Control v 1o g[[}t"é 7?0 § 81460 |\
Intake Manifold Assy i § 1,141.10
Airbag Complete & hvidnl § 294850 | L
Airbag Control Module <4<l § 1,140.40 |
Steering Angle Assy 5+ . s 1,150.60 |+
Sensor Assy Impact -Frt Inpact '« $ 19830
Airbag Sensor 77 £ A ide $ 580,00 | § 1,160.00 |7
Electric Power ét:ering Iy g 3,641.00
Gearbox N % 14,808.00
Gearbox Mounting . 1 gcc Lt‘i A4510s 21540
SUB TOTAL 1z QL s 60,719.95
LESS 20% § 12,143.99
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 48,575.96
Front Number Plate 270 e [clasle s § (12500 |Netr L
Front No Plate Trim Cover 77 1. Blirs 30.00 [Mett
Front Fender Advertisement Logo (LH/RH) 0= ¢ wid & 5 200.00 (Nett
Front Door Comfort Logo (RF) ) b 75.00 |Nett
Front Door Advertisement Logo (RH) ., 3 100.00 |[Nett +
Front Tyre (RH) 14 Jes 5 10 3 216.00 |Nett »
$ 646.00




B 4:08 ;Chunni Motor Works Fie LTo Scon Hook = B &
SHC 8564B
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Tvpe | Unit Price Amount
Labour Charge
Panel Beating 5§ -1,800.00
Spray Painting Charge S K750.00
Wiring Charge 3 100.00
Tuff Kote $ 15000
Towing Charge $ 50.00
Front Chassis Alignment Charge § 40000 |°
Remove/Refix Undercarriage (FRT) S 20800 | == 150~
FRT Wheel Alignment $ 12888 | == Go|-
Remove/Refix Aircon & Refill Gas 338008 |s 15000
Remove/Refix Engine/Gearbox S 650.00 |-
Re-set Frt ABS System § 200,00
R/Refix Air Bag/Steering Wheel/Dashboard/Seat S  550.00
Diagnostic & Resetting To Erase Fault Code § 480,00
TOTAL LABOUR S 6,600.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § 55,811.96
5615
24805 .06
e vﬂ} 25%.10
|" ..-——"-__—F.—
2.505%.06
L l 5| Q0 000 \ 5
4
LMK Auto Corfsultants hence notify
thiz Repairer ¢f the following:
» |o resurvey beloradafter spray painting
+ Jod jamgged p ing resune
R o Prepuice” basis

=2

veyed] and

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared afier the vehicle is surveyed by a moter Surveyer appointed by the insurance company.




B T o O Tl o CrRER D Matnr Works

1-19;12:03  ; Chur orks Pte Lid Soon Hock - b

C_HUNNI MOTOR WORK PTE LTD

EREPAIR ESTIMATE®,

\EHICLE NO : SHC 8564B (Supplementary) DATE :1.11.2019

n1AKE : TEL :65425119

MAODEL : HYUNDAI i40 FAX :6542 6039

Oy Parts Deseription/ Labour Tyvpe Unit Price Amount
Radiator Hose Upper Support Bracket 2\, S 12800 |
Idle Pulley o1, 8 189.50

SURB TOTAL § 31750
LESS 20% s 6
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 3 254.00 >

S

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quanum will
be prepared afier the vehicle is surveyed by 2 motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapere 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4313

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607 198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref : CS/FCI19018785/0yd3n2

3?56352?1?3 IﬁgL?éAE%INGAPDHE 068877 By, "R Wmml”"““wm
Code: FCI2
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHC 8887U Veh. Inspected SHC 85648
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19006694MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANMNE YONG Assign Date 2211072019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUOBOGTD Colour BLUE
Odometer 573849 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/80 R16 HANKOOK 5 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/10/2019 Inspection Date 2310/2019
Survey held at CHUNNI MOTOR WORK PTE LTD
BLK 10 ANG MO KIO IND, PARK 2A,
#03-19 AMK AUTOPOINT
SINGAPORE 56B047.
5a, Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED OM A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR:

12 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Req. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No_1 of 4
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 85648
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ Chop {g“ [sj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOMNET BUCKLED 2,265.90 2,265.90
2|BONNET HINGE (LH/RH) @$41.00 TO REPAIR SEE 82.00
LABOUR
1|BONMNET LOCK BEMT 36.90 36.90
2|BOMNET ABSORBER @$58.10 NOT NECESSARY 116.20 -
1|BONNET INSULATOR BENT /! CRUMPLED 196.50 196.50
1|BONMNET INSULATOR CLIPS MECESSARY 8.40 8.40
1|RADIATOR GRILLE BROKEMN 1,110.10 1,110.10
1|RADIATOR GRILLE H EMBLEM NECESSARY 39.50 39.50
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER TORN 1,052.20 1,052.20
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE TORN 99.20 99,20
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BROKEN 40210 a02.10
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE (LH) BROKEN / 93.60 93.80
DISLODGE
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE AIRDUCT (LH}) BROKEM / 26.20 26.20
DISLODGE
1|FRONT BUMPER LIP MNOT NECESSARY 54.90 £
2| FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (LH/RH) @$22.40 MOT NECESS5ARY 44,80 -
2|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (LH/RH) @$24.60 O/S BROKEN / N/S 49.20 24 60
MNOT MECESSARY
1|HEADLAMP SUPFORT TOP COVER CRACKED 22260 222.60
1|HEADLAMP SUPPORT PANEL ASSY BROKEM a07.40 907 .40
2| HEADLAMP (LH/RH) @$1388.00 BROKEM / 2,776.00 2,776.00
MOUNTING
BROKEM
1|HEADLAMP HALOGEN BULB (RH) NOT NECESSARY 14.40 -
1|RADIATOR PUMCTURE / BENT 658.30 698.30
1|RADIATOR FAN BLADE,COWLING MOTOR ASSY BROKEN 792.95 TO2.95
2| RADIATOR BRACKET (RH/LH) @%$6.50 MOT NECESSARY 13.00 -
1|RADIATOR HOSE UPPER NOT MECESSARY 36.50 -
1|RADIATOR HOSE LOWER NOT MECESSARY 36.50 -
1|RADIATOR EXPANSION TAMK NOT NECESSARY 28.30 -
2|RADIATOR GUARD @3%20.00 NOT MECESSARY 40.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19018785/Dyd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 1561 FAXN: G256 4313

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Rea. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.2 of 4
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ > chop {g]} [Sj}

2|HORMN UNIT (LH/RH) @$73.80 OIS BROKEN / M/S 147 60 73.80

NOT NECESSARY
1|HORN WIRE NOT NECESSARY 156.50 -
1|FRONT FENDER (RH) DENTED 566.30 566.30
1|FRONT FENDER APRON PANEL (RH) DENTED 637.00 637.00
3| FRONT FENDER SHIELD (LH/RH) @$174.90 OIS DISLODGE / 349,80 174.90

N/S NOT

NECESSARY
1|AIR DUCT NOT MECESSARY 134.60
1|AIRCON CONDENSER PUNCTURE / BENT 827.50 92750
1|AIRCON SUCTION & LIQUID HOSE BENT 624.00 624.00
1|AIRCON DISCHARGE HOSE BENT 162.60 162.60
1|AIRCON COMPRESSOR DISTORTED 2,578.00 2,57T8.00
2|FRT SAFETY BELT (ASSY)(LH/RH) @$475.40 ACTIVATED 950.80 850.80
1|WIPER CONTAINER BROKEM 61.20 61.90
1|WIPER CONTAINER MOTCR DAMAGED 75.00 75.00
1|FRONT WHEEL RIM (RH) NOT NECESSARY 325.30 =
1|FRONT WHEEL HUB CAP (RH) NOT NECESSARY 107.10 E
1|FRONT WHEEL BEARING NOT MECESSARY 540,50 -
1|FRONT SHOCK ABSOREER (ASSY)(RH) NOT NECESSARY 34220 -
1|FRONT SHOCK ABSOREBER MOUNTING (RH) NOT NECESSARY 108.80 -
1|FRONT DRIVE SHAFT (RH) NOT NECESSARY 1,030.80 -
1|RACK & PINION ASSY NOT NECESSARY 969.60 s
1|STG TIE END MOT NECESSARY 6260 -
1|STABILIZER BAR NOT MECESSARY 25230 .
1|STABILIZER BAR BUSH (RH) NOT NECESSARY 16.40 -
1|STABILIZER BAR LINK NOT NECESSARY 61.10 -
1|STABILIZER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 24.00 -
1|FRONT SUSPENSION LOWER ARM (RH) NOT NECESSARY 528.30 s
1|FRONT CHASSIS MEMBER /S BUCKLED 1,060.70 1,060.70
1|KNUCKLE ARM (RH) NOT NECESSARY 552.00 .
1|FAN BELT TENSIONER NOT MECESSARY 263.40 .
1|ENGINE MOUNTING BENT 456.30 456.30
1|ENGINE UNDER COVER TORMN / DISLODGE 334,60 334.60

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19018785/Dyd3n2




Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo 18-9607198-R

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6255 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapaore 408833

Page Mo.:3of 4

2 Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | = ) oo {g]} ﬁ!‘r
1|ENGINE CROSSMEMBER NOT NECESSARY 2,094 .40 -
1|INTER COOLER NOT NECESSARY 1.032.50 -
1|INTER COOLER MOUNTING (2 PCS) NOT NECESSARY 25.90 -
1|HOSE B TO INTER COOLER NOT NECESSARY 229.70 "
1|HOSE © TO INTER COCLER INLET WOT NECESSARY 284 50 -
1|PIPE TO INTER COOLER NOT NECESSARY 167.05 .
1|PIPE TO INTER COOLER OUTLET NOT NECESSARY 244.55 i
1|ABS SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 234.00 !
1|WIRING-ECM NOT NECESSARY 2.243.00 :
1|WIRING-FEM,RH MOT NECESSARY 168.00
1|ACTUATOR-SWIRL CONTROL BROKEN 814.60 814.60
1|INTAKE MANIFOLD ASSY NOT NECESSARY 1,141.10 A
1|AIRBAG COMPLETE ACTIMATED 2.948.50 2.848.50
1|AIRBAG CONTROL MODULE ACTIWATED 1,140.40 1,140.40
1|STEERING ANGLE ASSY DAMAGED 1,150.60 1,150.60
1|SENSOR ASSY IMPACT-FRT INPACT NOT NECESSARY 198.30 3
2| AIRBAG SENSOR @$580.00 ACTIVATED 1,160.00 1,160.00
1|ELECTRIC POWER STEERING NOT NECESSARY 3,641.00 -
1|GEARBOX NOT NECESSARY 14,808.00 -
1|GEARBOX MOUNTING NOT NECESSARY 215.40 ;
1|RADIATOR HOSE UPPER SUPPORT BRACKET BROKEM 128.00 128.00
(ADDITIONAL)
1|IDLE PULLEY (ADDITIOMAL) BROKEMN 189.50 189.50
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -12,184.25 -5,393.48
48,737.00 21,573.96
1|FAN BELT (50%)(SN) TORN 116.20 58.10
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -23.24 )
92.96 58.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NO PLATE TRIM COVER (SN) } BROKEM 30.00 45.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) } BROKEN / 25.00 -
DISLODGE

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19018785/Dyd3n2




’ Vy LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607T198R G5T Reg. No. 19-0607196-R Page Mo.:4 of 4
Qty Description of Parts Condition ‘E::L':m?;’]} Our ﬂ}:{usm
3| FRONT FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH/RH) 05 NECESSARY | 200,00 100.00
@%100.00 (SN) MNIS NOT
NMECESSARY
1|FRONT DOOR COMFORT LOGO (RH)(SN) MOT NECESSARY 75.00 -
1|FRONT DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (RH){SN) NOT MECESSARY 100.00 -
1|FRONT TYRE (RH)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 216.00
B46.00 145.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF 1,800.00 1,200.00
BONNET HINGE (LH/RH).
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 1,750.00 1,000.00
WIRING CHARGE. 100.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. 150.00 40.00
TOWING CHARGE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
FROMT CHASSIS ALIGNMENT CHARGE. 400.00 150,00
REMOVE/REFIX UNDERCARRIAGE (FRT). 200.00 150.00
FRT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 120.00 60.00
REMOVE/REFIX AIRCON & REFILL GAS. 150.00 80.00
REMOVE/REFIX ENGINE/GEARBOX. 650.00 250.00
R/REFIX AIR BAG/STEERING 550.00 320.00
WHEEL/DASHBOARD/SEAT. }
DIAGNOSTIC & RESETTING TO ERASE FAULR CODE. ) 480.00 -
RE-SET FRT ABS SENSOR. | 200.00 -
6,600.00 3,280.00
GRAND TOTAL 56,075.96 25,057.06
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 20,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/FCI19018785/Dyd3n2
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BISELAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and Banalit of the Clisnt named on the front page of this Repe,
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