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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

v

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2017 10:35 AM

To: ONG Birdie

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV)-C0449982/GA045272
Dear Birdie,

The market value for SKK 2677X is $100k - $105k(est)

M\ A f"‘ v
Thank you. Vv

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]

Sent: Tuesday, September 26, 2017 2:00 PM

To: chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK
Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; admin@Ibs-auto.com; kee@asphoon.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: birdie.ong@axa.com.sg

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV)-C0449982/GA045272

This mail is associated with :
*SKK2677X (C0449982)
OD
Aug 28 2017 4:00PM
[TAN, CHEE YUAM]
Wearns Automotive Pte Ltd
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to birdie.ong(@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.
Thank you

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address ]

Sent by : Birdie Ong Lay Hong (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Frém:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>

Tuesday, September 26, 2017 2:00 PM

chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg;
cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK Valuation; admin@Ibs-auto.com;
kee@asphoon.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

hirdie.ong@axa.com.sg

Checking Market Value (MV)-C0449982/GA045272

Log card (if available).PDF

This mail is associated with :
*SKK2677X (C0449982)
oD
Aug 28 2017 4:00PM
[TAN, CHEE YUAM]
Wearns Automotive Pte Ltd

Please check Market Value and email back to birdie.ong@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.

Thank you

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address ]

Sent by : Birdie Ong Lay Hong (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)



* 26/09/2017

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

'Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration
Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC

8679C

SKK2677X

No

26 Sep 2017
JAGUAR

XF 2.0L GTDI

Red

2013
220413001348204PT
SAJACO5MIDPS95170
177.0 kW (237 bhp)
$50,419.00

25 Jun 2013

25 Jun 2013

0

$62,755.00 ’g ( -SF] pl

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Yes -l
24 Jun 2023 O 0 7 , @.L -

$47,066.00 \

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

24 Jun 2023

E - Open Category
10

$76,000.00
$43,100.00

$90,166.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Sep 2017

Land Tra nsp-:w:%\m hority

Please read through the Privacy Statement, Terms of Use and Disclaimer.

Please do not use the Back or Forward buttons on your browser as this may alter the results of the transactions.

Best viewed with IE 6.0 SP3 and above. 1024 X 768 resolution
Copyright © 2017 LTA | Privacy Statement | Terms of Use | Disclaimer | Rate the Website | Rate this e-Service

Last updated on 17 Sep 2017 at 12:38 AM

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vri/action/pubfunc?ID=EnquireRebateBeforeDeReg
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Caarly +65 87654321 Send Link y

Get Caarly on your mobile now!

«— Back
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i el I
JAGUAR XF 2.0L GTDI
Y ‘\\_?'__ 31st Jan 2013

JAGUAR

$111,000
Dealer's Comments
DESCRIPTION
Fully maintained at Wearnes Since day 1
FEATURES
4-cylinder in line turbocharged, 8 speed , torque 340nm
ACCESSORIES
Car Price $111,000
Downpayment $44,400
Loan Amount $66,600
Interest Rate 2.98%
Loan Term 65 mth(s)
Monthly Installment $1,186 / mth
Total Interest $10,792
Total Amount Paid $121,792

I The market average for this model and year is between $111,000 and $111,000.

This vehicle has paid $50.889 in Additional Registration Fees, If it is deregistered today, you will get a cashback of 589,471

)

This vehicle has clocked mileage of 88,000 km.

=
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