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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Maonday, September 04, 2017 5:16 PM

To: Tham, Pauline

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Check market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017
Hi Pauline,

The registration date of both vehicles different of one month, the value is within the range of $91k - 595k (est).

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, August 31, 2017 2:10 PM

To: Tham, Pauline <Pauline.Tham@aig.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Check market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017

Hi Pauline,

Please refer attachment attach.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham @aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 31, 2017 2:06 PM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@l|kkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Check market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017

Dear Janice,



Janice Lee (Lf(KAuto)

#

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, August 11, 2017 9:50 AM

To: "Tham, Pauline’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref : 47841495645G

Dear Pauline,

The market value is $91K - $95K (EST) as at JULY 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2017 2:51 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref : 47841495645G
Importance: High

Dear Catherine,
We would like to request for market value for SDT17A.

DOA :20/7/2017

Thanks.

Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1678| Fax +(65) 68357416

pauline.tham@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Tham, Pauline <Pauline.Tham@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2017 2:51 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref : 4784149564SG
Attachments: coe-parf - SDT17A pdf

Importance: High

Dear Catherine,
We would like to request for market value for SDT17A.

DOA :20/7/2017

Thanks.

Pauline Tham

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

8 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
+(B5) 6419 1678| Fax +(65) 68357416

pauline.tham@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you
must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify
me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this
email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free
and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either
jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 August, 2017 9:50 AM

To: Tham, Pauline

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref 4784149564SG

Dear Pauline,

The market value is $91K - $95K (EST) as at JULY 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2017 2:51 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref : 47841495645G
Importance: High

Dear Catherine,
We would like to request for market value for SDT17A.

DOA : 20/7/2017

Thanks.
Pauline Tham
AlG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1678| Fax +(65) 68357416

pauline.tham@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International

1



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

To: Tham, Pauline
Cc: assignments; SUR
Subject: RE: Check market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017
Hi Pauline,
0 V% erL

>
The registration date of both vehicle different ig one month. The value is within the range of $91k - $95k (est).

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, August 31, 2017 2:10 PM

To: Tham, Pauline <Pauline.Tham@aig.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Check market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017

Hi Pauline,

Please refer attachment attach.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 31, 2017 2:06 PM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@l|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Check market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017

Dear Janice,

Should be SDT17A




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)
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From: Tham, Pauline <Pauline.Tham@aig.com>
Sent: Friday, August 11, 2017 3:50 PM
To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: RE: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref : 47841495645G
Attachments: Full page photo.pdf
Dear Janice

Our insured vehicle is C 180 Coupe, sport series. 1796CC

Same market value?
Thanks

1 Tici

Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

n Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
+H(65) 6419 1678| Fax +(65) 68357416

pauline.tham@aig.com | www.aig.com.sq

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) [mailto:JaniceLee@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, August 11, 2017 9:50 AM

To: Tham, Pauline

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref : 4784149564SG

Dear Pauline,

The market value is $91K - S95K (EST) as at JULY 2017.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham @aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2017 2:51 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market value for SDT17A - DOA 20/7/2017, Oref : 47841495645G
Importance: High




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Tham, Pauline <Pauline.Tham@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 30, 2017 2:28 PM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: Check market value for SFT17A - DOA 20/7/2017
Attachments: retain car plate number - check for market value.pdf; IMG-20170824-WA0008.jpg
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: 4(

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you
must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify
me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this
email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free
and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either
jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particutans

Cravrvat 1D Type Singepore HRIC
Ot 113 1277

Vehicie Details
Vahick No. EDTITA

Vahics o oo Exported, No

T -
l;x}arndw Ce-ragiatration ., Ju1 2017
s 15}

vehicke Mihke MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicie Moded. C a0
Primary Calour: Brown

MManufaciurmg Year 2m2

Eraging N 271820004534402 -
Chaesis No - WDOIOM3492F 883413 ” .

May briert Power Qutpud: 118 G KW (154 bhp) R :

(Daen Market Value’ 541,007 00 .
B:zg:m Regiztration 18 Jun 2012 ¥ " ) .
First Registzation Date: 19 Jun 2012

Transfer Count; 0 ;
Actusl ARF P 341,067 DO ’ s >

Intended PARF Rebate Cetails

PARF Eligibility Yeas

rr;,::‘r Elmgibaility Expiry A4 Jem EDM/
PARF Retwta Amouni. 328702 00

Intended COE Rebate Detaiis

COE Expley Daw 14 Jur 2022
COE Categary: B - Car [160122 & sbova)

COE Perodi Y eaars) 10
QP Pald: £83.000.00

COE Rebats Amount:  $40.673.00

Total Rebats Amount; $68,277.00 25 5 5
The eormation conteined heren js correct 8s at 21 312017 '
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