Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 6:00 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKN 2408R-DOA: 18/10/2019 (AIG REF :8960595302SG)
Hi

Noted with thanks, kindly upload to merimen.

Please relay to your surveyors to upload sg car mart references for all total loss claim as per requirement for our
Recovery Team.

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, November 07, 2019 5:52 PM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK

Cc: SUR; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: SKN 2408R-DOA: 18/10/2019 (AIG REF :8960595302SG)

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Ms Sim,

Using an average deprecation of about $11K multiply by the remaining life span of 55 months plus the
minimum PARF of $8124 gives a MV of about $58,500.

Attached SG Car mart showing the average deprecation.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 9:02 AM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKN 2408R-DOA: 18/10/2019 (AIG REF :89605953025G)

Dear Ms Sim,

We will check and revert.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 5:01 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKN 2408R-DOA: 18/10/2019 (AIG REF :89605953025G)

Please re-verify the LKK’s mv $ 65,000/=

May | know who establish market value in LKK, attended surveyor ? or staff preparing the survey report ?

Insured’s model May 2014 ?

[] Audi A3 Sportback 1L4ATFST  $57,622
S-tronic Ambiente

[] Audi A3 Sedan 1.4A TFSI $63,000
S-tronic Ambiente

Monster Motors Pte Ltd

$10,840 fyr

10-Jun-2014

25-Nov-2014

1,395¢cc

1,395 oC

67,6

Sportback Edition! Latest Nice Doubke Repeated Digits Number Plate SMPxxoxxH. 1 Owner Only. Agent Serviced & Mantaine
Done 67k KM Only! Original Condtion Inside/Out. Nice Color Combination Pearl Black Exterior With Coffee Brown Interior. N

¢

Ful Agent Serviced With Records. Comes With Transferable Free Servicing Package. Extremely Wel Maintained By 1 &
Excelent Interior & Exterior Condition. View To Beleve. Trade-in & High Loan Avalable. Hurry Contact Us For More Infoi



Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK

Sent: Monday, November 04, 2019 4:37 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKN 2408R-DOA: 18/10/2019 (AIG REF :8960595302SG)

Hi

Kindly relay to your Survey Team that for all total loss, SG car mart reference are to be upload for our Recovery’s
requirement.

Please do necessary for this total loss claim.
Priscilla Sim LK

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 24, 2019 8:31 AM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK

Cc: Koh, Victor-CK; Fong, Andy-SY; Chan, Yoke Shi; SUR

Subject: [EXTERNAL] SKN 2408R-DOA: 18/10/2019 (AIG REF :89605953025G)

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Ms Sim,
Please be informed that vehicle recommended Total Loss.

Kindly informed insured.

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



