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Asher Sng (LKKAuto) ———————————————————————————————————

From: Ong Hua Yen [Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Buses) <OngHuaYeni@smrtcom.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 1219 PM

To: Admin A, C5 A Team

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A); Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto

Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A/Buses); Tan Wei Teck {Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & |A/Buses)

Subject: QOUR REF:BUS/10/19/1043 - ACCIDENT ON 19/10/19 INVOLVING SMB1364D AND
SIUBDATA ALONG YISHUN AVE 2 [ BS:59041-BEF KHATIB STN )

Attachments: SAS BUS 10 19 1043.pdf; LTA BUS 10 19 1043.pdf; INV BUS 10 19 1043 pdf

Dear Sirs,

We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB1364D. Your client's
negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair 52.900.00
Loss of Use 5825.00 | 3 daysx 5275.00 |
LTA search fee $7.00
Total $3.732.00

We enclose the following documents,
1) Repair Invoice

2) GIA report

3) LTA search

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment
by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.

Thanks & Regards
Hua Yen



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Ashier Sng [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 12:19 PM

To: RAYNERHDE@GMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU B041A AND SMEB 13640 ON 19/10/2019
Our Rel: CCYAIGI2018708/Eeal

31 OCT 2019

HO WEI MING, RAYNER

Dear SirMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU S8041A AND SMB 1364D ON 191072019

We refer to the above sccident where we are acting for AIG Asia Paciflic Insurance Pre Lid to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them

Based on the accident report and accident scenanio, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Pany.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(f any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party clam. However, il your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further quenes.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @ lkkauto.com

c.c.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
{Muotor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

I SMRT BUSES LTD (the thind party claimam™) of 60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK
E4 SINGAPORE 757705 (address), owner of SMB 13641 (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim
far repair costs andéor rental undfor loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SMB 13641 that wis
damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurred on 19102019 (date) along YISHUN AVE 2
(BS:39041-BEF KHATIB STN) (location) invulving vehicle no/s STU 8041A 1 the sccident™).

I further auihorize the workshop (o settle my abuve mentioned claim in & manner that they deem it
andl the wuorkshop is further authurized o receive payment further W settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT BUSES LTD.
I further acknowledge that any setilement the workshop may reach on my behall 15 on o withow

prejudice and withoul sdimission of liability basis nsolar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

viehiclefs is contemed.

Dated this__ 24 (dayyof ___PEC  monthy 2009 (year)

Signed by “the third party cliimant™ Signed by “the }l{ i
".__‘L_I-b __,.o-""
(with chop if applicable) {with chopi



RELEASE VOUCHER /1ali083
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) kU

“We/l, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop') hereby confirm that we/l
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect fo the amount ¢laimed for
S$2.900.00 TRepair Cost), S§750.00 TLoss of Use/Rensad), $$7.00-TDisbursement) for vehicle no.

that was damaged pursuant to the accident which cceurred on 191072019 (date) ulong

YISHUN AVE 2 (BS:59041-BEF KHATIB STN) (location) involving vehicle no/s SIU 8041A.
This is pursuant o the inspection conducted on 2II0VZ01Y (date) at “the workshop™

We/l confirm that we/l are/um authorized by the owner SMRT BUSES LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SMIB_1364D make the claim as set out in the above parngruph and we/l
have full authority to sertle the matter on hisfher behalf in o manner thut wefl deem fie Well enclise
herein the Jetter ol authanty given by “the third pary ¢laimant™

We/l further confivm thal we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid for all domages,
lnss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the thind party claimant”
after the above smd ugreement lodges a turther claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs andfor rental andfor loss of use pursuant to the damage 1o SMB
136D (vehicle po.) as o result of the accident,

Weil confirm thut the agreement reached above 5 in tull and final setlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant 1o the sccident and thut further this settlement is reached oo a without
prejudice and without admission of linbility basis,

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Couns have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute ansing oul of the same.

Dated this 04 {day) of _ML_{munlh}!.ﬂr_?_{yeur!
) (A e .
CTY .

Signed hy up SUrveyor Signed by ‘the worksBifB={with chop)



SIMRT

ALUTOMOTIVE

EHET Automotive Ssrvices Fis Ltd
231 Worth Bradge Road Sincmpore 179122
Tel: #5 63211000 Fax: 65 E3340247

Tax Invoice

Cusromer Code: 3000066 r. GST Req Mo. 1 MR-ES00001-7

/= T | ChN i 1990042802
SMRT BUSES LT E 1 s n Invoice Ho. IV1S1000%29

\7 I Dasa i 301G 2819
Block Unipe Veahicle & SMBELIGLD
ETREST 62 Your Ref Mo, ! BCEE/10/1971043
& ANG MO RIO Dur Hef Ko 1 F4I03RIE
EINGAFORE 569140 Termno il Daya
Description Qry Unie Add / (Discount) Aaount

Coat L] Ahmount
LOMP 30M RMOUNT POE BEPAIR 1.8 L 2,900 0
A3 PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDETION
GRAND TOTAL 3 2,500,003

Rerark

Make /Mode ] : MAN A22
hocident Date @ 13.10.2013

H.B, Fayment by chegus should Be arosesd and

mads payshls to 'OMET hotsmotivs Services Fie Lbd’

Mo reaceipt will be issusd unless reguested.

Authoriased Signatura
for SMRT Actomotive Services Foe Ltd

E. =« 0.E



Enquire Transaction History
Mransaction History Detaiis

Log Date/Time: 21 0ct2019/12:11:26
Transaction

Asset Type: Vehicle £7.49
Amount:
Asset |D: SJuUen4aa
18.32 Insurance Enquiry
Ti ion Type: C -
PRGN W% 10 Payment) Soone EREIRANSY
Business
ESASBAHO - BALOISH
User ID: BINTE ABDUL HALIL Transaction 201910211211246012645
Reference Mo
searchDate/ o 5t 2019 17:09:00
Time:
Insiirance AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD,
Company:

Information displayed Is correct as at the log date and time.

Enquire Related Logs Back to List



