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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, August 24, 2018 1:38 PM

To: ‘Jeremy Koh'

Cc: SUR

Subject: FW: SGA5817P MV (COE renewed 05 years)
Attachments: SGA5817P log card.pdf

Dear Jeremy,

Thank you for your email.
Hi Janice,
Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jeremy Koh [mailto:jeremy_koh@Aviva-asia.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 1:35 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Celyn Lim <celyn_lim@Aviva-asia.com>

Subject: SGA5817P MV (COE renewed 05 years)

Dear Shirley / Shiau Chan,

Need your assistance for the above MV of SGA5817P also.
COE renewed for 05 years.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jeremy Koh

Claims Executive

General Insurance

Phone : (65) 6827 9966 Fax : (65) 6829 1871
Email Address ' jeremy _koh@aviva-asia.com

Aviva Ltd

4 Shenton Way

#01-01 SGX Centre 2
Singapore 068807

Co. Reg. No. 196900499K



~ “In line with MAS Fair Dealing Outcomes, we at Aviva are committed to Treating Customers Fairly”
You can protect our environment. Think before you print.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail
to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please

notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
8194B

SGA5817P

No

23 Aug 2018
HYUNDAI
GETZ1.4 3DRA
Black

2005
G4EES5228078
KMHBU31DR6U122391
69.9 kW (93 bhp)
$10,439.00

23 Nov 2005

23 Nov 2005

1

$11,483.00

Forfeited

$0.00

30 Sep 2020

A-Car (1600cc & below)
5

$29,608.00

$12,451.00

$12,451.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Aug 2018

Wi vy

OK
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8/24/2018 Used Hyundai Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

SGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

RANGE ROVER EVOQUE

MANAGEMENT UNITS
FROM $189,999 =
> BOOK ATEST DRIVE ABOVE & BEYOND

% New 5 Year COE Renewal Honda Stream 1.8A X W s> .
Post an Advertisement s e cnewattion e .
. i | HIN LUNG AUTO 1 30 =1
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just ! e 1500 Downnayment! Morth| H Bt Eroe gfeg‘;s' 2
58 until it's SOLD! [, i sk .60 ' -- .
$ One Stop Car Hub ]
Finance, Insurance, Workshop =
Pest an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling New and Used Cars =
|Browse by Category 7 | Sort by Date Posted ¥ |20 resufts/page ¥ |
¥afiliias s e e . N o .
Price Depreciation Reg Dat Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Search Selection Hyundai Getz Any Any = 100‘;:“(5) Any Any Any All
Hyundai Getz 1.6A 5DR (COE $18,800 $6,720 fyr 11-Jul-2006 1,599 cc % Hatchback Available

till 06/2021)

Responsive Engine And Smooth Transmission, The Best Selling Korean 1,6A Hatchback Beautiful Exterior/Well Kept Interior, Well Maintained, Sporty
Black, Flexible Finance Package And In House Loan Can B,..

Posted: 17-Aug-2018 Tags: 2006 Hyundai Getz, Hyundai Getz, Hyundai, Getz, Used Hyundai

Hyundai Getz 1.4A 5DR (COE $13,800 $6,540 /yr 03-Oct-2005 1,399 cc @ Hatchback Available
till 10/2020)

Clearly The Most Affordable Hatchback In The Market! Powered By A 1.4L DOHC Engine. Mint Condition! No Repairs Needed. Affordable And Easy
Maintenance Ride To Own, A Rare Gem In This Category! In Hous...

Posted: 05-Aug-2018 Tags: 2005 Hyundai Getz, Hyundai Getz, Hyundai, Getz, Used Hyundai

Hyundai Getz 1.4A 3DR (COE ¥ N.A 26-Jun-2006 1,399 cc . Hatchback SOLD
till 05/2021)

Excellent Condition!Seliing At Paper Value Only!Super Safe Buy, Low Depreciation. $0 Down Payment Available, Bank/In House Loan Available, Low
Interest Rate,No Down Payment Available, High Trade In,10..,

Posted: 01-Aug-2018 Tags: 2006 Hyundai Getz, Hyundai Getz, Hyundai, Getz, Used Hyundai

Hyundai Getz 1.6A 5DR (COE g N.A 13-Oct-2006 1,599 cc . Hatchback SOLD
till 10/2021)

Posted: 26-Jul-2018  Tags: 2006 Hyundai Getz, Hyundal Getz, Hyundai, Getz, Used Hyundai

Car Buying Car Selling Car Ownership — e
Bidded Carplates

Car Aftermarket On The Move Lifestyle

Hyundai Getz 1.6M 3DR (COE - N.A 26-Jun-2006 1,599 cc - Hatchback SOLD
till 06/2021)

Price Reduced! Car In Superby Handling & Condition, Quiet Suspension, Reliable And Super Fuel Efficient Manual Engine. High COE Rebate $13.6K,
Buy Close To Paper Value, New Leather Seat, Paintwork And...

Posted: 21-Jul-2018 Tags: 2006 Hyundai Getz, Hyundai Getz, Hyundai, Getz, Used Hyundai

Hyundai Getz 1.4A 5DR (COE = N.A 10-Jul-2006 1,399 cc - Hatchback SOLD
till 07/2021)
Rare 1.4L Auto Getz For Sale, Wear And Tear Done Up And Good To Go For Rest Of COE Lifespan, Low Mileage, Road Tax Till Jan 2018, Schedule A
Test Drive Today. Viewing Is Strictly By Appointment Only, ETEENMENT
Carro
Compare [ 1] Posted: 19-Jul-201B  Tags: 2006 Hyundai Getz, Hyundai Getz, Hyundai, Getz, Used Hyundai
Select used cars to Compare or Add to Alert Shortlist[ 1 ]
Add to Shorthist
J¥  Hyundai Getz 1.4A To compare cars, To compare cars, To compare cars,
5DR (COE till select from the select from the select from the Compare Now
0302005 search results. search results. search results,
Clear All

http://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MMO=Getz&RPG=20&VEH=0&RGD=10&MOD=Hyundai 12




