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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 Movember 2019 2:17 PM
To: sinsheng engineeringservices

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GBC 2399Y-DOA: 23/9/2019

Dear Pei Jin,
Moted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to NTUC INCOME

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 1 November 2019 2:06 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com=>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBC 2399Y-DOA: 23/9/2019

HiVeron,

We are accepted your offer.

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 638892 WITH IMMEDIATE
EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin

5in Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

{Level 5_Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Fri, 1 Nov 2019 at 10:03, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com=> wrote:
1



Dear Pei Jin,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Finalise amount $273.63 @ 1 working day.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 2:56 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: Re: GBC 2399Y-DOA: 23/9/2019

Hi Veron,

Please find attached the after repair photos and have your finalized.

** INDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5], SINGAPORE 638892 WITH
IMMEDIATE EFFECT **




Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin
Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892
(Level 3_Office)
(Level 5_Woaorkshop)

Tel: 6863 9595
Fox: 6863 6477

On Wed, 30 Oct 2019 at 15:58, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Pei Jin,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo,

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Na.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Oct 2019

Company
196N

GBC2395%Y

Yes

31 Dec 2019
MITSUBISHI
FETOBB1SRDEA
White

2011
AM4ZABTELS
FE7OBBAZO3B2
£2B.455.00

0B Sep 2011

08 Sep 2011

o

$1,423.00

No

£0.00

07 Sep 2021

C - Goods Vehicke & Bus
10

£2% 00600

£4, 890,00

£4,850.00

OK [‘EK(;U\.‘J



MBHHTE1 25083 ! Ajax Mors Pie Lid - Bukil Mosah
EMTRY OATE & TIME: 2320148 15.57

T SUBMITTED BY: Viclor Ang

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT MOTICE

1. Please report conrectly the detaits of the accdent fo speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andior the Authorised Driver

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies o

repudiate policy liability.

4 The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability an the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred o the Police for investigation.

&, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GUA Records Management Centre eslablished by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this repart will, for & fee, be made available upon application by intarested parties
7. By the lodgamen of this report to the msurers, you hereby consent 1o ihe archiving of this repor &t the centre and to copies of the rmpart being mede available

aforesaid.

Date Of Report

Dale Of Accident

Exact Location OF Accident
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Maobile Phone No

Allernative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Flaat Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Oeccupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mebile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number

EMail Address

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

23/09/2019 15:57

23/08/2019 14:30

ALONG TONG LEE BUILDING B 37 KALLANG PUDDING ROAD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

GBC2399Y

GOLDBELL LEASING PTELTD
199001 196M
ISAACNGCL@EGOLDBELLCORP.COM

OFFICE-64942897

MITSUBISHI
FBTOBB1SRDEA

COMMERCIAL

NO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
THIRD PARTY

YES

20131844

M.A

MUHAMMAD FIRDAUS BIN ASANAR
S9207008E

05/03/1992

OUTDOOR

3oM12011

7 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS

MALE

(LOCAL) +65-87480489

FIRDAUSM4BE@GMAIL COM

Page 1of 17



Address NA

Postcode

\Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

if No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - HIRER
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -

Wehicle H

insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident HIT AND RUN [ VANDALISM / DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle invalved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicle}

involved in the accident S
VWas any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed 10 hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| hgw: been appmached by unknr:mn Iperscmts‘: NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assislance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 0
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? MO
If ¥ios, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

| was park my lorry along Tong Lee Building B, 37 Kallang Pudding Road. | was taking my stuff inta my lorry, Suddenly | fell some
shaking to my lorry. Subsequently | came down and checked, they was another lorry reversing and hit onto my lorry right side
mirror. Damages of my lorry right side mirror. Mo injuries were involved.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachmant? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? MO

yas there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Wehicle Registration Number YKI262Y

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour MISSAN | MEB212ZNHRA
Details Of Froperties
Vehicle Calegary COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Mame of Driver

NRIC/Passport Numbar

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver) 1

Page 2 of 17



Podicyholder's Sign ature Driwer's Hgnature

Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Piease report correctly the details of the accident to saeed up the claims process

This Form must be completed by the ?nﬂmnlderand{nr the Authorised Driver.

information previded must be as truthiul and accurate as possible. Any wiltul misregresentation of witnhokding of material
facts may allow Insurance companies (o repudiste pelicy liabifity.

The waue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies fs nol an admission of pobcy Gability on the parl of the insurante
Compan et

Any false reporting may be referred 19 the Folice for investigation.

The repert will be forwarded by the insurers ol the GUA Records Management Centre estatlished by the General Insarance
Assodation of Singspore [GIA) for archiving and thal coples of this report will for a fee be made availeble upon application by
inleresicd parties,

Py the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you herehy consent 1o ihe archiviog of this report at the centre and 10 copies
of the repert being made avallable aloresald.

Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act {PDPA]
| understand, acknowledge, agree and condent thats

fal My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assotiation of Singegore {“GIA"| mayfare permitted to coliecl, use,
declese andjfor process my personal datafpersonal information set oulinthis [form]-and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insarer (tollectvely the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information 1o all msurers) who have insured vehichels) iwolved in this accdent {a0 ingures(s) who have invared
vehicleis) involved in this accident shall be coliectively referred Lo a4 the "Insurers™), the Insurers” Tawryerslaw firms, the
Monetary Authorty of $ngapore and any relevant government agencyfauthority {such as the police], far the purposeis}
af

|i} -processing, handiing and/or deating with my claims including e settlement of the claime and amy nrcessary
investigations relating Lo 1he ¢laims;

(i} mwestigating the accident andfar my claims;
{iil} carrying out and/or deating with my instructions or resgonding Lo any endquiries by me;

[iv] administering my claims (including the mailing of correspandence, statements, invoices, repofts o natices ta me;
which cauld invoive disciosure of certan personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well a5 an the
external caver of envelopes 'mall packages); and/for

(v complying with applicable law in adménistering, precessing, handing and/or dealing with my daims{colectively the
“Purposes’ )
(] ail insurer(s) who have msured vehicle (3] irvaived I this accident and the Insurers’ lawyersflaw firms, may/are permitied
to coliect, use, disciose and/or process my Persenal Information for one or mare of the sbove Purposes, and
(e} oy Personal Information may/can b distlosed by any of the indurers andfor GiA to their third parly sefvice providers or
apentsinduding their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapure, ot one or more of the atrove Purposes.

fdl my Personal Information will alie be coliected and used b compile clams history far the purpose ol fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and il future claims.

le] the infermation so coliected under () above may be shared | disdosed:

(i} to all Inswrers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigaling. cantrofing or managing fraud,
repulators, law enforcement and pavernment agencies av reasonably required foe e purgoses staled, or

(i} for comg@lying with requirements under any fegulations, iaws or o urf orders,

. VERIFY BY AJAX MARS [ARC)
REPORTING OFFICER

el f.-f
?_/,c’_ VOO CHEON YEE

Reporting Centre Prroanel’s SEnatuTe

Cate & Time: (1 driver s not the policyholder) Name

[kste & Time: NREC/FIN Mo

23-9-2018

Page 3 of 17
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Sketch Plan #3 Pg. 1

ACCIDENT STATEMENT (2000 characters)

| was park my lorry along Tong Lee Building B, 37 Kallang Pudding Road. | was taking
my stuff into my lorry, Suddenly | felt some shaking into my lorry. Subsequently | came
down and checked, they was another lorry reversing and hit onto my lorry right side
mirror. Damages of my lorry right side mirror. No injuries were involved.

Taxi Voucher No.: 1

DECLARATION

1Atve saclare that the above particulars & information provided above are true in every aspact

VERIFIED BY AJAX MARS REPORTING OFFICER -
JOHMMNY VOO CHEON YEE

MARS Oificer
Registerad Owner or Driver's Signature
Job Complete Dale/Time Date/Time:
23 Seplember 2019 a1 3:36 PM 23 September 2019 at 3:36 PM

Page 5 of 17



NO 8, TUAS AVE 18,
(Level 3), SINGAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 6863-9595

Fax No. : 6863-6477

E-Mail : sinsheng1981@gmail.com
Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD

59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123

Attention : Motor Claim Department

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

Estimate

Date :
Vehicle Num. :
Make/Model :

Chassis/Eng#

: ES002987

22/10/2019
GBC2399Y

MITSUBISHI FB 70-2011
: FB70BBAZ20382/AM42A87814

Contact : 6861 0007 Fax No. : 6753 7780 Accident Date : 23/09/2019
Claim No. :
Reference : YK9262Y
Policy No. : 29131844
SN Quantity Particular s Unit Price  Amount 55
( wl_
Y
LIST ITEMS : ” \ \o\ K’ﬁ
1. MIRROR STAY, RHS ¥° /1’/‘7 LH; Qo too L 439.02
2. 1 SIDE MIRROR, RHS 5(# <~ 165.60 -
3. 1 MIRROR STAY COVER ¥ 3% 123.50
a1 MIRROR STAY CAP RM1S |l 65.90 -
5. 1 CORNER PANEL, RHS 1T > 5T 546.37
List Totalss : 11! FD{H @7 l'ﬁ U 1,340.39
25.00% Discount 55 : 335.10
(wa.) A~ M:\(ﬁqft 1,005.29
LABOUR :
TO PANEL BEAT AND REPAIR RIGHT SIDE BODY (ou 25600
TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS
TO SPRAY PAINTING 3 1,53{0 P GLN

|
SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES !l
|

LOSS OF USE : 2 DAYS @ S5$120/DY

Labour Total 55 :

il

&
»
&
*
&

Total SS :

1,405.29



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 4085933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

DAMAGE ASSESSMENT REPORT

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD Ref.

CS/INC13018685/R1vd3n2

73 BRAS BASAH ROAD Date: 04-11-2018
#05-01 NTUC TRADE UNION HOUSESINGAPORE

189556

ATTN: FIONA Code: INC

1.

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. YK 9262 Veh. Inspected GBC 2399Y
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. MT/1064166-002 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From THERESA VIMALA Assign Date 22102019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI FBTO c.c 2877
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. FETOBBAZ0382 Colour RED
Odometer 212683 KM Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195R15C AUSTOMNE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R15C AUSTONE T mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185R15C (D) ALISTONE 77 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185R15C (D) AUSTONE 77T mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT OVS PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  23/09/2018 Inspect Date [ Time 22/10/2019 (0532 PM )
Survey held at NO 8 TUAS AVENUE 18
Repairer SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR; 1 Working Days




T4 ’4

Sl BE =

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uhi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 139607198R GST Reg. No 19-2607 198-R

Page Mo 1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBC 2399Y

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop [;}} ﬁ!l'
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|MIRROR STAY RHS SERVICEABLE 439.02 -
1|SIDE MIRROR.RHS SCRATCHED 165.60 165.60
1|MIRROR STAY COVER SERVICEAELE 123.50 -
1|MIRROR STAY CAP MISSING 65.90 65.90
1|CORMER PANEL,RHS SERVICEABLE 046.37 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -335.10 -57.87
1,005.29 173.63
LABOUR
TO PAMNEL BEAT AND REPAIR RIGHT SIDE BODY TO 250,00 100.00
DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS.
TO SPRAY PAINTING. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
400.00 100.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,405.29 273.63

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS (CONFIRMED) I

| 273.63|

Report Ref No. CS/INC19018685/R1vd3n2
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Automotive Assessor
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REGD Auto Consultant-SAE, Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benafit of the Client namad on the front page af this Report.
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