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GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP

NO 10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A
#02-03 AMK AUTOPOINT 568047

Tel No. : 64837111 Fax No. : 64837221
E-Mail : guanhinmotor@yahoo.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 06035200X

Ap

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD imate
8 SHENTON WAY o7 Artp o Estim
#27-01 AXA TOWER SINGAPORE 088811 e s ?Eam
Icie Num
Attention : Motor Claim Department ¢/ ’C;]' 9 Zi-f’/{ C:{fxﬂﬁ

Contact - 63387288 Fax No. - 66804838 /4‘ , ey A szb

/ « Accident Date
¢,

. ES000889

28/10/2018

SLD 1727 S

VOLVO S80 T5 2.0 A/T-2015
YV1AS40CDG1106627/84204T1113478¢
10Mo0R2me

Claim No.
Reference
7#/ Policy No. @ (18/11/2015)
ﬂﬁ
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5§
NETT ITEMS
11 REAR TOP BUMPER €rly 185480 —
2
3 1 REAR BUMPER CENTRE GARNISH At 19800
4. !
5 1 REAR BUMPER LOWER SPOILER €M 53500
6 :
7. o~ ] REVERSE SENSOR Lhor 25000 100000 —
8 .
g 1 REAR BUMPER STICKER A, 15000 —
10.
1 1 REAR LOWER SPOILER STICKER /g e, 14000 —
Nett Total S$ ( 3.675.80
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGE 724
TO FIXING REAR BUMPER LOWER SPOILER 450,00
TO FIXING REVERSE SENSOR ( 4 PCS) 12000 #op
TO FIXING 2 PCS STICKER 10000 ¥eor
SPRAY PAINTING 350.00 F 2
Labour Total S§ : 1,020.00
- E &O0E Total S§ 469580
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107242018 Claim Partal

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD (TP] = e
. Service Request Details
Claim P ). C
S9MO23LL
. J2APn
Reference T )-%r-
NnnE, H"M
Loss Date
October 10, 2019 &V
Report Date

Oct 11, 2017 5:53:00 PM

Request Date
October 21, 2019

Due Date
October 29, 2019

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement
Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SLD17275

hittps:iivp smariclaims axa com sg/claim-portal/himl/index-vendor-service-requests himi#service-requests/TserviceRequestNumber=143310 12



10212018 Claim Partal

Madel
SBO-2.075

Service Address

(L

Primary Contact/Insured

LOK CHEE CHIANG (LUO ZHIQIANG)
BLK 532 JURONG WEST STREET 52, #15-429, 640532, Singapore

JANE@LQ.COM.SG

Claim Handler

TEO Kitty
6568804602
kitty. teo@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Mestages Invoices Histary Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

hitps/ivp.smartclalms axa com sgiclaim-portalhtmllindex-vendor-service-requests himl#/service-requestsPserviceRaguesiNumber=143310

212



Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor@yahoo.coms
Sent: Thursday, 17 Octaber, 2019 4:07 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Traffic accident SLD1727S and SGW41237
Categories: Shekhar

Accident on 10/10/2019

our insure SLD1727S

please arrange to survey our vehicle SLD1727S
Kindly have your survey list

Thank you

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

LC NG



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 3:30 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] Traffic accident SLD1727S and SGW4123Z
FYI

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-005% | emall: shupei@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 3:10 PM

To: Shu Pel [LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Traffic accident SLD17275S and SGW41232

Kenneth have finalize $2.850
The LOD send to you

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

L C NG

On Tuesday, 22 October 2019, 3:16:34 pm SGT, Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com=> wrote

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We have received assignment from AXA for this case

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hslao Tong at 6742 3197

QOur respective case handler will lock into the matter and revert to you in due course



Please arrange appointment for survey.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards.

Shu Pel| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: B366-D055 | emall: shupel@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmot m=>
Sent: Thursday, 17 October 2019 407 PM
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor. survey(@axa com.sg>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Traffic accident SLD17275 and SGW41232

Accident on 10/10/2019

our insure SLD17275

please arrange to survey our vehicle SLD1727S
Kindly have your survey list

Thank you

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

L C NG



12672018

&

hips A'vp smariclaims.axa.com. sg/claim-portalMimifindes-vendor-service-reguests himi#'service-reguesta/view-message/7serviceReguesiNumbe. .,

Clairm Portal

<TP - Mandate |A> - S9M023|.(_||._ ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SGW 4123Z(0l) & SLD 1727S(TP) ON 10/10/2019

Type
© Question

Message

Liability: 100%. Insured rear-ended third party. Inform Ol about third party claim. Agreed to settle at best
and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandate at $3,377 45(all-in). TP-Mandate |A had been uploaded in
Smartclaims, Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 6-Dec-19

i1



B 74 74

Cornsultanta
- e L bl Campany Registration Ko, 1936071888

STOUTE AN T, P28 AN A TRE IS STIOAL PANK. SISGAPORE S08833 TEL - (0nSi a25al56l FAN ; (65 A25-13]E

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 06/12/2019

Survey Details:

Date of loss 10-Oct-19
Date of appointment 22-0Oct-19
Date of survey 29-Oct-19
Location of survey GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number SLD 17275
Make and Mode| VOLVO 580 75 2.0 A/T ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Date of registration 1B/11/2015
Excess

Market Value 578,000

Parf Rebate 555,763

Nett Loss $22,237

Repair details:

|Initial Estimate B 4,695.80 |

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 2,858.22
Check items (estimate) 5 -
Labour 5 740.00
Total 5 3,598.22
Lump Sum(if applicable) S 2,850.00
|Number of days for repair 03




1 74 74l

Covviisitaiire

.,._,..l:. ; ; : e Leg Company Registration Ma. 150607 188R
S0 AVE L, MR- 25 AN A LTRE IS STHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08958 THE ; ad) a23a 8300 FAN ; i6S) h25md 815

Remarks:

Of rear-ended third party. BOLA 27

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost 5 2,850.00
Loss of use MIL |no. of days
Loss of rental 5 520.00 |(4days x $130.00)
Loss of income NIL |no. of days
LTA search fees 5 7.45
Others MIL
Proposed Total 5 3,377.45




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 9:30 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: New message for service request 143310, vehicle number 5LD17275

| ~m
Kenneth have finalize $2.850 The LOD send to you GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKEHOP. No 811112019 |
[(1110 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24 #02-03 Singapore 568047 Tel 54837111 Fax 64837221 LSP 31649 PN
LCNG Al .
] Attach the invoice GLAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP. Mo 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24 \Lsp 18112019
#02-03 Singapors 568047 Tel: 64837111 Fax64837221 L CNG - B:45:52 AN
61272019
] |L/sum $2 850.00 - 3days |CHT |11:28:06
AM |
Message AXA ; Liability: 100%. Insured rear-ended third party. Inform Ol about third party | 811212010
u claim. Agreed o seltle al best and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandale at $3.377 45 CHT 111:37-18
(all-in). TP-Mandate A had been uploaded in Smarclaims. Kindly lat us have your ‘ AMI -
approvalinstruction. Hsiao Tong - 6-Dec-18 - N

Cl !rmznn 353 PM TEO Kifty — Hi Hsiao Tong Please offer rental 3 days

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultarits Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

——-0riginal Message-——

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com=

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 3:56 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 143310, vehicle number SLD17275

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S{408933)

—-0riginal Message—

From: kitty.teo@axa.com.sg <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 December, 2019 3:54 PM

To: admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 143310, vehicle number 5LD17275

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9M023LL.
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

1



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor@yahoo.com»

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 5:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: [EXTERMNAL] Traffic accident SLD17275 and SGW4123Z on 10/10/2019 //LKK

REF- CC4/ASM19018659/Kpb3

OK ACCEPT $3217.45

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

L C NG

On Thursday, 19 December 2019, 5:06:20 pm SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com> wrole:

Without Prejudice

Dear SirsMdm.

We refer to your below email.

We are prepared 1o improve our offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair S 2,850.00
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $120.00)* 5 360.00
3. LTA Search Fee 5 7.45
Total $3,217.45

*Kindly provide rental receipt.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please nole thal our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms




of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matier(s) in respecl of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims.”

“Best Wishes for merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 20207

Best Regards,
Hslao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3187 | emall chewhi @ Ikkaulo.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor & yahoo.coms

Sent: Monday. 9 December 2018 11:58 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @& Ikkauto.coms

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL) Traffic accident SLD1727S and SGW41232Z on 10/10/2019 //LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18018659/Kpb3

the loss of rental can re-adjust

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

L C NG

On Monday, 9 December 2019, 10:04:36 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com: wrole:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction o offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $ 2,850.00
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00)* S 300,00
3. LTA Search Fee -] 7.45

Total | 5 3,157.45

*Kindly provide rental receipt.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you s strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder andfor the authorised driver. The terms
of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed In any other related matter(s) in respec! of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Test Wishes for Moy ('hrT:Imm, it Hapyy Now Yor L0200

Bast Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

Phone. 6742-3197 | emall: chewht @ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uibi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop <guanhinmotor@yahoo.coms

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2018 8:56 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupai @ lkkauto.coms
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Traffic accident SLD1727S and SGW41232

Attach the invoice



GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

L C NG

On Friday, 8 November 2019, 3:09:44 pm SGT. Guan Hin Motar Workshop <guanhinmotor @ yahoo.com= wrote:

Kenneth have finalize $2.850

The LOD send to you

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

L C NG

On Tuesday, 22 October 2019, 3:16:34 pm SGT, Shu Pel [LKKAulo) <shupei @ [kkauto.com:> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

We have received assignment from AXA for this case.

Kindly nota that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3187,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.



Please arrange appointment for survey.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Beat Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel @ lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop < inmotor hoo.com=
Sent: Thursday, 17 October 2018 4:07 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Traffic accident SLD17275 and SGW41232

Accident on 10/10/2019

our insure SLD1727S

please arrange to survey our vehicle SLD1727S
Kindly have your survey list

Thank you

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP.
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel: 64837111

Fax:64837221

L C NG



FOO WAH HAN

C/0 10 ANG MO KIO IND. PARK 2A
#02-03 AMK AUTOPOINT
SINGAPORE 568047

9/11/2019

YOUR REF: 5GW41237

M/S AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
8 SHENTON WAY

#24-01 AXA TOWER

SINGAPORE 068811

Attn: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

VEHICLE REPAIR CHARGES DUE TO ACCIDENT

| would like to inform you that my vehicle SLD17275
was involved in an accident with SGWA41232
on 10/10/2019 has been repaired.

The charges for the repair caused are as following :

1 Final Repair Bill LT RO R e Vo) R TR Ssa

2 LTA Search Fee G e

3 RENTAL 4DAYSX @130

Yours faithfully. \ !

|

——

2,850.00
7.45
520.00

W v 0

3,377.45



GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP
NO 10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 24

#02-03 AMK AUTOPOINT 568047

Tel No. : 64837111  Fax No. : 64837221

E-Mail : guanhinmotor@yahoo.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 06035200X

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
B SHENTON WAY
#27-01 AXATOWER SINGAPORE 068811

Attention - Motor Claim Department
Contact : 83387288 Fax No. 688048348

Final Repair Bill : TI043256

Date : 01/11/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLD 17278
Make/Model : VOLVO SBO T5 2.0 AT -2015

Chassis/Eng# : WMSdDGDGHﬂB&E?PBﬂMTHHﬂEEE
Accident Date : 10/10/2018

Claim No.

Reference

Policy No. : (18/1 1/2015)

LUMPSUM REPAIR

\ |

Amoun! 5§
2,850.00

NPT

or GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHEP

E &0E. Total 58 - 2.850.00

=====——===



’ ” ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i —fh— 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

Fes/ YW
TEL; 6256 35681 FAX: 6266 4315

Reg. No: 199807188R GST Reg. No. 19-8807198-R

[ Ailawd o Federation Intermationale Des Experts En Automoblle
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : ﬂwnsummaasarxpqu
A OWERSNGAr O oo sz [N
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 -
ATTNKITTY Code: ASM '
1. U Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIN
Insured Veh. SGW 41237 Veh. Inspected SLD 17278
Policy No. GA211247 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SEMO23LL Excess ($§) 0.00

Assign From Assign Date 22102019

Make & Model VOLVO SB0TS tA] c.c 1869
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. YV1AS40CDG 1196627 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 97310 = Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
Size Make Balance

R/H Front Tyre |245/40R18 CONTINENTAL 9 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40R18 CONTINENTAL 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/40 R18 CONTINENTAL 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/40R18 ' CONTINENTAL 8 mm

4 SRR Ll iption of Damages

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PDRTIDN

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Accident Date 101102018 Inspection Date 26/10/2019
Survey held at GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP

BLK 10 ANG MO KIO IND PK 2A
#02-03

AMK AUTOPOINT

SINGAPORE 568047

oy IR

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTH.UCTIDNS WE HAVE NDT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIHHTED NCIRMAL PERIDD FOR REFA.IR'.




¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

el 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
i TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No. 189607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLD 17278

1|REAR TOP BUMPER (N) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 1.654.80 1,654.80
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE GARNISH (N) (CONSISTENT) |CRACKED 196.00 196.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER SPOILER (N) ([CONSISTENT) CRACKED 535.00 535.00
4|REVERSE SENSOR (N) (CONSISTENT) gﬂ?ﬁﬁﬂ (2PCS 1,000.00 500.00
1|REAR BUMPER STICKER (N} (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 150.00 150.00
1|REAR LOWER SPOILER STICKER (N) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 140.00 140.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -317.58
3,675.80 2.858.22
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGE TO FIXING REAR BUMPER ,LOWER 450.00 320.00
SPOILER.
TO FIXING REVERSE SENSOR (4 PCS) 120.00 60.00|
TO FIXING 2 PSC STICKER . 100.00 40.00
SPRAY PAINTING . 350.00 320.00
1,020.00 740.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,695.80 3.5!!.22‘.,-

e Zonmon

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19018659/Kpb3q2

Y 454

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

HSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Rupon s made solaly for (he uss snd benslil of e Cllen namsd on the front page of this Report.
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