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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 5:58 PM

To: Yong Patric Yong

Subject: RE: Finalise of SMl 5256D accident on 12-10-19

Dear Wan Ping, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Confirm final fig $12,796.00 and 5 repair days. 

 

Kindly send the relevant documents to Budget Direct Insurance company. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Yong Patric Yong <yihengmotorworkshop@yahoo.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 5:53 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fw: Finalise of SMl 5256D accident on 12-10-19 

 
To Adrian Ling and Shiau Chan, 
 
From your marked estimate, please be confirm to finalized on part by part at $12,796.00 and with 5 working days 
repair. 
 
Thank You. 
 
Regards, 
Wan Ping 


