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~Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, September 10, 2018 11:53 AM

To: 'Winnie Chua'; SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: FW: MV for SFN8877P DOA: 07/09/2018 our ref: M569682 (BM316M - BMW 316l)
Attachments: 10092018105402-0001.pdf

Dear Winnie,

Thank you for your email.
Dear Janice,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: Winnie Chua [mailto:pingping_chua@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 11:08 AM

To: Admin @ VAUG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>; mail@vpappraisal.com; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey @fta.com.sg>;
ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: MV for SFN8877P DOA: 07/09/2018 our ref: M569682 (BM316M - BMW

316l)

Dear Sir,

Please let us have the market value. Tks.
Best Regards

Winnie Chua

Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2556 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | pingping_chua@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220 9644
| F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg.
No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE



> Back to OneMotoring

Enqu:re PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner lD Type
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
VehicleNo:
Vehicle to be Exported:
. Intended De_rt_agistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model'
anary Colour
Manufacturlng Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:
Open MarketValue
Original Regnstratlon Date:
First Reg;stratmn Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
" PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
. PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information cuntamed herem is correct asat 10 Sep 2018

Siﬁgapa.rg I'_;II:QIC
17246C

SFNBB77P

No

11Sep 2018

B.MW.

3161 1.6 AT D/AB 4DR ABS HID
Black

2013
A183J441N13B16A
WBA3A16030NP9361
100.0 kW {134 bhp)
$33,081.00

26 Jun2013

26_ J_u‘n 201?;

0

$28,314.00

Yes
25 Jun 2023

$19.819.00 ?? 0?

25 Jun 2023

A-Car (1600c¢ & below)
10

$67,301.00

$32, 229 00

$52 043 00
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