Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 21 October, 2019 4:56 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: FINAL REMINDED FOR ACCIDENT CLAIM INVOLVING MY CUSTOMER VEHICLE

WNH 4497 & AXA INSURE SGM 7344 K DATE INCIDENT 28/09/2016

Importance: High

Dear Mei Kwan,

Accept at $3480.90

Please forward us DV.

Thank you

Best Regards
Ryan Soh
93825367

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, October 21, 2019 3:08 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REMINDED FOR ACCIDENT CLAIM INVOLVING MY CUSTOMER VEHICLE WNH 4497 & AXA INSURE
SGM 7344 K DATE INCIDENT 28/09/2016

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows:-

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,298.90

2. Loss of Use (9days x $20) $ 180.00

3. LTA Search Fee $ 2.00
TOTAL | $3.480.90

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.
Best Regards,



Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September, 2019 4:55 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REMINDED FOR ACCIDENT CLAIM INVOLVING MY CUSTOMER VEHICLE WNH 4497 & AXA INSURE
SGM 7344 K DATE INCIDENT 28/09/2016

Importance: High

Hi Mei Kwan,

Attached my client Log card and insurance cert.

Thank you

Best Regards
Ryan Soh
93825367

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2019 4:50 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REMINDED FOR ACCIDENT CLAIM INVOLVING MY CUSTOMER VEHICLE WNH 4497 & AXA INSURE
SGM 7344 K DATE INCIDENT 28/09/2016

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please provide us your client’s CL.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 September, 2019 3:24 PM
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
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Subject: FINAL REMINDED FOR ACCIDENT CLAIM INVOLVING MY CUSTOMER VEHICLE WNH 4497 & AXA INSURE
SGM 7344 K DATE INCIDENT 28/09/2016

Dear Mdm,

Please inform AXA , by 10/10/2019 claim unable settle we will pass to lawyer.
Very ridiculous for Singapore claim to drag so many year

Thank you & Regards

Ryan Soh ( Manager )

Handphone : 93825367 / 90030857 .
DirectLine : 64535654

Fax : 64591698



