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From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 21/10/2019 16:43 PM. 

To   lynn.khong@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG 

Subject   Re: <Seek Mandate> C0402442 

Dear Lynn,

Offer accepted. Please send back adjuster report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Meikwan

<-- Original Message -->
From: AXA_SG 

To: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg; LKK_HQ
CC: AXA_SG

Sent On: 07/10/2019 08:33 AM
Subject: Re: C0402442

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ 
To: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG

Sent On: 04/10/2019 03:56 PM
Subject: Re: C0402442

Dear Lynn,

We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that Insured has been charged by Msia traffic police. OI making a left turn. TP travel straight.

Summary to offer to repairer Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd is as follows:

Relevant supporting claim documents are uploaded in merimen for your perusal.

We seek your mandate at $3,840.90. Kindly refer to our adjuster report in Merimen for your perusal.

For your approval and/or further instruction please.

Thank you.

Meikwan

<-- Original Message -->

Hi Mei Kwan,

Repropose mandate:

COR & LTA to proceed with mandate request.

LOU S$20/day (approx. RM$60) for 9 days = S$180
TOTAL S$3480.90

Thanks

Regards
Lynn

TP CLAIMED (RM) REVISED - TO OFFER (RM)

Cost of Repair 12,000.00 10,000.00 (MV)

Loss of Use ($60 x 4 days) ($250 x 9 days) 2,250.00 2,250.00

GIA search

Subtotal 14,250.00 12,250.00
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From: LKK_HQ 

To: sashe.goms@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 26/09/2019 02:06 PM
Subject: C0402442

Dear Sashe,

We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that Insured has been charged by Msia traffic police. OI making a left turn. TP travel straight.

Summary to offer to repairer Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd is as follows:

Relevant supporting claim documents are uploaded in merimen for your perusal.

We seek your mandate at $3,840.90. Kindly refer to our adjuster report in Merimen for your perusal.

For your approval and/or further instruction please.

Thank you.

Meikwan

TP CLAIMED (RM) REVISED - TO OFFER (RM)

Cost of Repair 
12,000.00

 10,000.00 (MV)

Loss of Use ($60 x 4 days)  ($250 x 9 days) 2,250.00
2,250.00

GIA search

Subtotal
14,250.00 12,250.00

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

 There are no documents.
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