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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)
== T s

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Winnie,

Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Monday, April 23, 2018 10:19 AM

‘winnie.ho'

yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek'; peter.wang@axa.com.sg; SUR
RE: Checking Market Value (MV) - SBMOOEEZ / SIM3907C / DOA : Apr 18, 2018

The market value for SJM 3907C is $12K - S13K (EST) as at April 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sharon Kho [mailto:sharon.kho@priorityservices.sg]

Sent: Friday, April 20, 2018 12:56 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; 'chowautol' <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg;
bokhari@jpknights.com; admin@I|bs-auto.com; LKK Valuation <valuation@l|kkauto.com>; rta@rta.com.sg;

collin.wong@a-pac.sg

Cc: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek' <Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>; peter.wang@axa.com.sg, 'Winnie Ho'

<winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV) - SSMOOEEZ / SJM3907C / DOA : Apr 18, 2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to winnie.ho@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48

hours.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Kho

Priority Services

Block 779 Yishun Avenue 2

#01-1545 Singapore 760779




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

#

From: Sharon Kho <sharon.kho@priorityservices.sg>
Sent: Friday, April 20, 2018 12:56 PM
To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; 'chowautol’; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg;

bokhari@jpknights.com; admin@Ibs-auto.com; LKK Valuation; rta@rta.com.sg;
collinwong@a-pac.sg

Cc: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek'; peter.wang@axa.com.sg; ‘Winnie Ho'
Subject: Checking Market Value (MV) - SSMOOEEZ / SJM3907C / DOA : Apr 18, 2018
Attachments: Vehicle registation certificate.pdf

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to winnie.ho@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48
hours.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Kho

Priority Services

Block 779 Yishun Avenue 2
#01-1545 Singapore 760779

Tel: 62934822 Fax: 62963283



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Ll

1ofl

https://vtl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vr)/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeD...

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

. Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported
intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make.: o
Vehicle Model:
Primqu Colour:
; _ Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
' Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Regist}’éltio_n Date:
- First Registrafion Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

'_:__PARF Eligibility:
PARF Ehgtb:hty E)(plr\/ Date
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Catégory:

COE Periéd(i’ear:;s_)_': _
QP Paid: _
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereln is correct asat 19 Apr 2018

i 412- (L 14

Singap_o.r.e NRIC
3672E

SiM3907C
No

19 Apr2018
HONDA

HONDA JAZZ 1.3LA
Silver o
2008
113711010254
JHMGE685095210225
730KW (97 bhp)
$20,007.00

30 Dec 2008

30Dec 2008
0 - .
$20,007.00

Yes

'29Dec2013 '

$1O 003.00

29 Dec 2018
A-Car (1600cc & below)
10

$6,20000

$429.00
$10,432.00

19/04/18 5:01 PM



Used Honda Jazz Car for Sale in Singapore, Platinum Group Pte Ltd -... http://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=728097&DL=3184

SGCARMART.COM

Login  Sign up
New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources
= North Korea Situation 2017
= Singapore Reckless Drivers Part VI
= Buying used Car tips
HONDA JAZZ 13 | | price Range Depreciation | | 2008 Vehicle Type 8 Search Advanced

Search

Home » Used Cars » Platinum Group Pte Ltd » Honda Jazz 1.3A

Resources
Car Buying
Car Selling
Car Ownership
Car Aftermarket

On The Move

Lifestyle

Clb Meg} ‘P(

amazing you

Compare

1 of 2

Honda Jazz 1.3A

Overview Financial Accessories  Similar  Research Photos Map

Add to Shortlist Add to Compare Add a Nate Report Error

Car Details

Price $12,688

Depreciation $9,420 fyr 0
View models with similar depreciation

Reg Date 02-Dec-2008
(7mths 8days COE left)

Manufactured 2008 (7]

Mileage =

Transmission Auto

Engine Cap 1,339 ¢cc
Road Tax $590 Jyr L7
Power 60.0 kW (80 bhp)

View specs of the Honda Jazz (2002-2006)
Curb Weight 1,040 kg (7]
Features Powerful N Responsive 1.4L I- VETEC Engine. 5 Speed

Auto Transmission, Reverse Sensor. .
Seller Information

Accessories Factory Fitted Audio System. Two Tone Leather Seats.

Sports Rim, Company Platinum Group Pte Ltd
» dealer's pricelist
Description Very Well Maintained By Previous Owner. High Loan » 8 vehs sold | 15 vehs available
And High Trade In Welcome. Scraping Ur Car Car With i
High Body Value. Call Now For An Appointment To Address 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #03-36
View This Awesome Car. Location Premier @ Kaki Bukit
coE 510,455 9 oiiceno 69177880
ok $13,918 © | | CortastPamont) Husin Kmer 91827511
ARF $13,918 [ 7] Kelvin Chua 97593539
Vincent Tan
Dereg Value $7,595 as of today (changa) [7] Chye Yong 98785544
No. of Owners 4 o
Useful Services
Type of Veh Hatchback
Make sure of this car condition
Category PARF Car gﬁ with STA Evaluation,
Availability Available FmARRSNmSS Vahicla Evaluation
. [ Find out the market value for your car.
Add to Shortist Add to Compare Add a Note Get a free Car Valuation.
Free Valuation
Posted on: 04-Apr-2018 | Last Updated on: 21-Apr-2018
Tags: Honda Jazz, 2008 Honda Jazz, Honda, Jazz, Used Honda
Upfront Payment » more Financial info
Transfer Fee $25 (7]
Down Payment $3,806 (change) Maximum 70% Loan €
1st Instalment $1,291 (7]
Total Upfront Payment  $5,122 (excluding insurance) [7]
Estimates based on 70% ban at 2.98% nterest rate. Check wih seler for exact figure.
Items for Honda Jazz » View All
Spoiler Mugen Carbon Fibre
- %30 Mirror Cover

$50

23/4/2018, 10:05 AM



