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RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External
Confidential]

GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Mon 7/13/2020 1:20 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Asher,
 
Kindly proceed as proposed.
 
 
Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com] 
Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 11:18 pm
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: Re: Pre-repair Inspec�on for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External Confiden�al]
 
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.
We have highlighted to your good office on 21/10/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.
The accident occurred when our insured hit third party stationary vehicle while turning.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.
Summary to offer to repairer PRECISE AUTO SERVICE is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,658.21 $ 2,568.00
2. Loss of Rental (11days x $120) $ 1,320.00 $ 900.00 (9days x $100)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 8.00 $ 8.00

Total $ 3,476.00
**5 days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
The above is for your approval please.
 
Thank You.
Best Regards,

https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
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Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2020 11:25 AM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspec�on for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External Confiden�al]
HI Gerald,
We refer to the email below.
We are not able to submit for any mandate request as third party have yet to submit the LOD.
Shall revert to you on the request once we have received the document.
Thank You.
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Sent: Wednesday, 18 March 2020 11:01 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External
Confidential]
Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Asher,
Kindly let us have your mandate on 100%.
Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com] 
Sent: Friday, 1 November 2019 11:40 am
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN
<geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External
General]

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com
mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com
mailto:mt_claim@lonpac.com
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Hi Gerald,
We refer to the above matter.

We have offer third party 50% liability, however third party disagreed.
Enclosed the third party video for your easy reference, video show insured move closed to third party
when making a right turn and grazed against third party stationary vehicle.
We are of the opinion that the liability is not in our insured favour.
Thank You.
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2019 3:37 PM
To: geraldpoh@lonpac.com
Cc: mt_claim@lonpac.com; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External
General]
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
Thank you
Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com] 
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2019 9:53 AM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External
General]
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.
Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com] 
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2019 8:57 AM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: FW: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External
General]

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com
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mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com
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Lonpac External - General
Our Ref : 19/19/19/VC05/022537
Dear Nivitha,
Kindly proceed as requested
Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg] 
Sent: Friday, 18 October, 2019 5:32 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Subject: Re: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1247D. [External
General]
Dear Mr. Gerald,
We refer to your email on dated 18-10-2019. Please be informed that we would like to select Mr.
Adrian Ling from LKK Auto Consultancy as our SJE.
Thank You.
Best Regards
Arine
On Fri, 18 Oct 2019 at 16:02, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref : To be advised
Dear Arine,
Please see our list of Motor surveyors below and let us
hear from you within the next 2 working days.

1 Sharan Bin Sharif
2 Jackson Quek
3 Paul Thanapal
4 Aw Po Huat (Andrew)
5 Nicholas Tey
6 Mohd Taufik
7 Kenneth
8 Marcus Chua
9 Mohd Rasul

10 Adrian Ling
Please note that our insured vehicle is YN1247D
Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg
mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com
https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
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From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg] 
Sent: Friday, 18 October, 2019 3:03 PM
To: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: Pre-repair Inspection for SFB 3339Y. Your Insured Vehicle no : YN 1427D.
Dear Sir,
We refer to the above mentioned matter, herewith enclosed a 2 days notice for your attention.
Please arrange to do pre-repair inspection for SFB 3339Y in our workshop ASAP.
Thank You!
Best Regards
Arine
--
T : 6745 7367 | F : 6841 3390
E : support@preciseauto.sg
W: www.preciseauto.sg
A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Follow us on social media:
https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/
https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs
https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/

--
T : 6745 7367 | F : 6841 3390
E : support@preciseauto.sg
W: www.preciseauto.sg
A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Follow us on social media:
https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/
https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs
https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/
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