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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 11:09 AM

To: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); WANG Peter

Cc: CHOW Soon Hee Gene; HO Vincent; KKLau; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for 5JY6544H

Dear Peter,

The market value for SJY 6544H is $27K- $29K(EST) as at Jun 2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, June 22, 2018 4:00 PM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; WANG Peter <peter.wang@axa.com.sg>

Cc: CHOW Soon Hee Gene <gene.chowsh@axa.com.sg>; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>; KKLau
<kklau@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for SJY6544H

Hi Valuation Team,

Please get back to AXA Peter.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
QOlivia Lau | Admin Manager g

LKK Auto Consultants 91’0&:\
phone: 6256-3561 | email: oliviglgu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 fe‘

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933) i}(

Todery

From: CHOW Soon Hee Gene [mailto:gene.chowsh@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 5:22 PM

To: bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; nick@Ibs-auto.com; jimmy.lee @priorityservices.sg;
cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; ricky@rta.com.sg; elson@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg; patrick.so0@a-pac.sg;
frankie @fta.com.sg; KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
<bryanang@|kkauto.com>; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>; WANG Peter




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, June 22, 2018 4:00 PM

To: LKK Valuation; WANG Peter

Cc: CHOW Soon Hee Gene; HO Vincent; KKLau; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for SJY6544H
Attachments: Scan 21 Jun 18.pdf

Hi Valuation Team,
Please get back to AXA Peter.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Olivia Lau | Admin Manager

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: olivialau@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5$(408933)
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From: CHOW Soon Hee Gene [mailto:gene.chowsh@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 5:22 PM

To: bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; nick@Ibs-auto.com; jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg;
cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; ricky @rta.com.sg; elson@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg;
frankie @fta.com.sg; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
<bryanang@lkkauto.com>; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>; WANG Peter
<peter.wang@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Assistance required: Effect MV for SJY6544H

Dear Valued Partners,

Kindly effect MV and update Mr Peter .
DOA : 15/6/18

Thank you .

Best Regards,

Gene Chow ( Mr )

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 www.axa.com.sg
HP : 98587664




OE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model.
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereinis correct as at 16 Jun 2018

Singapore NRIC
3759F

SJY6544H

Yes

16 Jun 2018
MAZDA

MAZDA3 1.6LSDN
White

2010

26864586
JM6BL10Z1A0151980
77.0kW (103 bhp)
$19,342.00

22 Sep 2010

22 Sep 2010

;19,342.00 947 /

Yes
21 Sep 2020
$11,605.00

215ep 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$33,089.00

$7.490.00

19,095.00 "
$ 2 .

fﬂ/ﬂ
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