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SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates
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SMRT Acciden! Vehicle Repair Estimates
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SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:
Owner 1D:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported
Intended Deregiftmtmn Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Pr]rtmr_v_Cu]uur:
Manutacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Outpul
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Diile:
First Registration Dato.
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebale Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibllity Expiry Dute:
PARF Rebate Amounit
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Rebate Amaunt:
Total Rebate Amount
The information contained hereln is correct as at 21 Oct 2019

OK

Company
2920

SG1747K

No

21 0ct2019

MAN

NL 320F |A22) 11L AUTO ABS TURBO
Multicolor

2015

50340842404072
WMAAZZZZXFT002871
§240,385.00
0IiMar2016

01Mar 2014

0

50,00

Ma
£0.00

$0.00
$0.00

n
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From: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Manday, 271 October 2019 10:20 AM
To: Goh Kok Khoon (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Buses); 'sur@Ikkauto.com’; Admin-D
(LKEAuto)
Cc: Zuhaidah Samsuri
Subject: RE: SG1747K - Survey () 10 43en 3 S lief o2
Attachments: ARC - Repair Estimate (85) pdf. SAS2688285 pdf o RBoon

v. notiIn

Dear Sir/ Mdm, Gy 2]l

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SG17471 and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Aida.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

. INIJM
o O [NTERNATIONAL
( InsuraNCE
80N G A PO LRI
3 Teruiiy Dve Fuginn winie JRET

B4 Cecll Streer; 705 - 10B Building
Singapare 049711
Ted: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Goh Kok Khoon [Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Buses) [mailto:GohKK2@smrt.com.sg)
Sent: 21 October, 2019 10:00 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SG1747K - Survey (II1)

Hi,

We have selected LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Regards
Fram: Motor Claim - 111 ilbo:my | lil.

Sent: 21 October 2019 09:57
To: Goh Kok Khoon (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Buses)
Subject: RE: SG1747K - Survey (I11)

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors



gl LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- *  Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
fIiNCEAPrPORD

64 Cecll Street; #0S - 0B Bullding
Sinflapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

INDIA
INTERNATIONAL
INsuraNCE

From: Goh Kok Khoon (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses) [mailto:GohKK2 @smrt.com.sg]

Sent: 19 October, 2019 11:01 AM

To: Motor Claim - 1l <motorclaim@iii, SE>

Cc: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses) <catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg>; Gerald Tan Chwee Hock
(Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Buses) <tanchweehock@smrt.com.sg>: Tay Boon Chew (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses)
<BoonChew Tay@smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Buses)
<BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
<ChansSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & I1A/Buses)
<TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: SG1747K - Survey (lIl)

Hi

Kindly arrange to survey the vehicle SG1747K within 48 hours according to GIA guide line. involving your insured
%ﬂ%ﬂﬁmpany il

Vehicle is not in Woodlands Bus Depot

Regards

Boon Chaw
HF 5730909848

Kok Khoon
HP oE451942

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, vou are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim. and complying with applicable
laws, If you do not agree to the same. kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

2



It rhay contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If,you'are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim 1o us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and’or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws, If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore. we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 26 October 2019 9:50 AM

To: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Sves/Claims & |&/Claims & I1A/Buses), Karen Chan Siau Chin
{Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims B |1A/BLses)

Cc Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |1A/Buses)

Subject: Your Ref: BUS/10/19/6001 (SG1747K) *Our Ref: CC4/111190185711/Epb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SHD 7251E(1II) AND 5G 1747K ON 18/10/2019)

Attachments: STATEMENT OF SHD7251E pdf

Your Ref: BUS/10/19/6001 (SG1747K) Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11119018511/Epb3
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7251E(I1l) AND SG 1747K ON 18/10/2019
q\(e refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per Il instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liabillty/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

. Best Regards,
Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fux: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 9:16 AM

To: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & I1A/Taxis/Claims)

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil {Auto

Svis/Claims 8 1A/Claims & |A/Buses; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims &
|A/Buses; Karers Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses, Admin

A CS A Team
Subject: FW: DUR REF:BUS/10/19/6007 - ACCIDENT ON 18/10/19 INVOLVING SG1747K
AND SHD7251E ALONG KENT RIDGE U-TURN POINT BEF BS:18239 ( OPP NUH )
Attachments: SAS BUS 10 19 6001 pdf; INV BUS 10 19 6001.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CCA4/11119018511/Eph3 Hsiao Tong

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@|kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, B02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A/Buses) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 4:49 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Fel Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto
Syes/Claims & |A/Claims & IA/Buses) <BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims &
IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses)
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/10/19/6001 - ACCIDENT ON 18/10/19 INVOLVING SG1747K AND SHD7251E ALONG KENT
RIDGE U-TURN POINT BEF BS:18239 [ OPP NUH )

Dear Sirs,

We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number 561747K. Your client’s
negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $1,146.00
_Less of Use $825.00 ( 3 daysx 5275.00 )




1)
2)

Total £1,971.00

We enclose the following
documents,

1) Repair Invoice

2) GIA report

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd,

Thanks & Regards
Hua Yen



SIMRT

ALUTOMOTIVE

Customer Code: 3000066
SMRT BUSES LTD
Unit

Slock

& ANG MD XIO STREET 62
SINGRPORE 389140

EMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
251 Worth Bridge Road Singspore 17§102
Tel: €5 3311000 Fax: &5 63340247

Tax Invoice

G5T Reg No. : MR-8500001-7
CRH i 1990042802
Inveice No. : IV191000530
Date ¢ 30.10.2019
Vehicle Mo, @ SG147K

Your Ref dNo. @ BUS/10/19/786001
Our Ref NHo. : 24103954
Terms : 30 Days

Descriptien Qty Unit Add / (Diseceocunt) Amount
Cost L] Amount
Farts
PANEL,SIDE:RES WITH FRAME, FOR MAN 1.00 5 T10.70 100,00 S 710.70 5 ¢.00
A22 BOS
PANEL,SIDE:R1C, FOR MAN R22 BOS 1.00 § 192.70 100.00 5 192.70 5 d.00
PANEL,SIDE:R11,FOR MAN A22 BUS 1.00 S1782.%50 100.00 $1782.50 5 2.00
COVER:REAR TAIL LAMP, HH, POR MAN AR22 1.00 5 974.70 100.00 5 374.70 & G.00
BOs
Sub-Total 3 0.00

Labour
TO REMOVE & INSTALL ALL ABPOVE ITEMSE 1.00 5§ 530.00 (.00 3 0.00 £ £30.00
ANMD RETAIR OTHERE DAMAGED AFFECTE
ARERS,
Others
FROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TC 1.00 § Ele.00 0.00 s 0. 00 5 616.00
FUTTY AND RESFAARY ABOVE REPATR
ITEME

GRAND TOTAL - 1,146.00
Eemark :
Make/Model : MARN AZ2
hcocident Date : 18.10.2019
H.B. Paymant by chegqus should be crosssd and
sades payable to 'BMAT Automotive Services Pte Led'
Ho receipt will be lssued unless requested. i

Authorised&ignature

for SMRT Automntive Servicas Pte Ltd

3
O
N ]
w
§
i

E. & 0.E



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Saturday, 9 November 2019 1:14 PM

To: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & |A/Taxis/Claims)

Ce: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & IA; Balqish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto

Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A/Buses: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims &
|A/Buses: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & |A/Buses; Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/10/19/6001 - ACCIDENT ON 18/10/19 INVOLVING 5G1747K
AND SHD7251E ALONG KENT RIDGE U-TURN POINT BEF B5:18239 ( OPP NUH )
Attachments: SHD7251K-01 VIDEQO.MP4; STATEMENT OF SHD7251E.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Qttached is a copy of our insured accident report and video footage for your easy reference. From the video, your
driver had encroached into our insured’s lane and collided onto our insured’s vehicle. We are of the view that our
insured driver is not liable for the accident.

In view of the above, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to
look into your client’s matter.

Thank you.

Note: This video footage is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You undertake to preserve its
canfidentiality and will not disclose, provide or make avallable the video footage in whole or in part, to any third

party

Best Regards,
Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@ lkkouto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 3:16 AM

To: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & |1A/Taxis/Claims) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto
Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses <BalgishBAH®@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: OUR REF:BUS/10/19/6001 - ACCIDENT ON 18/10/19 INVOLVING 5G1747K AND SHD7251E ALONG KENT
RIDGE U-TURM POINT BEF B5:18239 [ OPP NUH )



Finar Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK refl Officer in charge
CC4/11119018511/Epb3 Hsiao Tong

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards.

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone BI66-0055 | emallt shupel @ kkauto.cam | fax: 6741-4108

.II: 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

1)
2)

From: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <OngHuaYen@smrt com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 4:4% PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-a@|kk m>

Cc: Chong Fel Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FelYuan@smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto
Swves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin [Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses)
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/10/19/6001 - ACCIDENT ON 18/10/19 INVOLVING 5G1747K AND SHD7251E ALONG KENT
RIDGE U-TURN POINT BEF B5:18239 | OPP NUH )

Dear Sirs,

We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SG1747K. Your client’s
negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair 51,146.00

Loss of Use $825.00 ( 3 daysx 527500 )

Total $1,971.00

We enclose the following
documents,

1) Repair Invoice

2) GIA report

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.

Thanks & Regards
Hua Yen



Merimen e-Claims

-!-CLAIH sunFuLnEn"-[FIﬂdlﬂﬂ for Survlr Rlpﬂrﬂ-
WP

Page 1 of |

Case | Motified Est Submatted | Ad) Assigned ) Apt Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
|21 0612019 LOAI0 lge1146.00 58114600 Das g e e
Edit Ssg Eﬁﬂlﬂ]lﬂ'[ Edit Egtimabes Wisw Rpt Ellb:lfﬂl |

Raference Clmim Dwiails

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjustar] |
Tnsured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, (o Reg. ho: - 1
Myin "

e ant.  |SMAT BUSESLYD, Co. Reg. No.: 1962022920 |
Vehicle Beg, _[18/10/2002 10:00 - :59

Mo e Date of LOSS! |4y Months and 17 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man "!I'I._J
Clnim Type: | TP / MCT19100416 rasow/Cover | mcomonts

Vehicle Reg.

No. SHD7251E ooty D-19033203M78P

[Insured): -

_|Excess:

RAepairsr: SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Wooadlands) 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel! 68661628

|1anding | ndia International Tnsurance Pte Lid (MQ) - Tel: 63476100 .. [Handled by Zuhaldah Bte Samsurf - 6347 £070)

CINMTANTS | g First Capital Insurance Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 62222111

Adjustar: LK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 . [Handled by CHEN TSUE YEE] ... (Final Rpt due 31/10/2019]
Immmmumm wiew a2 |  Compose Case Mail |
+ 115G (04/11/2015): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (550.00) - 5G1747K - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Sa..,

« 111_SG (29/10/2015): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SG1747K - Claim Handier: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri
| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Saarch Tasks | Creste ew Task | Compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group  Subject Handler  Assigned By Completed On ~ Created On  Dona?

No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 26/11/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SG1747K (MCT19100416)
[SHD7251E]
TP

SMRT BUSES LTD
Oct 18 2019 10:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Videa . B [1perpage [v]| M
|We_|Finalized On [1ndia Internationsl Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print |
1 | 39/10/19 09:20 | Video - Accident (O1D) ) | toacmpq |
Photos/Images Dpergage  [V]| &
Ho | Melabel/Reorder | LKK Auts Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 |26/10/1806:45 | General View || wadve | &
3 |i610/19 0945 | General View | @y | Loadrc |
3 |26/10/1909:45 | General View 0| cdrs | B
4 |26/10/1909:45 | General View 0O =ivc | H |
5 |36/10/1909:45 | General View 0| eaws | & |
6 |26/10/1800:45 | General View 0| seaws | & |
7 |a6/10/18 05:45 | Ganeral View Q| teatre | A
8 |26/10/1909:45 | General View O save B
8 |26/10/1909:45 | Genaral View 0| waies | M
10 |26/10/19 09:45 | Genersl View 0| toadrs | A
11 |26/10/1900:45 | Ganersl View 0| beawe | M
13 |26/10/16 05:45 | General View 0 wars A
13 | I6/10/19 09:45 | General View @ | aawc | B |
14 |26/10/1909:45 | General View 0| waws | &
15 |26/10/1909:45 | General View 0B s | &
16 |26/10/18 09:45 | General View D | oedirs | A
17 |26/10/15 09:45 | Chassls Number 0 waws B
16 |26/10/19 09:45 | Odometer Reading B | weawc | B |
19 |29/10/1% 19:17 | After Repair Phote 0| waws | B
20 |20/10/19 19:17 | After Repair Photo 0| wows | B
71 |20/10/18 19:17 | After Repair Photo 0| waaws | A
72 |29/10/1919:17 | After Repair Photo 0| waaws | A
73 |29/10/15 15:17 | After Repair Photo 0| wearc | B
74 |29/10/19 19:17 | After Repair Photo 0| waws | B
25 [29/10/19 19:17 | After Repalr Phote 0| wawrs | A
36 |39/10/15 19:17 | Afer Repolr Photo 0| adws | B
27 |20/10/19 19:17 | After Repair Photo 0| basws | B4
76 |29/10/15 15:17 | After Repair Photo 0| x| B
25 |29/10/19 19:17 | After Repair Photo 0O waws | H
Documentation [iperpeee [5]) &
No |Melabel/Rearder | LEK Auta Consultants Pta Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |21/10/19 14:13 | EMAIL FROM 111 DD 21102019 [« BT

7 |21o/1914:13 | TR ESTIMATE g Load POF

3 |23/10/19 14:13 | TP GIA REPORT Lsad POF

4 |22/10/1517:20 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED 0 | L=aror

3 |osn1/1s13:14 EMAIL TO TP_REJECT dd 091119 0 | Loed PO

No_| Finalirsd On India International Insurance Pta Ltd (HGQ) Thumbnail | Print
|1 |32/10/19 08:48 | Singapore Accident Statement B | LosdroF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 26/11/2019
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Documents Checklist

| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST . gsset | Save | enm |
There are no document checkints configures

list Rem = [LE] (Ha)

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Menke: Bermaris ave Eridabe G ienn pou b i b other partes.

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 26/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreq no 1sss07158m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/1118018511/EFB30Q2

Date: 26112018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Lid  Policy Mo MCOMOO15
Claimant i
Vahiote Mo s SG1TATK Insured Vehicle Mo : SHD7251E
Date of Loss: 18/10/20189 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18100416
| TIF] 10N OF |
Reg No! SGIT4ATK
Make & Model: MAN NL320F (A22), 105D (M) Engine No: 50340642404072
Reg. Date: 01/03/2016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: WMAAZZ2ZZXNFTO02B71
Colour: Multi-colour Odomeler; 203488 km
Engine Capacily. 10518 cc
Markel Value/New Car NIA
Prica
Sum Insured (S$): Market Valua/New Car Price
NDITI F THE TI E
General Condilion; Stearing (Serviceable)! Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Madification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Slze: 275ITOR225 Rear Tyre Size: 27570 R22.5
Front Lefl Side: Firenza 5 mm Rear Left Side Firenza 5 mm
Front Right Side: Firenza 5 mm Rear Righ! Side: Firenza 5 mm
The above values megresan! Ihe reaining lyre roads depth
(COST OF CLAIMS N  Repairer's Adjuster's ~ Difference Diff %)
Parts 3.660.60 0.00 3,660.680 100.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,581.00 1,146.00 435.00 27.51
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount [S§) 5,241.60 1,146.00 4,095.60 78.14
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 2110/2018
[rate Inspected: 21110/2018 Inspected Af: SMRT Automolive Services Ple Lid
{Woodlands)
B0 Woodlands Indusirial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This report represants our indings af the ime and piace of inspechion sfafed hersin, Such mspechion has besn comed ouf fo the bes! of our
knowlsdge and abiiilty but any other lahiily under any other circumstances 8 hereby expressly swcluced.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 26/11/2019



Page 2 of 3

Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: {Last Synchronised: 25 Nov 2018)

Parts: A MAN NL3Z0F (A22) 10.5 D (M) (Model not available in database)
|Labuur: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code far SG1747K)

|Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
| numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

iFurthlr Info: ltemsivalues not In reference catalogue are preﬁ:ed with an ulariak_‘.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Pari No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *PANEL ,SIDE:R9 WITH FRAME ,FOR MAN A22 BUS Repair 710.70F ~F
2 1 *PANEL ,SIDE :R10,FOR MAN A22 BUS Repair 192.70F ~F
3 1 *PANEL ,SIDE :R11,FOR MAN A22 BUS Repair 1,782 50F ~F
4 1 *COVER :REAR TAIL LAMP ,RH ,FOR MAN A22 BUS Repair 974.70F ~-F
F=Franchisa part

Total Parts (S$)  3,660.60 0.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 26/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellanaous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Partlculars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TOREMOVE & INSTALL ALL ABOVE ITEMS AND REPAIR  New 795.00 530.00
OTHERS DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS
2  PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND New 786.00 §16.00
RESPRAY ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,581.00 1,146.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 26/11/2019



