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Celine Fonﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 June 2018 11:45 AM

To: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Check Market Value (MV) - SJZ8844Z / SBMOOLT) DOA: 22-Jun-2018
Dear Yvonne,

The market value for SJZ 88447 is $75,000.00 - $79,000.00 (est) as at Jun 2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: Sharon Kho [mailto:sharon.kho@priorityservices.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, June 27, 2018 1:32 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin@Ibs-auto.com; rta@rta.com.sg; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Subject: Check Market Value (MV) - SJZ8844Z / S8MOOLT] DOA: 22-Jun-2018

Dear all,
Please advise the prevailing market value of SJZ88447 as at 22/06/2018 ASAP.

Kindly email back to yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Best Regards,

Sharon Kho

Priority Services

Block 779 Yishun Avenue 2

#01-1545 Singapore 760779

Tel: 62934822 Fax: 62963283



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

e e R e ]

From: Sharon Kho <sharon.kho@priorityservices.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 27, 2018 1:32 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin@|bs-auto.com; rta@rta.com.sg;
motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; SUR

Cc: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Subject: Check Market Value (MV) - SJZ8844Z / S8M0OOLTJ DOA: 22-Jun-2018

Attachments: Vehicle registation certificate.pdf

Dear all,

Please advise the prevailing market value of SJZ8844Z as at 22/06/2018 ASAP.

Kindly email back to yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Best Regards,

Sharon Kho

Priority Services

Block 779 Yishun Avenue 2
#01-1545 Singapore 760779

Tel: 62934822 Fax: 62963283



| PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
L8

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

i COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeD...
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Singapore NRIC
3895D

5)Z8844Z

No

26Jun 2018

AUDI

TTRSCOUPE 25 TFSIQUATTRO
Black

2009

CEP002742
TRUZZZ8J0A1901255
250.0 kW (335 bhp)
$74,502.00

03 Apr2010

03 Apr 2010

2

$74,502.00

Yes |
02 Apr 2020 / 1

$40,976.00
2l 25\

02 Apr 2020

E - Open Category
10

$42,001.00
$6,384.00
$47,360.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Jun 2018
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