Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 3:28 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI'; assignments

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: CHECK LIABILITY FOR 3RD PARTY CLAIM ET169H AGAINST SMH4068H (LONPAC)

DOA 11/10/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022520

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 1:18 PM

To: Ivan Teo <ivanteo@honda.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CHECK LIABILITY FOR 3RD PARTY CLAIM ET169H AGAINST SMH4068H (LONPAC) DOA 11/10/2019 Our Ref:
19/19/19/VvP05/022520

Without Prejudice

Dear Ivan

Our Insured has not reported the accident.

Do you still want us to arrange survey? If so, please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.
Dear Nivitha

Pls follow up.

Regards,
Ong Li Li



Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
3

From: lvan Teo [mailto:ivanteo@honda.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 10:17 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: CHECK LIABILITY FOR 3RD PARTY CLAIM ET169H AGAINST SMH4068H (LONPAC) DOA 11/10/2019

Dear Motor Claims,
Kindly advise on 3™ party direct settlement liability.

My client : ET169H
Your insured : SMH4068H
DOA :11/10/2019

Thank you
Warmest Regards

Ivan Teo

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

255 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159937

DID : 97317842

Email: ivanteo@honda.com.sg

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.
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