Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sukyi,

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Friday, 13 December 2019 9:38 AM

‘Admin nht'

Chloe

RE: YOUR REF: SKC 7711P (OUR REF: CC4/EQI19018377/Agb3) *** ACCIDENT
INVOLVING XB 9881U & SKC 7711P ON 13/10/2019 ***

NON COVERAGE LETTER.pdf

Attached is a copy of the Non coverage letter.

We regret to inform that we are not able to look into this matter as per our principal instruction due to non-coverage.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment

on the settlement sum.”

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F 'ff{ Astih

ReERER W Spye the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 4:47 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>

Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SKC 7711P (OUR REF: CC4/EQI19018377/Aghb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING XB 9881U & SKC

7711P ON 13/10/2019 ***

Without Prejudice



