Date:
To :

Attn :
Tel;

VEHICLE NO

$9 MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD

4001, Ang Mo Klo Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 569622

18 October 2019
LKK

Steve (stevechen@lkkauto.com)

83228813

. FBMGG1A

ACCIDENT DATE: 10 October 2019
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Description
Front Mudguard X MM

Handle Bar ,~ [T
Brake Lever - (j]
Balancer [T
Crash Bar . [T
Exhaust Pipe 7~ 00 U
Front SignalRH .~ vl

Mirror (ﬂH] yaxdi

Exhaust Pipe Guard - Front / ( “7
Front LH Side Panel ¢ Y

Tel: 6452 4898 Fax: 6452 4868
Emall: 8g_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg

Honda CB400X
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Sub-Total
Less 10%
Sub-Total

By Fax: 6256-4315

Quotation $
320.00 X

150.00 /
80.00 4§/
100.00 €77
480.00 1§07
1,200.00 /
170.00 11§~
180.00 S0/
280.00 /
280.00 ¥

324000 719

32400 g7

2,916.




VEHICLE NO FBM 661A

Nett Items

1 Rearbox / cur

2 Towingfee , i

3 Remove & replace necessary parts,
align & etc

4 Putty & touch up paint work

5 Check front alignment

NB: This estimate was made from a visual
Inspection only, any other damage panis or
labour require when repair commences, we
wili advige you and submit supplementary
Item 1o you accordingly.

Kindly revert upon completion.
Thank you

SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD

LG

ultants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:
o To resurvey before/atter spray painting

o To display damaged part(s) during resurvey

o Parts prices are subject to confirmation
o Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis

. mentary item(s) must be resurveyed and
iupsm 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowiedged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

Honda CB400X

800.00 (09

50.00 J0
350.00 $0¢

280.00 00
80.00 j0

Sub-Total 1560.00 /(]
Nett Total 4,476.00

Stre CLEK) it ftjude
17/ 10011, 4-90p~
J doys

o No illegal modification(s) is atlowed L / S

HM‘M




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Sg motor enterprise Giam <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, November 25, 2019 5:12 PM

To: Sg Motor; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Attached plse find the estimate Cost of Repairs for bike FBM 661A
Attachments: IMG_4842.jpg; IMG_4839,jpg; IMG_4841.jpg; IMG_4843,jpg

Hi Steve,

RE : FBM 661A

confirm acceptance , pls proceed accordingly.
attached after repaired photo for your references.

thank you
rose
On Tuesday, 12 November 2019, 07:44:18 pm GMT+8, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <stevechen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Leena,

Kindly refer our finalize $2650 (L/S, before GST). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

And after spray photo.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor



